

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS

Date	Orig. Topic	Issues (Rev.)	Description	Hrs.	Rate	Amount	#	Amt ea issu es Issue
4/25/06	GP	GP, EM&V	Review ALJ Ruling adopting Protocols for evaluation of EE pursuant to workshops & comments in Oct. & Dec. 2005 in R0108128 (WEM commented 10-25-05)	0.50	170	\$85.00	2	\$42.50
5/9/06	GP	GP, RRIM	Attend PHC	2.00	170	\$340.00	2	\$170.00
5/26/06	GP	GP, RRIM	Review scoping memo	1.00	170	\$170.00	2	\$85.00
7/10/06	GP	Partners	Read AC Ruling re partnerships	0.25	170	\$42.50	1	\$42.50
1/4/07	GP	EM&V, Rules, Reports	Read 1-2-07 Ruling revising protocols & post 2005 evaluation EM&V & revising reporting requirements - and attached Joint Staff's reporting schedule; discuss with consultant the proposal to transfer some of ED's EM&V budget to IOUs (p. 5-6)	2.00	170	\$340.00	3	\$113.33
2/21/07	GP	EM&V, 2009-11	review 2/16/07 ALJ Notice & Staff report - make notes for 2/28 PHC & 3/16 comments	1.00	170	\$170.00	2	\$85.00
3/12/07	Comm ents	Collab, Strategies, 2006-08, Reports, EM&V, RRIM, TPPs	draft WEM comment Procedural strategy	4.50	170	\$765.00	7	\$109.29
3/16/07	Comm ents	see 3/12	draft & file WEM comment Procedural strategy	7.25	170	\$1,232.50	7	\$176.07
3/19/07	GP	see 3/12	review TURN comments on procedural strategy	1.00	170	\$170.00	7	\$24.29
3/28/07	Comm ents	EM&V, RRIM, 2004-05	tel. Cheryl Cox re EE as a resource; tel HR re 2004-05 Express Evaluation	0.25	170	\$42.50	2	\$21.25
6/17/07	Comm ents	EM&V, RRIM	review hearing transcripts (R0602013 procurement) - choose excerpts; draft Shareholders	4.25	170	\$722.50	2	\$361.25
6/18/07	Comm ents	EM&V, RRIM	Incentives comment draft & file WEM comment shareholders incentives	7.50	170	\$1,275.00	2	\$637.50

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS

7/1/07	Comm ents	Strategies, Goals, 2006-08, Potential, Collab, Attribution, Partners see 7/1	review docs, draft Reply re goals	4.50	170	\$765.00	7	\$109.29
7/2/07	Comm ents	see 7/1	draft & file WEM Reply re goals	7.00	170	\$1,190.00	7	\$170.00
7/3/07	Comm ents	see 7/1	Tel from Docket; email to ALJ Malcolm - request extension - draft & efile WEM Reply-Amendment	1.25	170	\$212.50	7	\$30.36
7/5/07	Comm ents	Collab, Strategies, Education, EM&V, RRIM, Goals, BBEES see 7/5	Review 6-21 and 5-24 rulings; draft 7/10 comments	5.00	170	\$850.00	7	\$121.43
7/9/07	Comm ents	see 7/5	draft 7/10 comments - Programs & Strategies	4.00	170	\$680.00	7	\$97.14
7/10/07	Comm ents	see 7/5	draft 7/10 comments; request extension of time for filing comments	6.25	170	\$1,062.50	7	\$151.79
7/11/07	Comm ents	see 7/5	draft & file 7/10 comments (one day late)	4.75	170	\$807.50	7	\$115.36
7/19/07	Comm ents	C&S, Collab, 2009-11, Strategies, Education, 2004-05, EM&V, RRIM, Lifecycle, Partners, TPPs, OBF, Advisory	draft WEM comment on Programs & Strategies	7.25	170	\$1,232.50	13	\$94.81
7/21/07	Comm ents	see 7/19	draft WEM comment on Programs & Strategies	8.50	170	\$1,445.00	13	\$111.15
7/22/07	Comm ents	see 7/19	file WEM comment on Programs & Strategies	0.50	170	\$85.00	13	\$6.54

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS

10/8/07	Comm ents	see 7/19	review PD & WEM filings; draft comments	4.00	170	\$680.00	13	\$52.31
10/9/07	Comm ents	see 7/19	draft & file WEM comments on PD	5.25	170	\$892.50	13	\$68.65
11/10/07	worksh op - EM&V	EM&V	review NTG residential studies posted on CALMAC; prep for workshop	3.00	170	\$510.00	1	\$510.00
11/15/07	worksh op - EM&V	EM&V	attend NTG workshop (&videotape it) 10-12, 1:30-4	5.00	170	\$850.00	1	\$850.00
11/16/07	GP	Video	Discuss legality of videotaping w/ counsel; tel Randy Wu (CPUC General Counsel)	2.50	0	\$0.00	1	\$0.00
11/28/07	EM&V	EM&V, 2004-05	Review evaluation studies 04-05 SCE HTR, 04-05 Statewide residential; etc.	3.00	170	\$510.00	2	\$255.00
12/5/07	GP	RRIM	Review responses to IOU petition to modify S.I. decision	2.25	170	\$382.50	1	\$382.50
12/24/07	GP	RRIM	review DD - S.I.; make notes	2.00	170	\$340.00	1	\$340.00
1/31/08	GP	RRIM	attend CPUC bus. Meeting re vote on D0801042 Shareholders incentives	n/a	n/a	\$0.00		
3/25/08	GP	Goals, EM&V, RRIM	read 1/24/08 and 3/25 (revised) ruling re EE goals & review referenced document (procurement OIR preliminary scoping memo)	1.25	170	\$212.50	3	\$70.83
4/1/08	EM&V	Collab, EM&V, Education, RRIM, Strategies	draft & file comments on 3/14/08 ruling	7.00	170	\$1,190.00	5	\$238.00
5/14/08	Goals	Goals	attend & participate in goals PHC 10-12:30 (videotape)	2.50	170	\$425.00	1	\$425.00
5/31/08	goals	2006-08, RRIM, EM&V	analyze quarterly reports - track progress 4thQ 07 & 1st Q 2008, read narratives	2.00	170	\$340.00	3	\$113.33
6/2/08	goals	2006-08, RRIM, EM&V, Strategies	analyze quarterly reports - create spreadsheet to track progress 4thQ 07 - focus on residential	1.50	170	\$255.00	4	\$63.75
6/9/08	Goals	Goals	attend all-party meeting	1.50	170	\$255.00	1	\$255.00

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS

6/10/08	goals	Goals, 2006-08, Rules, C&S, EM&V, RRIM, Partners, Potential, 2009-11	draft comments	8.25	170	\$1,402.50	9	\$155.83
6/11/08	goals	see 6/10	revise & file comments	1.50	170	\$255.00	9	\$28.33
3/3/09	EM&V	EM&V	review CADMUS study on market effects	2.00	175	\$350.00	1	\$350.00
3/4/09	EM&V	EM&V, Strategies	attend workshop on CFL market effects 10-1	3.00	175	\$525.00	2	\$262.50
3/17/09	EM&V	2006-08, RRIM	review ED verification report	3.00	175	\$525.00	2	\$262.50
8/1/09	UCD	UCD	Read PG&E proposal re UCD	0.50	175	\$87.50	1	\$87.50
11/18/09	GP	GP, UCD	attend PHC re UCD special deal	2.00	175	\$350.00	2	\$175.00
12/11/09	Comm ent	UCD, Partners, Collab	draft & file comment on special EE for UC Davis	4.25	175	\$743.75	3	\$247.92
12/18/09	GP	GP	read D0912022 re solar EE standalone c/e	0.50	175	\$87.50	1	\$87.50
1/24/10	GP	GP, UCD	read 1/5/10 PD re UCD	0.50	175	\$87.50	2	\$43.75
1/25/10	comment	UCD, Collab, Partners	draft & file comment on PD re UCD	2.50	175	\$437.50	3	\$145.83
1/25/10	UCD	UCD	read DRA comments on UCD ISSUE TOTALS	0.50	175	\$87.50	1	\$87.50
6/8/06	compensation		draft & file NOI	3	85	\$255.00		
4/2/10	compensation		prepare request	2	87.50	\$175.00		
4/3/10	compensation		review docs, draft request	3.75	87.50	\$328.13		
4/4/10	compensation		review timesheets, draft request	4	87.50	\$350.00		
4/5/10	compensation		review docs; draft request	6	87.50	\$525.00		
4/6/10	compensation		draft & file compensation request	7.5	87.50	\$656.25		

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS

Subtotal 2006 hours	3.75		\$637.50
Subtotal 2007 hours	103.75		\$17,212.50
Subtotal 2008 hours	25.50		\$4,335.00
Subtotal 2009 hours	15.25		\$2,668.75
Subtotal 2010 hours	3.50		\$612.50
Total regular hours	151.75		\$25,466.25
(check - total issues)			25437.93

subtotal compensation 2006	3	85.00	\$255.00
subtotal compensation 2010	23.25	87.50	\$2,034.38
Total compensation hours	26.25		\$2,289.38

Grand total request \$27,755.63

[summaries repeated: typed in, not formulas, for word file:]

Subtotal 2006 hours	3.75		637.5
Subtotal 2007 hours	103.75		17,212.50
Subtotal 2008 hours	25.5		4,335.00
Subtotal 2009 hours	15.25		2,668.75
Subtotal 2010 hours	3.5		612.5
Total regular hours	151.75		25,466.25
(check - total issues)			

subtotal compensation 2006	3		255
subtotal compensation 2010	23.25		2,034.38
Total compensation hours	26.25		2,289.38

Grand total Request 27,755.63

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS

Advisory	Attributi on	BBEES	Collab	Codes & Standar ds	Educatio n	EM&V	Funding	Goals	GP	Lifecycle
						42.50			42.50	
									170.00	
									85.00	
						113.33			42.50	
						85.00				
			109.29			109.29				
			176.07			176.07				
			24.29			24.29				
						21.25				
						361.25				
						637.50				

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS

52.31	52.31	52.31	52.31	52.31		52.31
68.65	68.65	68.65	68.65	68.65		68.65

510.00

850.00

255.00

70.83

70.83

238.00

238.00 238.00

425.00

113.33

63.75

255.00

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS

155.83

155.83

155.83

28.33

28.33
350.00

28.33

262.50

240.83

175.00

87.50

145.83

43.75

333.46 309.65 485.72 2063.14 517.62 1057.18 5287.23 0.00 1730.36 646.25 333.46

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS

OBF	Partners hips	Peak	Potential Reports	RRIM	Rules	Strategi es	TPPs	UCD	What Counts
-----	------------------	------	-------------------	------	-------	----------------	------	-----	----------------

170.00
85.00

113.33

113.33

109.29

109.29

109.29

109.29

176.07

176.07

176.07

176.07

24.29

24.29

24.29

24.29

21.25

361.25

637.50

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS

109.29

109.29

109.29

170.00

170.00

170.00

30.36

30.36

30.36

121.43

121.43

97.14

97.14

151.79

151.79

115.36

115.36

94.81 94.81

94.81

94.81 94.81

111.15 111.15

111.15

111.15 111.15

6.54 6.54

6.54

6.54 6.54

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS

52.31	52.31	52.31	52.31	52.31
68.65	68.65	68.65	68.65	68.65

382.50

340.00

70.83

238.00

238.00

113.33

63.75

63.75

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS

155.83 155.83 155.83 155.83

28.33 28.33 28.33

262.50

262.50

240.83

87.50
175.00
240.83

145.83

43.75
145.83

333.46 1213.93 0.00 493.81 422.98 4030.57 297.49 2002.73 643.11 780.41 0.00

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS

2004-05 2006-08 2009-11 Total all

85.00

109.29

176.07

24.29

21.25

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS
109.29

170.00

30.36

94.81

94.81

111.15

111.15

6.54

6.54

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS

52.31

52.31

68.65

68.65

255.00

113.33

63.75

ATTACHMENT 2 - BARBARA GEORGE TIMESHEETS - R0604010 - ALL YEARS
155.83 155.83

28.33 28.33

262.50

609.71 1243.04 602.62 25437.93

