
From: Peevey, Michael R.
Sent: 8/6/2011 3:22:14 AM

RedactedTo:
Cc:
Bcc:
Subject: Re: Bruce Foster dinner 

Sure. But, now on holiday. Will give to him night of dinner.

----Original Message-----
From: Joaquin, Bernadette f mailto:BJL7@pge.eoml 
Sent: Friday, August 05, 2011 04:25 PM 
To: Peevey, Michael R.
Cc: Cherry, Brian K <BKC7@pge.com>
Subject: Bruce Foster dinner

Mr. Peevey - can you please have a $150 check issued payable to PG&E and mail it to Brian. He will send you a 
letter acknowledging your check. We will copy SCE and Sempra.

Thank you. 
Bernadette

----Original Message----
From: Peevey, Michael R. f mailto:miehael.peevev@epue.ea.govl 
Sent: Friday, August 05, 2011 9:52 AM 
To:. Redacted 
Subject: Foster dinner

Please bill me $150.
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