

| | Tam Hunt | | | | Ted Ko | | | | Sahm White | | | | Craig Lewis | | | | | | |
|---|----------|----------|---------------------------|-------------|---|----------|----------|------------|------------|---|----------------------------------|-------|-------------|-------------|--|----------|-----|----------|------------|
| <i>CREST reform (R 11-05-005)</i> | | | | | <i>CREST reform (R 11-05-005)</i> | | | | | <i>CREST reform (R 11-05-005)</i> | | | | | <i>CREST reform (R 11-05-005)</i> | | | | |
| Draft CREST netion | 8/1/20 | 2.5 | \$330.00 | \$825.00 | Preparing Mitior for CREST Refor | 8/5/20 | 1.5 | \$175.00 | \$262.50 | Weekly policy c discussing CREST reform efforts | August, Sept, Oct, 20 | 16 | \$270.00 | \$4,320.00 | Review draft CREST netion | 8/10/20 | 2 | \$185.00 | \$370.00 |
| Draft CREST netion | 8/8/20 | 2.25 | \$330.00 | \$742.50 | Preparing Mitior for CREST Refor | 8/8/20 | 2 | \$175.00 | \$350.00 | | 2011 tot | 16 | \$270.00 | \$4,320.00 | Review draft CREST netion | 8/15/20 | 1.5 | \$185.00 | \$277.50 |
| Discuss CREST netion with internal team | 8/11/20 | 1 | \$330.00 | \$330.00 | Preparing Mitior for CREST Refor | 8/10/20 | 0.5 | \$175.00 | \$87.50 | | | | | | Internal plans for potential CREST compromise | 9/19/20 | 1 | \$185.00 | \$185.00 |
| Draft CREST netion and discuss with internal team | 8/12/20 | 1.75 | \$330.00 | \$577.50 | Preparing Mitior for CREST Refor | 8/12/20 | 2.5 | \$175.00 | \$437.50 | | | | | | Draft proposed criteria for CREST compromise | 9/30/20 | 2 | \$185.00 | \$370.00 |
| Draft and submit CREST netion | 8/16/20 | 1.5 | \$330.00 | \$495.00 | Preparing Mitior for CREST Refor | 8/15/20 | 2 | \$175.00 | \$350.00 | <i>RAM program (R 08-08-009)</i> | | | | | Review draft CREST compromise w Sunlight Partner | 10/3/20 | 1.5 | \$185.00 | \$277.50 |
| Develop CREST compromise with SCE | 9/19/20 | 1.5 | \$330.00 | \$495.00 | Preparing Mitior for CREST Refor | 8/16/20 | 1.25 | \$175.00 | \$218.75 | planning meeting | 9/7/20 | 1.5 | \$250.00 | \$375.00 | Discuss CREST compromise w SCE | 10/4/20 | 1 | \$185.00 | \$185.00 |
| Develop CREST compromise with SCE | 9/29/20 | 2 | \$330.00 | \$660.00 | Developing CREST Compromise with SCE | 9/19/20 | 1.5 | \$175.00 | \$262.50 | position research | 9/9/20 | 5.25 | \$250.00 | \$1,312.50 | Discuss CREST compromise w SCE | 10/6/20 | 1 | \$185.00 | \$185.00 |
| Draft opening comments on CREST netion PD (R 11-05) | 10/28/2 | 2.5 | \$330.00 | \$825.00 | Developing CREST Compromise with SCE | 9/29/20 | 2 | \$175.00 | \$350.00 | comment research | 9/20/20 | 6.25 | \$250.00 | \$1,562.50 | Review CREST compromise materials from SCE et al an provide response | 10/7/20 | 2 | \$185.00 | \$370.00 |
| Ex parte with Commissioners on CREST PD | 11/3/20 | 1.75 | \$330.00 | \$577.50 | Draft Comments on CREST PD | 10/31/2 | 0.75 | \$175.00 | \$131.25 | comment research & rough draft | 9/22/20 | 5 | \$250.00 | \$1,250.00 | | 2011 tot | 12 | \$185.00 | \$2,220.00 |
| Draft reply comments on CREST netion PD (R 11-05) | 11/6/20 | 2.5 | \$330.00 | \$825.00 | Ex parte with Commissioners on CREST PD | 11/3/20 | 1.75 | \$175.00 | \$306.25 | comment rough draft | 9/23/20 | 9 | \$250.00 | \$2,250.00 | <i>RAM program (R 08-08-009)</i> | | | | |
| Prepare comp request | 12/26/2 | 3.5 | \$330.00 | \$1,155.00 | Draft CREST PD reply comments | 11/4/20 | 1.25 | \$175.00 | \$218.75 | comment draft | 9/24/20 | 8.75 | \$250.00 | \$2,187.50 | Review draft CREST compromise | 9/27/20 | 2.5 | \$175.00 | \$437.50 |
| | 2011 tot | 22.75 | \$330.00 | \$7,507.50 | Bit CREST PD reply comments | 11/6/20 | 0.5 | \$175.00 | \$87.50 | comment final d review and summary of part comments | 9/27/20 | 5 | \$250.00 | \$1,250.00 | Reply comments | 10/3/20 | 1.5 | \$175.00 | \$262.50 |
| <i>RAM program (R 08-08-009)</i> | | | | | | 2011 tot | 17.5 | \$175.00 | \$3,062.50 | | 9/28/20 | 7 | \$250.00 | \$1,750.00 | | 2010 tot | 4 | | \$700.00 |
| Draft RAM PD opening comments | 9/21/20 | 5.5 | \$315.00 | \$1,732.50 | <i>RAM program (R 08-08-009)</i> | | | | | | 2010 tot | 47.75 | \$250.00 | \$11,937.50 | total comp requ for Craig Lew | 12 | | | |
| Revised RAM PD opening comments | 9/23/20 | 2.25 | \$315.00 | \$708.75 | Collaboration w RAM parties or comments | 9/1/20 | 1.5 | \$165.00 | \$247.50 | Draft comments & RAM advice lett | 3/14/20 | 5.5 | \$270.00 | \$1,485.00 | | | | | |
| Revised RAM PD opening comments | 9/24/20 | 2 | \$315.00 | \$630.00 | Collaboration w RAM parties or comments | 9/10/20 | 0.75 | \$165.00 | \$123.75 | Draft comments & RAM advice lett | 3/16/20 | 6 | \$270.00 | \$1,620.00 | | | | | |
| Revised RAM PD opening comments | 9/26/20 | 1.5 | \$315.00 | \$472.50 | Collaboration w RAM parties or comments | 9/16/20 | 1 | \$165.00 | \$165.00 | | 2011 tot | 11.5 | \$270.00 | \$3,105.00 | | | | | |
| Revised and fill RAM PD opening comments | 9/27/20 | 1.5 | \$315.00 | \$472.50 | RAM comments | 9/27/20 | 3.5 | \$165.00 | \$577.50 | | 2011 total Sahm White | 27.5 | \$270.00 | \$7,425.00 | | | | | |
| Draft and file PD reply comments | 10/5/20 | 5.5 | \$315.00 | \$1,732.50 | RAM Reply comments | 10/1/20 | 2 | \$165.00 | \$330.00 | | Total comp request for Sah White | 75.25 | | \$19,362.50 | | | | | |
| | 2010 tot | 18.25 | \$315.00 | \$5,748.75 | RAM Reply comments | 10/4/20 | 3.25 | \$165.00 | \$536.25 | | | | | | | | | | |
| Draft comments RAM advice lett | 3/1/20 | 3.5 | \$330.00 | \$1,155.00 | RAM Reply comments | 10/6/20 | 0.5 | \$165.00 | \$82.50 | | | | | | | | | | |
| Draft comments RAM advice lett | 3/7/20 | 3.75 | \$330.00 | \$1,237.50 | RAM Reply comments | 10/6/20 | 0.5 | \$165.00 | \$82.50 | | | | | | | | | | |
| Draft comments RAM advice lett | 3/10/20 | 2.25 | \$330.00 | \$742.50 | RAM Reply comments | 2010 tot | 9.75 | \$165.00 | \$1,608.75 | | | | | | | | | | |
| Draft comments RAM advice lett | 3/17/20 | 3.25 | \$330.00 | \$1,072.50 | RAM Advice Lett comments | 3/16/20 | 1.25 | \$175.00 | \$218.75 | | | | | | | | | | |
| | 2011 tot | 12.75 | \$330.00 | \$4,207.50 | | 2011 tot | 1.25 | \$175.00 | \$218.75 | | | | | | | | | | |
| 2011 total hours | 35.5 | \$330.00 | \$11,715.00 | | Ko | 18.75 | \$175.00 | \$3,281.25 | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Prepare comp request | 12/29/2 | 9.75 | \$175.00 | \$1,706.25 | Total comp requ for Ted Ko | 28.5 | | \$4,890.00 | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | Total comp request for Hu | \$19,170.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |