

Summary of Merits Time by Individual 2011

Attorney	Time	Rate	Billable Amount
Melissa Kasnitz	21	\$ 420.00	\$8,820.00
Paralegal	5.5	\$ 110.00	\$605.00
Rebecca Williford	0.8	\$ 160.00	\$128.00
	27.3		\$9,553.00

Chronological Details of Merit Time 2011

Attorney	Date	Issue	Description	Time	Rate	Billable Amount
Melissa Kasnitz	3/2/2011	GenParticipation	Receive and review DRA conditional protest to advice letter re TEAF funds (AL 3189-G/3803-E)	0.20	\$420.00	\$84.00
Melissa Kasnitz	3/2/2011	Sempra	Review material for quarterly settlement meeting	0.20	\$420.00	\$84.00
Melissa Kasnitz	3/7/2011	Sempra	Review email exchange with K. Watts-Zaghe (DRA) and G. Healy re: DRA questions regarding Sempra settlement	2.00	\$420.00	\$840.00
Melissa Kasnitz	3/16/2011	GenParticipation	Email exchange with DRA and consumers re new report and Phase 2	0.20	\$420.00	\$84.00
Melissa Kasnitz	3/17/2011	GenParticipation	Review DRA disconnection report; notes re same	0.40	\$420.00	\$168.00
Melissa Kasnitz	3/17/2011	GenParticipation	Consumer call re DRA report and next steps	0.50	\$420.00	\$210.00
Melissa Kasnitz	3/25/2011	GenParticipation	Brief review of monthly utility reports	0.20	\$420.00	\$84.00
Melissa Kasnitz	4/18/2011	Sempra	Email exchange with Gregory Healy (Sempra) re outreach on braille bills as required by Sempra settlement	0.20	\$420.00	\$84.00

Melissa Kasnitz	4/20/2011	GenParticipation	Brief review of ALJ ruling and Phase 2 issues	0.20	\$420.00	\$84.00
Melissa Kasnitz	4/28/2011	GenParticipation	Email exchange setting consumer call	0.20	\$420.00	\$84.00
Melissa Kasnitz	4/28/2011	GenParticipation	Review monthly utility reports	0.20	\$420.00	\$84.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/5/2011	Consumer	Consumer call re coordinating Phase 2 comments	1.00	\$420.00	\$420.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/5/2011	Consumer	Review ALJ ruling and notes re same in preparation for Phase 2 comments	0.50	\$420.00	\$210.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/9/2011	Sempra	Email exchange setting quarterly Sempra phone meeting	0.20	\$420.00	\$84.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/11/2011	Consumer	Review outline from NCLC re joint comments	0.20	\$420.00	\$84.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/11/2011	Consumer	Review Greenlining outline of issues	0.20	\$420.00	\$84.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/11/2011	Disability	Draft outline of Phase 2 issues relevant to Disability; email exchange with consumers re same and issues identified by consumer groups	1.20	\$420.00	\$504.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/11/2011	GenParticipation	Review TEAF filings (in compliance with resolution G-3444)	0.20	\$420.00	\$84.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/13/2011	Sempra	Email confirming time for Sempra settlement call	0.10	\$420.00	\$42.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/16/2011	Sempra	Review DRA outline re: Phase 2 comments	0.20	\$420.00	\$84.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/20/2011	Disability	Draft Phase 2 comments; email exchange with consumers re coordination of same	3.50	\$420.00	\$1,470.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/20/2011	GenParticipation	Brief review of party comments	1.00	\$420.00	\$420.00
Paralegal	5/20/2011	Disability	Finalize comments and attachment	1.50	\$110.00	\$165.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/24/2011	GenParticipation	Detailed review of opening comments and notes for reply	1.80	\$420.00	\$756.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/25/2011	GenParticipation	Brief review of utility reports	0.30	\$420.00	\$126.00

Melissa Kasnitz	5/27/2011	Consumer	Teleconference with N. Suetake (TURN) re coordination of reply comments and protection for vulnerable consumers	0.30	\$420.00	\$126.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/30/2011	Disability	Draft reply comments	2.20	\$420.00	\$924.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/31/2011	Disability	Review cites from paralegal; finalize reply comments	0.80	\$420.00	\$336.00
Melissa Kasnitz	5/31/2011	GenParticipation	Review reply comments	0.50	\$420.00	\$210.00
Paralegal	5/31/2011	Disability	Cite check comments; insert citations as footnotes; finalize	4.00	\$110.00	\$440.00
Melissa Kasnitz	6/1/2011	Sempra	Email exchange with consumers re implementation of benchmark requirements in Sempra settlement	0.20	\$420.00	\$84.00
Melissa Kasnitz	6/21/2011	Sempra	Review Sempra PP7 presentations in advance of quarterly phone meeting	0.20	\$420.00	\$84.00
Melissa Kasnitz	6/22/2011	Disability	Email exchange with D. Wong (NCLC) re prepaid energy service and vulnerable customer protections; review material re same	0.50	\$420.00	\$210.00
Melissa Kasnitz	6/22/2011	Sempra	Attend status call re Sempra settlement and implementation	1.40	\$420.00	\$588.00
Rebecca Williford	7/21/2011	Disability	Determine participation in Greg Healy's pre paid meeting request	0.30	\$160.00	\$48.00
Rebecca Williford	8/17/2011	GenParticipation	Review scoping ruling	0.20	\$160.00	\$ 32.00
Rebecca Williford	9/20/2011	Sempra	Email exchange re: agreement to add CforAT as party	0.10	\$160.00	\$16.00
Rebecca Williford	9/22/2011	Sempra	Review, sign, and return letter agreeing to add CforAT to settlement agreement	0.20	\$160.00	\$32.00
				27.30		\$9,553.00