

Attachment B

Allocation of Time by Issue

In the foregoing time sheets, the attorney's worked on a number of specific issues as well as on general issues, identified below with a number code.

The identification of each issue within the scope of the proceeding is discussed for each issues in section II.B, above and in the attached attorney time records. Shana Lazerow estimates approximately the following allocation of total resource time (attorney and witness) by issue in this proceeding:

Issues Areas (with letter code) % of time

A. Track I Settlement: Advocacy and Analysis to support contention that Record Does Not Support a Need for Additional Procurement of Gas-Fired Power Plants (includes time spent advocating around modeling, local capacity area needs, and values placed on renewables, energy efficiency and demand response.)	30%
B. Track II SCE Bundled Plan: Analysis and advocacy concerning renewables integration products, use of standard planning assumptions (excludes time spent advocating for consideration of CHP & new RECs procurement rules.)	42%
C. Track III Rules: Analysis and advocacy regarding OTC contracting and CAISO auction.	3%
D. General	25%

Attachment C

Time Recording for Communities for a Better Environment Attorney's & Experts

Hours of Shana Lazerow, Staff Attorney in 2010

Date	Description	A	B	C	D	Total
7/22/10	teleconfer w R Cox (Pacific Env't) re LTPP				0.2	.2
7/26/10	review docs filed to date				0.3	.3
8/4/10	discuss intervention, compensation, substantive issues in LTPP w W Rostov (Sierra Club CA)				0.4	.4
8/13/10	draft motion to intervene (2.6)				2.6	2.6
8/16/10	finalize, file & serve motion for party status				2.5	2.5
8/16/10	review docs re OTC in South Coast area			0.3		.3
9/21/10	discuss w A Bloch (.1); review materials, draft cmts re renewables integration (3.7)	3.7			0.1	3.8
9/23/10	draft reply cmts re renewables integration models	3				3
9/27/10	review docs filed (.3)				0.3	.3
10/1/10	review change to deadlines, implications				0.1	.1
10/7/10	discuss RIM cmts w J May	0.2				.2
10/13/10	review recent info re solar pricing	0.3				.3
10/18/10	review info re Friday RIM workshop	0.7				.7
10/22/10	participate in RIM workshop at PUC 11-12; 1-3:55; discuss w allies/co-counsel 1	5				5
10/26/10	discuss renewables integration w S Newman	0.2				.2
10/28/10	review info re ltp parties call (.2); call re solar model (1.5)	1.7				1.7
11/11/10	discuss w D Behles (Pacific Env't)				0.2	.2
11/22/10	rev cmts re RIM	0.1				.1
11/29/10	review docs for 11/30 workshop; describe technical needs for SoCal program	1.4				1.4
11/30/10	participate in RIM workshop 10:30-4	5.5				5.5
	Issue Areas	A	B	C	D	Total
	Total Hours for Shana Lazerow, Staff Attorney in 2010	21.8		.3	6.7	28.8

Hours of Shana Lazerow, Staff Attorney in 2011

Date	Description	A	B	C	D	Total
1/12/11	workshop on bundled procurement		1.8			1.8
1/24/11	discuss w J May		0.3			.3
2/10/11	prep for & meet w allies				4.8	4.8

2/23/11	review Allen scoping memo/scheduling order & PHC stmts from various parties				0.7	.7
2/28/11	participate in prehearing conference (1:30-4); discuss w allies (.5);				3	3
3/9/11	review docs 2:20-5:10				2.9	2.9
3/10/11	e-mail re expert / technical advice, discuss w A Lee (.3) review new ruling re scheduling (.2); discuss w D Behles (1); review RPS materials (.4)	.4			1.5	1.9
3/14/11	compile information 3-3:25				0.5	.5
3/30/11	review SCE bundled plan & participate in workshop		4.5			4.5
3/31/11	discuss bundled plan w J May		0.8			.8
4/6/11	meet w J May		0.5			.5
4/7/11	prepare for & meet w J May re bundled & system plans		2.4			2.4
4/12/11	t/c w J May re bundled plan (.2)		0.2			.2
4/13/11	e-mail SCE re NDA (.1); review bundled plan materials (1.7)		1.7		0.1	1.8
4/14/11	review, execute NDA				0.3	.3
4/14/11	research issues re bundled plan SCE		0.3			.3
4/19/11	review materials for bundled plan comments		4.4			4.4
4/25/11	research for comments		2.8			2.8
4/26/11	research, draft cmts re bundled plan		2.3			2.3
4/27/11	review materials re renewable energy law, bundled plans		1.5			1.5
4/27/11	discuss motion, expert bundled comments w J May		1.2			1.2
5/2/11	review ruling denying PE motion re SBx;				0.3	.3
5/2/11	e-mail allies re strategy around RPS		0.2			.2
5/2/11	discuss strategy w D Behles		0.6			.6
5/3/11	review materials (2.5); meet w J May (.6); call W Rostov (.5); discuss testimony w J May (.8); review draft testimony (.5)		4.9			4.9
5/4/11	review final testimony 6.5; discuss strategy w D Behles .4		6.5		0.4	6.9
5/5/11	discuss testimony, bundled plan w DRA		0.2			.2
5/5/11	discuss testimony, bundled plan w J May		0.2			.2
5/9/11	review bundled plan testimony		2			2
5/13/11	meet w all co-counsel re exhibit list, evidentiary hearings		0.8			.8
5/16/11	discuss hearings, motion practices w D Behles (.3); review requests for evidentiary hearings (.2)				0.5	.5
5/16/11	review exhibit list for Track II bundled plans		0.2			.2
5/20/11	review motions				0.4	.4
5/24/11	participate in motion practice at PUC				3	3
6/1/11	review new ruling by ALJ re scheduling, communicate w J May				2	2
6/29/11	review opening briefs, outline Track II reply brief		2.3			2.3
6/30/11	review opening briefs, draft, finalize & file reply brief		3.7			3.7

8/10/11	prepare for evidentiary hearings	1				1
8/10/11	discuss w B Gallegos				0.4	.4
8/11/11	evidentiary hearings -- procedural matters	1.2		1.2		2.4
8/11/11	review docs for evidentiary hearings	1		1		2
8/15/11	review docs for evidentiary hearings	0.7				.7
8/15/11	attend evidentiary hearings (1.3); discuss w allies (.6)	1.9				1.9
8/16/11	attend evidentiary hearings	4		0.5		4.5
8/17/11	review e-mail re testimony, ISO docs				0.3	.3
11/17/11	t/c w L J Reid (.1); review PD re Track II (.5)		0.6			.6
11/29/11	review, draft comments on Track II PD 11-1		2			2
11/30/11	draft comments on PD re Track II		5.2			5.2
	Issue Areas	A	B	C	D	Total
	Total Hours for Shana Lazerow, Staff Attorney in 2011	10.2	54.1	2.7	21.1	88.1

Hours of Shana Lazerow, Staff Attorney in 2012

Date	Description	A	B	C	D	TOTAL
1/10/12	teleconfer w W Rostov (.3); review, revise press release (.5)				0.8	.8
1/12/12	review Track II decision outcome, forward press release		0.2			.2
1/19/12	discuss LTPP ruling w D Behles				0.2	.2
2/22/12	review PD re long term plans, rules 3:30-4	0.3		0.2		.5
3/21/12	review docs for all party meeting (.3); t/c w R Cox, D Behles re all party meeting (.5)	0.4		0.4		.8
3/22/12	discuss All Party Meeting w W Rostov				.2	.2
3/22/12	prepare for, rsvp for All Party Meeting 11:55-12:40				0.8	.8
3/26/12	all party meeting at PUC (2.4) meet w allies (.8)				3.2	3.2
3/29/12	prepare for ex parte/e-mail co-counsel				.2	.2
4/3/12	prepare for, meet w M Tisdale (ex parte Florio) & co-counsel re Track I & III PD	2		.3		2.3
4/9/12	review revised proposed decision				.2	.2
	Issue Areas	A	B	C	D	Total
	Total Hours for Shana Lazerow, Staff Attorney in 2012	2.7	.2	.9	5.6	9.4

Hours of Julia May, Senior Staff Scientist, in 2011

Date	Description	A	B	C	D	Total
1/24/11	discuss LTPP w S Lazerow				0.3	.3
3/31/11	Discuss LTPP with S Lazerow				0.8	.8
4/1/11	Review Scoping Memo and related docs				2.8	2.8
4/4/11	Review Scoping Memo and LTPP-related docs				3.5	3.5
4/5/11	Review Scoping Memo and LTPP-related docs				4.8	4.8
4/6/11	Discuss LTPP (bundled plans) with S Lazerow (.5); review docs (.3)		0.8			.8
4/7/11	Prepare for & meet with S Lazerow		3.5			3.5
4/15/11	Begin comments on bundled plan		5.2			5.2
4/18/11	Review RPS & other docs and proceedings as they relate to comments		5.8			5.8
4/20/11	Review CEC documents for comments re bundled plans		1.1			1.1
4/25/11	Review documents re: DG and renewables for comments re bundled plans		6.6			6.6
4/26/11	Review information re energy storage for bundled plans comments		3.8			3.8
4/27/11	Review information re energy storage, SC Edison compliance with PUC Standard Planning Assumptions; RECs (4); Discuss w S Lazerow (1.2)		5.2			5.2
4/28/11	Review information re demand response and EE for bundled plan comments		3.4			3.4
5/3/11	draft comments on bundled plan (3.7); discuss w S Lazerow (1.4)		3.7		1.4	5.1
5/4/11	Finalize comments re LTPP comments		4.5			4.5
5/5/11	Review party filings re bundled plans (2.4) discuss options for responsive testimony/briefing w S Lazerow (.2)		2.6			2.6
	Issue Areas	A	B	C	D	Total
	Total hours for Julia May, Senior Staff Scientist, in 2011		46.2		13.6	59.8

Intervenor Compensation Hours for Shana Lazerow, Staff Attorney

Date	Description	Total
8/13/10	Draft NOI	1
4/11/12	review docs for fee motion	0.2
6/11/12	draft fee request	1.4
6/12/12	compensation requestion 3:05-5:15	2.2
6/13/12	revise compensation claim supporting docs 8:10-8:45	0.6

6/15/12	finalize compensation claim	2.3
	Total intervenor comp prep hours for S Lazerow	7.7

Intervenor Compensation Hours for Joel Tadmor, Law Student

Date	Description	Total
5/2/2012	prepare compensation request regarding Track I & III decision	5
3/20/2012	prepare compensation request regarding Track II, general	1.6
3/21/2012	prepare compensation request regarding Track II, general	3.4
	Total intervenor comp prep hours for J Tadmor	10