

RORY COX'S HOURS

Need/Issue, the Track Analysis
 Loading order compliance
 Procurement oversight and transparency
 Procurement of new products and fuel
 Coordination, Meetings, Hearings
 General work on proceeding

Number 1
 Number 2
 Number 3
 Number 4
 Number 5
 Number 6

Issues 11

Tracks 1 and 111	Date	Task	Time (in hours)	Issue
	25 May 10	Review OIR regarding 3 track planning process, specifics regarding each track.	1	6
	2 Jun 10	Research and review for Comments to Scoping memo. Researched projected planning reserve margin, differences between 111 Workshop at CPUC on procurement rulebook. Workshop discussed, among other things, rules regarding a distributed generation Research and review of other party comments on rulebook. Research of planning standards and renewable integration strategies	2	1
	11 Jun 10	Prehearing Conference - Reviewed and explained differences between the 3 tracks of the proceeding	5	3
	13 Jun 10	Workshop on Renewables, presentations regarding grid sensitivity to the addition of renewable energy and discussions on how Read and analyzed different renewable integration scenarios proposed by Commission staff.	2	3
	14 Jun 10	Research and drafted initial comments to renewable standards, including analysis of the benefits of a High Distributed Generation and drafted initial comments regarding the cost of transmission and energy storage.	4	6
	18 Jun 10	Researched and drafted initial comments regarding upgrading of fossil fuel plants, shut down of once through cooling power	7	1
	21 Jun 10	CPUC workshop regarding modeling, reserve margins, integrations case studies, the impact of cloud cover, natural gas costs.	6	1
	1 Jul	Assisted in developing the RIO, or Renewable Integration Order as a prioritized loading order for renewable integration	6	1
	5 Jul	Review of other parties' comments, looking for points of agreement with the principles of the RIO, and concerns about improving other parties' reply comments on renewable integration.	6	1
	6 Jul	CPUC workshop on renewable integration, including presentation from Vote Solar consultant.	6	1
	Aug. 25, 2010	CPUC pre hearing conference. Newly assigned ALJ reviewed briefing schedule, took comments and questions from parties.	3	1
	Sep. 20, 2010	Review, edit and make additions to attorney comments regarding IBLN study and CAISO and utility renewable integration plan	5	1
	Sep. 23, 2010	Meeting with FIT Coalition to coordinate comments on renewable integration models	1	5
	Oct. 6, 2010	Organized and facilitated meeting to coordinate comments and approaches between Pacific Environment, Sierra Club/Clean	4	5
	Nov. 30, 2010	Review of parties' Pre hearing Conference statements.	1	6
	Dec. 20, 2010	Pre hearing conference regarding Track 1 and other issues.	2.5	1
	Jan. 7, 2011	Review of ALJ ruling regarding scheduling and consultation with attorney	0.5	6
	Jan. 13, 2011	Meetings with consultant Bill Powers and Judith Sanders of CAISO. Review testimony on risk management and electronic auction	2	1
	Feb. 10, 2011	Coordinate and set up meeting with CPUC energy staff to discuss all facets of the LTPP, focusing on integration models; Set up	3	5
	Feb. 28, 2011	Review CAISO Renewable Integration model.	1	1
	Feb. 28, 2011	Meet with Rebecca Tsel Wei Lee, other Energy Division staff at CPUC Energy Division to discuss distributed generation as peak	1.5	5
	Mar. 10, 2011	Conference call with PG&E to discuss renewable integration needs	1	5
	Apr. 20, 2011	Research and analyze data on Helms pumping units as illustration of energy storage used for renewables integration. Data as	2	1
	2 May 11	May 23 and 24, 2011 Hearings at CPUC	4	5
	2 May 11	Draft testimony for expert Linda Sheehan from California Coastkeeper Alliance regarding OTC power plants. Confer with Shee	2	3
	11 May 11	Review and make comments regarding CAISO testimony on Renewable integration modeling.	2	1
	13 May 11	Track 1 workshop, regarding rate recovery for GHG products, alignment of state incentives and targets, and other issues.	3	1
	20 May 11	Meeting with DRA, Sierra Club, CBE, TURN to share information and discuss common goals. Topics included integration sena	2	5
	30 Jun 11	Attorney meeting with GGU to discuss issues to be covered in comments to Track 1 opening brief.	1	1
	8 Jul 11	Draft testimony on SCE's Track 1 request for generation for local capacity requirements. Research electricity needs and local	8	1

28 Jul 11	Settlement agreement conference call, initiated by PG&E.1	1	1
2 Aug 11	Edits comments and additions to testimony drafted by attorneys on CAISO modeling, Track 3 issues, and SDG&E Track 1 plans	4	1
2 Aug 11	Settlement conference with PG&E, other parties, to discuss language of agreement on integration needs, generation.1	4	1
3 Aug 11	Review settlement1	1	1
3 Aug 11	More revisions to Track 3 issues, SCE and SDG&E Track 1 plans. Research local capacity needs for SCE and SDG&E territories.1	3	3
Aug 14, 20111	--Conference call with ALU re: Settlement1	0.5	1
Aug 8, 20111	Meet with GGU, conference call on hearings. Delegate tasks, discuss evidentiary hearing strategy.1	1	6
Aug 8, 20111	Answer SCE data requests regarding experience and qualifications as expert witness.1	4	6
Aug 10, 20111	Prepare for Hearing.1 Review SCE's plan for a "centralized forward capacity market," new generation market mechanisms, bid	3.5	1
Aug 12, 20111	Prepare for Hearing.1 Review utility owned generation versus power purchase agreements, procurement review groups fledg	3.5	1
Aug 15, 20111	Evidentiary hearings, tracks 1 and 111	3	5
Aug 16, 20111	Evidentiary hearings, tracks 1 and 1111	6	5
Aug 19, 20111	Evidentiary hearing, tracks 1 and 1111	2	5
Aug 30, 20111	Evidentiary hearing, tracks 1 and 1111	2	5
Aug 30, 20111	Meeting and debrief with legal team regarding hearings, next steps	1	6
Sep 13, 20111	Track 1 and 111 brief--Draft OTC, Bidding evaluation sections.1	3	3
Sep 19 & 20, 20111	Review & analyze IOU Briefs, prepare for responses.1	6	6
Sep 20, 20111	Meet with legal team to discuss reply to Track 1 and 111 briefs.1	1	5
Oct 11, 20111	Meeting with GGU to discuss replies, strategy for remaining of proceeding.--1	1	5
Feb 23, 20121	Review Track 1 and 111 proposed decision, create summary table of results.1	5	6
6 Mar 12	Review and comment on draft comments from legal team, which focused on GHG products and hiring of independent evalua	1	3
20 Mar 12	Meeting with GGU and Communities for a Better Environment to discuss consolidated approaches and joint ex parte meeting	1	5
26 Mar 12	All Party meeting called by Cmr. Florio to discuss Track 1 and 111 proposed decision. Meeting with legal team, Sierra Club and 1	3	5
Track 11 Hours			
Jan 12, 2011	Utility tutorial on Track 1 & Track 2 plans. Utility presentations outlining their short and long term needs, as well as some poli	2	6
Mar 29, 20111	Team meeting with GGU attorneys to discuss data requests to PG&E regarding planning assumptions, RPS compliance, dema	1	1
Mar 29, 20111	Team meeting with GGU attorneys to review PG&E's bundled procurement plan, in particular requested procedure changes.1	0.75	3
Mar 31, 20111	PG&E workshop regarding Track 11 plans, processes, products and strategies.1	1	3
Apr 12, 20111	Team meeting with GGU attorneys to discuss PG&E's responses to data requests	0.5	3
Apr 18, 20111	Research and analyze PG&E natural gas supply plans and natural gas markets as relevant to PG&E's Track 11 requests.1	2	4
Apr 19, 20111	Meet with GGU regarding gas supply plans and advice letter process; review fuel supply section of PG&E's Bundled Plan.1	2	4
Apr 21, 20111	Continue to review Gas supply plan and natural gas markets. Meet with Division of Ratepayer Advocates to discuss Track 11, in	2	4
Apr 22, 20111	Draft testimony regarding NG fuel supply. Research proposed Jordan Cove natural gas export project in Oregon.1	3	4
Apr 28, 20111	Draft testimony regarding NG fuel supply. Research global price trends for LNG and how its export could impact PG&E's ratepa	3	4
1 May 11	Review testimony as delivered by GGU for PG&E bundled plan.1	3	4
16 May 11	Reviewed and analyzed testimony for Track 11.1	1	6
16 May 11	Respond to PG&E data request, including updated CV and providing information describing my qualifications to offer testimo	2	6
June 3 and 6, 20111	Write brief regarding NG supply. Researched natural gas price volatility, natural gas demand and projections, and the impacts of th	5	4
16 Jun 11	Edit brief and make additions to Track 11 Brief. Contribute to sections on fuel supply and adherence to the loading order.1	4	4
24 Jun 11	Researched biomethane contracts and wrote biomethane section of Reply comments.1	4	4
29 Jun 11	Meet with GGU and finalize Track 2 Reply brief. Discussed addition of advice letters regarding nuclear fuel plan to the brief.1	2	4
29 Jun 11	Meet with GGU and finalize Track 2 Reply brief. Discussed addition of advice letters regarding nuclear fuel plan to the brief.1	1.5	4

Total hours

217.75

DEBORAH BEHLES' HOURS

Issues 1	Number 1	Need issue, the iTrack analysis including renewable integration modeling work
	Number 2	Loading order compliance
	Number 3	Procurement oversight and transparency
	Number 4	Procurement of new products and fuel
	Number 5	Coordination, Meetings, Hearings
	Number 6	General work on proceeding

DATE	TIME	ISSUE 1	TASK
5/24/2010	1.5	6	read and analyze initial scoping memo for LTPP from May 6
5/27/2010	1	6	read background material related to proceeding
6/1/2010	1	6	draft plan for upcoming deadlines
6/3/2010	4	5	meeting re: LTPP with Sierra Club and CBE to discuss strategy and how to not
6/3/2010	3	6	LTPP read and analyze background material related to last LTPP
6/3/2010	2	6	draft brief to respond to scoping memo
6/4/2010	1.75	6	finish draft of brief to respond to scoping memo
6/11/2010	6	1	LTPP workshop at the PUC related to rulebook & resource planning assumption
6/14/2010	4	3	research and analysis related to comments re: rulebook
6/15/2010	4	3	finish drafting rulebook comments
6/15/2010	3	1	research and analysis for draft comments for resource planning assumptions
6/16/2010	3	1	finish resource planning draft brief
6/17/2010	2	1	discussion and analysis of transmissions issues and RETI calculation to prepare
6/18/2010	7	1	attend RPS LTPP workshop to determine scope of comments
6/21/2010	1.75	3	finish writing rulebook and the resource planning assumptions briefs
6/22/2010	4	1	analysis of RPS issues (start)
6/23/2010	3.75	1	RPS issues research and analysis
7/7/2010	3	1	start writing RPS comments
7/8/2010	4.75	1	continue drafting RPS comments
7/9/2010	1.25	1	finish writing RPS comments
7/15/2010	3	1	draft reply brief for RPS issues
7/16/2010	1.75	1	finish writing reply brief for RPS issues
9/16/2010	2.7	1	read through renew integration presentations from CPUC workshop and start
9/17/2010	5	1	start drafting renew integration brief, sections 1 and 2 of ALJ questions
9/20/2010	3.5	1	continue drafting LTPP renew integration brief
9/21/2010	2.6	1	continue drafting renew integration comments
9/27/2010	2	1	start drafting reply for integration comments
9/28/2010	2.7	1	write reply integration comments
9/29/2010	2	1	write reply comments
10/1/2010	2	1	reply comments, determine which statements to respond to related to renewa
10/5/2010	2.8	1	reply comments, draft answers to new renewable integration questions
10/7/2010	1.8	1	reply comments, work on finalizing entire renewable integration brief
10/8/2010	1	1	finish drafting renewable integration comments
10/21/2010	1.75	1	read materials to prepare for renewable integration workshop
10/22/2010	7	1	PG&E integration workshop
11/17/2010	1.75	1	analysis of material for comments on October 22 workshop
11/18/2010	2	1	draft comments for October 22 workshop
11/22/2010	1	1	finish comments for October 22 workshop
11/30/2010	6	1	workshop on renewable integration issues
8 th Dec	1	2	work on drafting PE Prehearing conference statement
1/12/2011	2	1	start drafting PE comments on Nov 30 WS
1/13/2011	4.75	1	continue drafting PE comments on Nov 30 WS
1/18/2011	4	1	read and analyze other parties comments on Nov 30 WS
1/19/2011	1	1	finish analysis of other parties comments to Nov 30 WS
1/26/2011	0.8	6	analyze JEP motion related to iTrack and III schedules
2/2/2011	0.7	6	start draft of reply to JEP motion
2/3/2011	1	6	draft section of JEP reply brief
2/8/2011	0.6	6	read and analyze SCE's iTrack II Motion

LUCAS WILLIAMS' HOURS

Issues ¹	Number ¹ Number ² Number ³ Number ⁴ Number ⁵ Number ⁶	Need Issue, the Track ¹ analysis Loading order compliance Procurement oversight and transparency Procurement of new products and fuel Coordination, Meetings, Hearings General work on proceeding	
DATE	TASK	TIME	ISSUE
4/26/2011	Research and Draft Response to PG&E's Proposed Hedging Plan ¹	4.3	3
4/27/2011	Research and Draft Response to PG&E's Proposed Hedging Plan ¹	3.3	3
4/28/2011	Review Data Requests ¹	2.9	6
5/2/2011	Revise BPP Testimony ¹	3.6	3
5/3/2011	Revise BPP Testimony ¹	2.8	3
5/4/2011	Complete final draft BPP Testimony for review by witness	1.9	3
5/9/2011	Review Other Parties' BPP Testimony for Reply Testimony	3.1	6
5/16/2011	Draft Outline for BPP Opening Brief	2.2	6
5/17/2011	Draft BPP Opening Brief	3.3	2
5/18/2011	Draft BPP Opening Brief	1.2	2
5/23/2011	Hearing re: Entering Testimony and Motion to Strike	1.8	5
5/24/2011	Hearing re: Track ¹ Schedule	1.6	5
6/6/2011	Draft Motion in Support of DRA's Motion to Alter Track ¹ Schedule	3.6	1
6/27/2011	Draft Reply Testimony ^{1,4} Loading Order section	4.1	2
6/28/2011	Draft Reply Testimony ^{1,4} Loading Order section	2.1	2
6/29/2011	Reply Testimony Draft ^{1,4} all sections and table of contents	3.8	6
6/30/2011	Complete Reply Testimony Draft	2.9	6
7/5/2011	Review Track ¹ Testimony of IOUs and CAISO	3.2	1
7/11/2011	Joint IOU Workshop re: Track ¹ Testimony	2.1	1
7/19/2011	Meeting with DRA, TURN, CBE, Sierra Club, re: Track ¹ and Track ^{1,1} testimony	1.8	5
7/26/2011	Edit Track ^{1,1,1} Testimony	3.6	3
7/27/2011	Edit Track ^{1,1,1} Testimony	4.1	3
7/28/2011	Edit Track ^{1,1,1} Testimony	3.4	3
8/15/2011	Evidentiary Hearing	4.3	5
8/16/2011	Evidentiary Hearing	3.4	5
8/17/2011	Evidentiary Hearing	3.5	5
8/18/2011	Evidentiary Hearing	2	5
8/30/2011	Evidentiary Hearing	1.5	5
9/15/2011	Edit Track ¹ & Track ^{1,1} Opening Brief	3.3	6
9/16/2011	Edit Track ¹ & Track ^{1,1} Opening Brief	3.7	6
9/19/2011	Review Other Parties' Track ¹ & Track ^{1,1} Opening Briefs	2.8	6
10/3/2011	Final Edits Track ¹ & Track ^{1,1} Reply Brief	3.9	6
12/4/2011	Draft reply comments on Proposed Track ^{1,1} decision	3.2	2
TOTAL		98.3	

LAW STUDENTS HOURS

Issues 1

- Number 1** Need Issue, the Track analysis including renewable integration modeling work
- Number 2** Loading order compliance
- Number 3** Procurement oversight and transparency
- Number 4** Procurement of new products and fuel
- Number 5** Coordination, Meetings, Hearings
- Number 6** General work on proceeding

	Date	Task	Hours	Issue
Law Students 1 Spring 2011	1/25/2011	Reviewed 2006 LTPP Decision as it Pertains to Bundled Procurement	1.2	6
	1/25/2011	Reviewed PG&E 2006 Bundled Procurement	0.3	6
	1/25/2011	Reviewed Updated Scoping Memo for Track 1 Two	0.6	6
	1/25/2011	Reviewed Standardized Planning Assumption for Bundled LTPP	0.6	2
	1/25/2011	Reviewed Utility Code 454.5	1	6
	1/27/2011	Drafted Response to Motion and Comments	0.5	6
	1/27/2011	Read PG&E 2010 LTPP Bundle Procurement Plan	0.7	6
	1/27/2011	Researched PG&E's 2006 LTPP Bundle Procurement	2	6
	1/28/2011	Researched Case Law on Bundle Procurement	2	6
	1/30/2011	Researched FERC Cases on Bundled Procurement	2	6
	2/1/2011	Meeting With Rory	1	6
	2/15/2011	Worked on Data Requests	1	2
	2/17/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	5.5	2
	2/18/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	2	2
	2/19/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	2	2
	2/20/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	2	2
	2/22/2011	Edited Pre Hearing Conference Document	1	6
	2/22/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	2	2
	2/23/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	2	2
	2/24/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	3.5	2
	2/25/2011	Reviewed CAISO PHC Statement	2	6
	2/26/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	2	2
	2/27/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	3	2
	3/1/2011	Meeting With Rory	1	5
	3/1/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	3	2
	3/1/2011	Reviewed How to Compile and Draft Testimony	1	6
	3/2/2011	Worked on Data Requests for CAISO	5.5	6
	3/2/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	1	2
	3/3/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	3	2
	3/3/2011	Worked on Goals and Expectations for Track II	2.5	6
	3/4/2011	Worked on Data Requests for PG&E	3.8	6
	3/4/2011	Worked on Goals and Expectations for Track II	2	6
	3/5/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	2	2
	3/7/2011	Worked on Data Requests for CAISO and PG&E	4.1	6
	3/8/2011	Meeting with Rory	1	6
	3/8/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	3.5	2
	3/9/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	1.5	2
	3/10/2011	Worked on Draft Written Direct Testimony of Rory Cox	1	3
	3/10/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	6	2
	3/11/2011	Worked on Draft Written Direct Testimony of Rory Cox	3.9	3
	3/11/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	2	2
3/12/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	2	2	
3/16/2011	Worked on Draft Written Direct Testimony of Rory Cox	8	3	
3/21/2011	Worked on Draft Written Direct Testimony of Rory Cox	5.3	3	
3/21/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	2	2	
3/21/2011	Reading of Motions to Clarify Track II	0.3	6	
3/22/2011	Conference Call with Rory Cox	0.8	6	
3/22/2011	Worked on Data Requests to be Served on PG&E	1	2	
3/22/2011	Reviewed Motion Filed for Clarification Re Track II	0.5	6	
3/22/2011	Reviewed IOU's Response Motions	1	6	
3/22/2011	Worked on Building Testimony	2	6	
3/22/2011	Final Data Request Edits and Service	1	2	
3/23/2011	Worked on Draft Written Direct Testimony of Rory Cox	5.7	3	
3/25/2011	Finished First Draft of Written Direct Testimony of Rory Cox	3	3	
3/25/2011	Began Drafting LTPP Track II Brief	0.5	6	
3/25/2011	Worked on Building Testimony	2	6	
3/25/2011	Reviewed PG&E Bundled Procurement Plan	2	6	
3/26/2011	Reviewed PG&E Bundled Procurement Plan	2	6	
3/27/2011	Reviewed PG&E Bundled Procurement Plan	3	6	

3/28/2011	Reading of Track # Bundled Plans	1.3	6
3/28/2011	Reading of Track # Bundled Plans	2.2	6
3/28/2011	Research: PG&E DR Application for Budget Approval from PUC	0.4	1
3/28/2011	Reading of Track # Bundled Plans	1.3	6
3/28/2011	Read PG&E BPP ₁	5	6
3/28/2011	Review PG&E's Track # BPP	2	6
3/29/2011	Research re BPP: Electronic Solicitations and Dispatch Order	2.4	2
3/29/2011	Conference Call with Rory Cox	1	3
3/29/2011	Read PG&E BPP ₁	2.5	5
3/29/2011	Research regarding the IE and Bilateral Contract Evaluation	2.5	3
3/29/2011	Reviewed PG&E's Commission Mandated Case	4.8	1
3/30/2011	Research re BPP: Electronic Solicitations and Dispatch Order	1.7	3
3/30/2011	Reviewed PG&E Testimony Associate with BPP	2.5	6
3/30/2011	Researched proposed change to take away advice letter process for multi ^L year transactions	3.3	3
3/30/2011	Research regarding the IE and Bilateral Contract Evaluation	2	3
3/31/2011	Meeting at PG&E	1.5	5
3/31/2011	Reviewed PG&E Bundled Procurement Plan	3.5	6
4/1/2011	Researched proposed change to take away advice letter process for multi ^L year transactions	4.3	3
4/1/2011	Research regarding the IE and Bilateral Contract Evaluation	4	3
4/2/2011	Reviewed PG&E Bundled Procurement Plan	2.5	6
4/3/2011	Reviewed PG&E Bundled Procurement Plan	3	6
4/3/2011	Reading BPP Redline Edits	1.3	6
4/4/2011	Finished researching advice letter issue and contract duration pre ^L approval limits	8.8	3
4/4/2011	Drafting Reply Brief to BPP	1.6	6
4/4/2011	Reading BPP Redline Edits	1	6
4/5/2011	Drafted Testimony for Change in Bilateral Negotiations in BPP	3.5	3
4/5/2011	Reviewed PG&E Bundled Procurement Plan	1.5	6
4/5/2011	Reviewed PG&E's Redline Plan	1.5	6
4/5/2011	Reviewed PG&E's CDWR Application	1	6
4/5/2011	Compiled Data Request for CAISO	0.5	2
4/5/2011	Conference Call w/ Rory & Team ₁	0.7	5
4/5/2011	Drafting Track # Testimony: Electronic Solicitations and Dispatch Order	3.9	2
4/6/2011	Drafted reply testimony on advice letter and contract duration limits ₁ issues	5	3
4/6/2011	Drafted Testimony for Change in Bilateral Negotiations in BPP	3	3
4/6/2011	Research re BPP: Loading Order and Dispatch Order Connection	0.9	2
4/6/2011	Research re Confidentiality in BPP	4	6
4/7/2011	Compiled Data Request to Serve on CAISO	1	2
4/7/2011	Reviewed PG&E's Data Request Response	1	2
4/7/2011	Reviewed PG&E Bundled Procurement Plan	4	6
4/7/2011	Editing Track # Reply Testimony and Brief	0.4	6
4/7/2011	Reading PG&E's Data Request Responses	0.4	6
4/7/2011	Reading PG&E's Data Request Responses	0.3	6
4/7/2011	Inputting Citations and Editing Track # Testimony	2.4	6
4/8/2011	Drafted reply testimony on advice letter and contract duration limits ₁ issues	4.2	3
4/8/2011	Drafted Testimony for Change in Bilateral Negotiations in BPP	4.5	3
4/8/2011	Drafted Testimony	3	2
4/8/2011	Research re Confidentiality in BPP	2.8	3
4/9/2011	Drafted Testimony	3	2
4/9/2011	Research re Confidentiality in BPP	0.8	3
4/11/2011	Finished drafting reply testimony on advice letter and contract duration ₁ limits issues	4.7	3
4/11/2011	Drafted Testimony for Change in Bilateral Negotiations in BPP	3	3
4/11/2011	Inputting Citations and Editing Track # Testimony	0.4	6
4/11/2011	Drafting Confidentiality Memo re BPP Redacted Information ₁	4.7	3
4/12/2011	Drafted Testimony for Change in Use of Independent Evaluator	3.5	3
4/12/2011	Drafted Testimony	4.3	2
4/12/2011	Conference Call w/ Rory & Team ₁	0.8	5
4/12/2011	Follow up on PG&E Data Requests	0.4	2
4/12/2011	Editing Confidentiality Memo re BPP, Letter to PG&E	0.2	6
4/13/2011	Edited CAISO Data Requests	1	6
4/13/2011	Made Edits to written direct testimony of Rory Cox	4.2	4
4/13/2011	Drafted Testimony for Change in Use of Independent Evaluator	3.5	3
4/13/2011	Drafting Confidentiality Letter to PG&E re BPP Redacted Information ₁	2.7	6

4/13/2011	Research re DR and L&R Valuations	0.7	2
4/13/2011	Reading the BASE Executive Summary	0.4	6
4/13/2011	Reading BPP Confidential App. F	0.2	6
4/13/2011	Editing Letter to PG&E re BPP Redacted Information	0.5	6
4/14/2011	Made Edits to written direct testimony of Rory Cox	3	6
4/14/2011	Revised CAISO Data Request	0.5	6
4/14/2011	Worked on Testimony	3	6
4/14/2011	Worked on Reply to PG&E's Commission Mandated Case	2.5	6
4/15/2011	Finished Edits to written direct testimony of Rory Cox	1.5	6
4/15/2011	Edited BPP Reply Testimony	1.7	3
4/15/2011	Drafted Reply to PG&E's BPP in response to JE and Bilateral Negotiations	5.5	3
4/15/2011	Reviewed new filings by Track II parties	1	6
4/15/2011	Worked on reply brief	3	2
4/16/2011	Worked on Reply Testimony	3	2
4/17/2011	Edited BPP Reply Testimony	2	6
4/17/2011	Worked on CAISO data request	3	1
4/18/2011	Finished Edits to BPP Reply Testimony	3.1	6
4/18/2011	Began drafting LTPP Track II BPP Reply Brief	1.6	6
4/18/2011	Reading CAISO's Model Data Released on Website	0.5	1
4/19/2011	Edited BPP Reply Testimony	0.6	3
4/19/2011	Revised and Edited Testimony	3	6
4/19/2011	Worked on CAISO data request	1	6
4/19/2011	Worked on Reply Testimony	2	2
4/19/2011	Worked on Reply Brief	1	2
4/19/2011	Meeting w/ Rory and Team	1	6
4/19/2011	Editing CAISO Data Requests	0.1	1
4/20/2011	Edited BPP Reply Testimony	1.8	3
4/20/2011	Drafted LTPP Track II BPP Reply Brief	3.6	3
4/20/2011	Revised and Edited Testimony	3	6
4/20/2011	Worked on Reply Brief	2	2
4/20/2011	Reading PG&E's DR 2010 2014 DR Filing	1	2
4/20/2011	Reading PG&E's DR 2010 2014 DR Filing	0.5	2
4/21/2011	Worked on CAISO Data Request	0.7	1
4/21/2011	Worked on Reply Testimony	2	6
4/21/2011	Worked on Reply Brief	2	2
4/22/2011	Edited BPP Draft Testimony	0.3	6
4/22/2011	Revised and Edited Testimony	5	6
4/22/2011	Worked on Reply Brief	1.5	2
4/22/2011	Worked on Reply Testimony	1.5	6
4/23/2011	Edited LTPP Track II BPP Reply Brief	1	3
4/23/2011	Reading PG&E's Letter in Response to Confidentiality Issues	0.6	3
4/25/2011	Edited LTPP Track II BPP Reply Brief	0.7	3
4/25/2011	Edited BPP Draft Testimony	2.9	3
5/21/2011	Reviewed Bill Powers Testimony	3.5	2
5/21/2011	Reviewed Rory Cox Testimony	3.5	3
5/22/2011	Reviewed PG&E Testimony	5.3	6
5/25/2011	Reviewed energy action plan II	1.7	2
5/26/2011	Research re BPP opening brief	3.5	6
5/26/2011	Drafted outline regarding BPP opening brief	0.25	6
5/27/2011	Research regarding BPP opening brief	0.5	6
5/27/2011	Drafted BPP opening brief	2.75	6
5/27/2011	Reviewed Order instituting rulemaking	4.7	6
5/27/2011	Reviewed Scoping Memo Track II	0.6	6
5/28/2011	Reviewed PG&E BPP	2.6	6
5/29/2011	Research and Drafted Track II Arguments	6.5	3
5/30/2011	Worked on Brief	2	2
5/31/2011	Worked on Brief	4	2
5/31/2011	Drafted BPP opening brief	2.5	3
6/1/2011	Worked on Brief	1	2
6/1/2011	Worked on Brief	4.6	2
6/1/2011	Drafted BPP opening brief	3.5	3
6/1/2011	Drafted Track II Argument	3.7	3
6/2/2011	Worked on Brief	4	2
6/2/2011	Drafted BPP opening brief	1.5	3
6/2/2011	Research regarding BPP opening brief	2	2
6/3/2011	Worked on Brief	4	3
6/3/2011	Drafted BPP opening brief	4	3
6/4/2011	Worked on Brief	2	2

Law Students | Summer 2011

6/4/2011	Revised and submitted Track II draft	1.7	6	
6/6/2011	Worked on Brief	4	2	
6/6/2011	Meeting re risk management and hedging	0.25	3	
6/6/2011	Reviewed DRA-BPP testimony regarding risk management and hedging	1.3	3	
6/6/2011	Reviewed revisions to draft	4.3	6	
6/7/2011	Worked on Brief	5	2	
6/7/2011	Review of comments on draft BPP opening brief	0.3	6	
6/7/2011	Revised draft opening brief	3.5	6	
6/7/2011	Reviewed PG&E testimony	4.8	6	
6/8/2011	Worked on Brief	4	2	
6/8/2011	Revised draft BPP opening brief	4.2	6	
6/8/2011	Reviewed DRA/TURN motion to strike and 3/29 ALJ Ruling	3.5	2	
6/9/2011	Worked on Brief	2	2	
6/9/2011	Revised draft BPP opening brief	4	6	
6/10/2011	Meeting at PG&E	2	6	
6/11/2011	Worked on Brief	2	2	
6/12/2011	Worked on Brief	2	2	
6/12/2011	Revised draft BPP opening brief	0.7	6	
6/12/2011	Revised procedural and background sections of the brief	7.6	6	
6/13/2011	PG&E Meeting Notes	2	6	
6/13/2011	Proof Read Brief	3	6	
6/13/2011	Revised draft BPP opening brief	3.8	6	
6/13/2011	Reviewed Aaron's Track II section	2.7	6	
6/14/2011	Proof Read Brief	5	6	
6/14/2011	Cite checked Aaron's Track II section	2.3	6	
6/15/2011	Citation Corrections	1	6	
6/15/2011	Proof Read Brief	2.8	6	
6/15/2011	Revised draft opening brief	2.8	6	
6/15/2011	Checked and revised brief for confidentiality compliance	1	6	
6/15/2011	Coordinated reviewing other briefs	3.3	6	
6/16/2011	Edit Brief	2	6	
6/16/2011	Reviewed draft BPP opening brief	5	3	
6/17/2011	Reviewed Briefs	2	3	
6/17/2011	Read/took notes on PG&E BPP opening brief	1.3	6	
6/17/2011	Read/took notes on other party's BPP opening briefs	0.3	6	
6/17/2011	Reviewed TURN/AREM/MEA/COA/SCE Briefs	0.3	6	
6/18/2011	Reviewed Briefs	2	6	
6/19/2011	Reviewed Briefs	2	6	
6/20/2011	Reviewed Briefs	5	6	
6/20/2011	Read/took notes on DRA-BPP opening brief	0.8	6	
6/20/2011	Read/took notes on SCE-BPP opening brief	0.5	6	
6/20/2011	Read/took notes on SDG&E BPP opening brief	0.3	6	
6/20/2011	Reviewed Sierra Club Brief	2	6	
6/20/2011	Reviewed notes on briefs	1.3	6	
6/21/2011	Worked on Reply Brief	3.5	2	
6/21/2011	Research regarding BPP reply brief	2.5	3	
6/22/2011	Worked on Reply Brief	5	2	
6/22/2011	Research regarding BPP reply brief	2	3	
6/22/2011	Drafted BPP reply brief	3	3	
6/22/2011	Research regarding BPP reply brief	2.8	3	
6/22/2011	Drafted Track II Reply Brief draft section	1	3	
6/23/2011	Worked on Reply Brief	5	2	
6/23/2011	Drafted BPP reply brief	2	3	
6/24/2011	Worked on Reply Brief	5	2	
6/24/2011	Drafted BPP reply brief	0.5	3	
6/25/2011	Drafted Track II Reply Brief draft section	6.8	3	
6/26/2011	Drafted BPP reply brief	0.5	3	
6/26/2011	Finalize Track II Brief section	7.5	3	
6/27/2011	Reviewed Reply Brief	1	3	
6/28/2011	Reviewed BPP reply brief	2.3	3	
Law Students Fall 2011	110815	Reading background information on competitive procurement	1.5	6
	110816	Read Administrative Law Judge (ALJ) Ruling	0.2	6
	110817	familiarizing with LTPP documents	2	6
	110818	Attended CPUC hearing	1.8	6
	110820	Read ALJ Ruling	0.8	6
	110821	Read PG&E Testimony	2.2	6
	110822	reading LTPP Track III Pacific Environment Testimony	1.5	3
	110822	Reading LTPP PG&E public testimony from July 1, 2011	2.5	3

110822	Read PG&E Testimony	0.4	6
110822	Read SCE Testimony	2.3	6
110822	Read PG&E's Track III testimony	2	3
110823	Meeting with LTPP Team to continue overview and establish next steps, including brief work allocation	1.5	5
110823	Read SCE Testimony	2.1	6
110823	Read SDG&E Testimony	1.2	6
110823	Reviewed PE's Track III testimony	1.5	6
110823	Started research on IE	0.4	3
110824	Reading LTPP PG&E public testimony from July 1, 2011	0.25	3
110824	Reading LTPPG&E reply Testimony from Aug. 11, 2011	1.25	3
110824	Reading TURN's Track III testimony	0.25	3
110824	Reading SCE Track III Testimony	1.2	3
110824	reading SDGE Track III testimony	1.6	3
110824	Reading CLECA Track II Testimony Section on OTC units	0.2	3
110824	Reading IEP Track III Testimony	0.2	3
110824	Read PE Testimony/Compiled rough outline of client goals	1.4	6
110824	Read and took notes on PG&E Testimony and PG&E reply testimony	1.3	3
110824	Reviewed SCE and SDG&E Testimony and reply testimony	1	3
110825	Research on IE and PRG	3.6	3
110826	Reading IEP Track III Testimony	1.8	3
110826	Reading ALJ Ruling Addressing Track III issues	0.3	3
110826	Reading CDRA track II and III testimony	1.4	3
110826	Read SDG&E Testimony and compiled notes to outline GHG compliance plan	2	4
110826	Read SDG&E Reply Testimony and compiled notes	0.4	3
110826	Read SCE Testimony and compiled notes to outline GHG compliance plan	1.3	4
110826	Read SCE Reply Testimony and compiled notes	0.3	6
110827	Re-reading PE track II testimony for OTC goals	0.75	3
110827	drafting outline for OTC section of PE brief	0.75	3
110828	Researching for OTC section of LTPP brief	0.3	3
110828	reading CAWRCB Resolution 2010 0020	1	4
110828	reading PE Track II opening Brief for Format guidelines	0.2	3
110828	drafting outline for OTC section of LTPP brief	1.5	3
110828	reading Statewide water quality control policy on the use of coastal and est	2	3
110828	Reviewed IE Rpt Long Form	0.5	3
110829	reviewing and revising draft outline for Bid evaluation section of Track III PE	1	3
110829	drafting outline for OTC section of PE brief	1.5	3
110829	revising outline for Bid evaluation Section of PE brief	1.4	3
110829	reading CAISO Mitigation of Reliance on Old Thermal Generation including	0.3	3
110829	reading WEM track III testimony	0.3	6
110829	Conducted research and compiled tentative outline for GHG portion of brief	4.4	4
110829	Reviewed IEP testimony to prepare for CPUC hearing on 8/30/11	1.2	3
110829	Reviewed 2006 LTPP	0.75	3
110829	Researched IE/PRG issues	1.5	3
110829	Outline IE/PRG issues	3.25	3
110830	LTPP Team Meeting with Client	1.3	5
110830	LTPP Hrg at CPUC	2.5	5
110830	LTPP IE/PRG research	0.75	3
110831	Reading Transcript of cross of Todd Strauss on issue of JOGs in RFO in Aug	0.5	3
110831	Reading Transcript of Cross of Kevin Woodruff for material on Bid Evaluation	1	3
110831	drafting OTC Section of LTPP brief	1	3
110831	Edited and reworked large sections of outline	0.9	6
110831	Researched authority for interim decisions and took notes	2.3	4
110831	Researched authority regarding advice letter process and took notes	0.8	4
110831	LTPP IE/PRG research	2.5	3
110901	Reviewing Track II briefs for reference to drafting Track III brief	4	3
110902	Worked on drafting the GHG portion of the brief - first full draft	3.5	4
110902	PRG research + con't reviewing overlapping Track II issues	3	3
110903	Drafting JOG vs. PPA section of LTPP Brief	2.5	3
110903	Drafting Opening Brief	6.5	6
110904	Con't drafting Opening Brief	6.5	6
110905	drafting OUG vs. PPA section of LTPP Brief	4	3
110905	Revising OTC section Draft	0.5	3
110905	Continued to draft sections of first draft of GHG portion of brief	3.2	4
110905	Edited and proofread first draft of GHG portion of brief to be able to submit	0.8	4
110905	Edit Opening Brief	1.75	6
110906	Meeting with Small LTPP group and phone conference with client	0.75	5
110906	Continued to research OIR 10 05 006, AB 32, and DRA Testimony	3.5	4
110906	Phone mtg. w/ client + team mtg.	0.5	5

110907	Revising OTC section Draft	4	3
110907	Revising Bid Eval Section Draft	0.75	3
110907	Went over comments to brief and made edits	1.2	3
110908	Researching Current OTC contract lengths	0.5	3
110909	Revising OTC section Draft	0.5	3
110909	Inserted JOU testimony into footnotes, citations, and arguments	2.2	3
110909	Reworked and consolidated interim decision section	0.8	4
110909	Edit brief 2nd draft	6.5	6
110910	con't 2nd draft	6	6
110911	Edited, reworked volatile market section, bluebooked and source checked	3.3	6
110912	Expanding section of OTC draft that addresses parties' positions more direct	3.25	3
110912	Reviewing/ revising Bid Eval Section of LTPP Brief	1	3
110912	Revising GHG section of the LTPP Brief	0.5	4
110912	Edited and consolidated GHG section	4	4
110912	Began edits on OTC section	0.3	3
110912	Edit brief 3rd draft	3.25	6
110913	Edited OTC section	1.5	3
110913	Edited and consolidated GHG section	1.5	4
110913	Integrated comments and finalized GHG section	1	4
110913	Mtg w/ client + team	0.9	5
110914	cite checking and reading through LTPP brief pp. 1-18	3	6
110914	Edited and cite checked pages 45-53 of brief	2	6
110917	reading CBE's Track I and III opening brief to prepare for reply brief	0.75	6
110918	reading NRDC Track I opening brief to prepare for Reply Brief	0.5	6
110918	reviewing notes from environmental groups' opening briefs and preparing r	0.25	6
110919	reading Green Power Institute Track I and III opening Brief for reply brief	1	6
110919	reading WEM Track I and III opening brief for reply brief	1	6
110919	reading Sierra Club Track I and III testimony	1.5	6
110919	reading the vote solar initiative opening brief for reply brief	0.1	6
110919	reading CEERT opening brief for reply brief	0.75	6
110919	Reviewed Industry/Trade Group Briefs - EPUC	0.4	6
110919	Reviewed Industry/Trade Group Briefs - WPTF	1	6
110919	Reviewed Industry/Trade Group Briefs - Vote Solar initiative	0.1	6
110919	Reviewed Industry/Trade Group Briefs - JEP	1.6	6
110919	Reviewed Industry/Trade Group Briefs - LSA	1.2	6
110919	Review reply briefs for consumer groups	1.5	6
110920	Reviewed LSA Brief again to really understand arguments	0.8	6
110920	Reviewed Industry/Trade Group Briefs - NRG Energy	0.4	6
110920	Reviewed Industry/Trade Group Briefs - Calpine, CAISO, and CAC	0.9	6
110920	Reviewed Industry/Trade Group Briefs - CEERT	0.4	6
110920	Reviewed Industry/Trade Group Briefs - AES	0.4	6
110920	Compiled notes to get ready for Team Meeting	0.3	6
110920	Looked over other reply briefs to get idea of what introduction should be lik	0.3	6
110920	Review reply briefs for consumer groups	1.5	6
110920	Meeting w/ client + team	1.2	5
110920	Review and research reply brief issues	2.8	6
110921	Looking at PE Track II Reply Brief to get an idea of Format	0.25	6
110921	drafting track III issues for PE LTPP Reply Brief	1.5	3
110921	reading JEP Opening Brief for information on their position related to transp	0.75	3
110921	drafting track III issues for PE LTPP Reply Brief draft	3.5	3
110921	Carefully reviewed PE's opening brief, other reply briefs, started drafting	4.4	6
110922	Read JEP brief on viability issue	0.5	3
110922	Cont' Research for reply brief	3.5	3
110925	revising track III reply brief draft	1	3
110925	Drafted introduction to PE's Reply Brief	2	6
110925	Research + draft paragraphs for Reply Brief	5.5	3
110926	drafting track III issues for PE LTPP Reply Brief draft	3	3
110926	reading PG&E's declaration in support of confidentiality	1	3
110926	reading D. 06 06 066 for confidentiality request details	0.75	3
110926	Edited and Revised draft of introduction; checked facts with all opening brie	1.8	6
110927	Team Meeting	0.9	5
110927	Looked more into Judicial Notice issue	0.9	6
110927	Con't edit reply brief	3	6
110927	Edit Reply brief	1.5	6
110928	reviewing and cite checking track III issues section of PE Reply Brief Draft	2.5	6
110928	looking into JEP testimony to find references to environmental reasons why	0.5	6
110928	reviewing first half of reply brief	1.5	6
110928	Researched CAISO issue and edited CAISO section of Reply Brief	3.3	6
110928	Read/Edited Introduction to Reply Brief	0.6	6
110928	Con't edit reply brief	1	6
110928	Review Track I reply brief + start cite check	0.5	6
110929	Edited Reply Brief	1.3	6
110929	Read CAISO Track II Testimony	2.7	1

110929	Review Track 1 reply brief in commute	0.8	1
110929	Con't cite check Track 1 reply brief	0.8	1
110929	Review CAISO Track 1 brief prep for Oct. 7 Mtg.	3.2	1
110930	Read PE Track 1 Testimony	0.5	1
111001	reading through current draft of PE LTPP tracks 1 and 111 reply brief	0.5	1
111003	Read PE Track 1 Testimony	0.5	1
111003	Read PE Track 1 Testimony	0.9	1
111003	Reread CAISO Track 1 Testimony to pin down questions	1.6	1
111004	Finished PE Testimony for second time to prepare for meeting	0.7	1
111005	reading SDG&E's reply brief to summarize it for our client	2.3	6
111005	reading AES reply brief to summarize for our client	0.25	6
111005	reading CARE reply brief to summarize for client	0.5	6
111005	reading CEERT reply brief to summarize for client	0.25	6
111005	reading DRA reply brief to summarize for client	1	6
111005	reading Jan Reid Reply Brief to summarize for client	0.15	6
111005	Read PG&E's Reply Brief and took notes	2.7	6
111005	Read GPI's Reply Brief and took notes	0.5	6
111005	Read Sierra Club's Reply Brief and took notes	0.4	6
111005	Read NRD's Reply Brief and took notes	0.5	6
111010	Read Calpine's Reply Brief and took notes	1.3	6
111010	Read WEM's Reply Brief and took notes	1.6	6
111010	Compiled all notes on Reply Briefs into Summaries	0.8	6
	TOTAL LAW STUDENT HOURS	855.45	

BILL POWERS HOURS

Date	Hours	Task	Issue
4/21/2011	1	work on LTPP testimony	2
4/28/2011	2	work on LTPP testimony	2
4/29/2011	2	work on LTPP testimony	2

**Bill Powers had prepared his testimony for another project for Pacific Environment. Pacific Environment was able to use Mr. Power's work product from that other proceeding to limit the amount of time necessary to prepare testimony in this case.

SHANNA FOLEY'S HOURS

Issues 1	Number 1	Need Issue, the Track I analysis including renewable integration modeling work
	Number 2	Loading order compliance
	Number 3	Procurement oversight and transparency
	Number 4	Procurement of new products and fuel
	Number 5	Coordination, Meetings, Hearings
	Number 6	General work on proceeding

DATE	TASK	TIME	ISSUE 1
4/13/2011	Research re. risk management/viability	3.5	3
4/17/2011	Research and drafted section of R. Cox testimony on Risk Management	2.5	3
4/18/2011	Drafted section of R. Cox testimony on Risk Management	3.1	3
4/19/2011	Edited section of R. Cox testimony on risk management	0.5	3
5/31/2011	Background reading, outlining brief argument	4.6	6
6/1/2011	Meeting with LTPP Team	0.3	5
6/7/2011	Edited and cite checked student draft brief on hedging, risk management	2	3
6/8/2011	Meeting with LTPP Team	0.8	5
6/8/2011	Writing/editing brief on track II issues	3.5	6
6/8/2011	M'Track III issues	0.8	6
6/21/2011	Research and writing reply brief section on Renewable Integration Pro	3.2	4
6/10/2011	Drafted section of brief on renewable integration products	0.5	4
6/14/2011	Edited and cite checked draft of brief on track II issues	4.5	6
6/15/2011	Meeting with LTPP Team	1	5
6/15/2011	Editing/cite checking brief	1.2	6
6/17/2011	Editing/cite checking brief	2.6	6
6/21/2011	Meeting with LTPP Team	1.5	5
6/27/2011	Review and revised brief section on PG&E biomethane contracts	1.5	4
6/27/2011	Cite checked and editing brief section on loading order	2	2
7/6/2011	Meeting with LTPP team	0.8	5
7/13/2011	Meeting with LTPP team	0.8	5
7/20/2011	LTPP Team meeting	1.5	5
8/16/2011	Drafting brief section on reasonableness of settlement agreement	2.8	6
8/16/2011	Outlining draft brief and research re. bid evaluation criteria/PG&E's pr	6.3	3
8/17/2011	Meeting with student clinician re. bid evaluation section	0.3	3
8/31/2011	Revising draft section on settlement agreement	0.8	6
TOTAL		52.9	

Law Student Hours	120124	Drafted PE LTPP Intervenor Compensation Claim Form	0.6
	120124	Read Track II Decision Issued on January 18, 2012 and took notes	1
	120124	Reviewed PE Track II Materials	1
	120125	Finished Track II Decision Issued on January 18, 2012 and took notes	2
	120125	Reviewed PE Track II Materials and cross-referenced with Decision	2
	120125	Worked more on Drafting PE Intervenor Compensation Claim Form	0.8
	120130	Cross-referenced PE Track II Materials with Decision and drafted ICC form	2.3
	120130	Loading Order Research for ICC form	1
	120131	Research and drafting of specific loading order arguments for ICC form	0.7
	120131	Drafted Other Administrative Parts of ICC Form	1.3
	120201	Researched Rates and Drafted Rates Portion of ICC Form	1.2
	120201	Proofread and cite checked arguments on ICC Form	1.8
	120206	Calculated hours to claim on ICC Form	2.5
	120207	Compiled all hours reported into Excel Spreadsheet	2
	120207	Categorized tasks and hours for allocation of issues on ICC Form	1.5
	120207	Calculated total hours according to task	0.7
	120208	Calculated and Finalized Total Reported Hours	2.6
	120208	Finished First Draft of ICC Form	1.2
		TOTAL:	26.2
Deborah Behles' Hours	8/5/2010	work on drafting NOI	0.5
	8/10/2010	Finish drafting NOI	0.75
	5/8/2012	draft NOI	2
	5/9/2012	continue working on NOI	1.7
	5/15/2012	continue working on NOI	1
	5/16/2012	continue working on NOI	1
			6.95

Issues 1	Number 1	Need Issue, the Track analysis including renewable integration modeling work
	Number 2	Loading order compliance
	Number 3	Procurement oversight and transparency
	Number 4	Procurement of new products and fuel
	Number 5	Coordination, Meetings, Hearings
	Number 6	General work on proceeding

Total Hours by Issue

Issue	Total (hrs)	Percent of Participation (%)	Percent of Work per Person	%
Issue 1	291.7	19		
			Rory Cox	36
			Deborah Behles	50
			Lucas Williams	4
			Law Students	10
			Shanna Foley	0
Issue 2	195.7	12.5		
			Rory Cox	0
			Deborah Behles	12
			Lucas Williams	7
			Law Students	80
			Shanna Foley	1
Issue 3	403.05	25.8		
			Rory Cox	4.5
			Deborah Behles	15
			Lucas Williams	7
			Law Students	69
			Shanna Foley	4.5
Issue 4	65.8	4		
			Rory Cox	37
			Deborah Behles	2
			Lucas Williams	0
			Law Students	53
			Shanna Foley	8
Issue 5	116	7		
			Rory Cox	31
			Deborah Behles	31
			Lucas Williams	17
			Law Students	15
			Shanna Foley	6
Issue 6	485.65	31.7		
			Rory Cox	7
			Deborah Behles	11
			Lucas Williams	6
			Law Students	72
			Shanna Foley	4
Total (all issues)	1557.9	100		
			Rory Cox	14
			Deborah Behles	21
			Lucas Williams	6
			Law Students	56
			Shanna Foley	3