

ATTACHMENT 7

INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM OF SIERRA CLUB CALIFORNIA: R.10 105 1006
PAUL CORT

Date	Description	Issue	Hours
6/3/2010	Meeting w/ Pacific Env't et al. re: PUC strategy	COOR	6.00
6/4/2010	Correspondence re: client meeting	PW	1.00
6/7/2010	Call w/ clients	PW	1.20
6/10/2010	Call w/ client	PW	1.10
6/10/2010	Review planning assumptions and rulebook ruling	PA	3.00
6/11/2010	Attend workshop on planning assumptions and rulebook ruling	PA	6.00
6/13/2010	Prepared opening statement and motion to intervene for PHC	PW	3.00
6/14/2010	Attended PHC	PW	4.00
6/17/2010	Reviewed planning assumptions comments	PA	1.00
6/17/2010	Call w/ Freehling re: RETI calc	PA	1.60
6/17/2010	Call w/ clients	PA	0.80
6/22/2010	Reviewed planning assumptions comments	PA	2.00
6/24/2010	Reviewed planning assumption/rulebook comments	PA	2.50
6/25/2010	Drafted planning assumptions reply	PA	2.50
6/28/2010	Drafted planning assumptions reply comments; call w/ Freehling re: reply	PA	4.90
6/30/2010	Reviewed RPS ruling	PA	2.80
6/30/2010	Meeting w/ Rostov re: EE comments	PA	0.20
7/2/2010	Reviewed RPS documents	PA	1.50
7/2/2010	Correspondence w/ clients re: drafting RPS comments	PA	0.40
7/6/2010	Call w/ Freehling re: RPS comments	PA	0.80
7/7/2010	Drafted RPS comments	PA	5.00
7/8/2010	Drafted RPS comments	PA	2.50
7/9/2010	Prepared final RPS comments	PA	2.50
7/13/2010	Reviewed RPS comments	PA	4.00
7/14/2010	Reviewed comments and drafted RPS reply	PA	3.80
7/15/2010	Drafted RPS reply	PA	2.00
7/16/2010	Finalize reply comments	PA	2.00
7/16/2010	Calls w/ clients re: draft reply comments	PA	0.80
7/26/2010	Reviewed RPS reply comments	PA	1.00
8/24/2010	Attended integration workshop	PA	8.00
9/2/2010	Prepare for client meeting	PW	2.00
9/7/2010	Client meeting	PW	4.00
9/7/2010	Prep for client meeting	PW	2.00
9/7/2010	Meeting w/ Rostov re: client meeting	PW	0.40
9/8/2010	Reviewed RIM ruling and materials	PA	3.50
9/8/2010	Correspondence w/ clients re: comments on RIM	PA	0.50
9/9/2010	Research for RIM comments	PA	3.00
9/13/2010	Research for RIM comments; correspondence re: experts	PA	4.50
9/14/2010	Draft RIM comments	PA	1.00
9/15/2010	Draft RIM comments	PA	3.00
9/16/2010	Prepared RIM comments	PA	4.50
9/20/2010	Prepared RIM comments	PA	4.50
9/27/2010	Review RIM comments	PA	1.70
9/28/2010	Review RIM comments	PA	4.00
9/29/2010	Draft RIM reply comments	PA	4.00

INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM OF SIERRA CLUB CALIFORNIA: R.10 105 1006
PAUL CORT

9/30/2010	Draft RIM reply comments	PA	4.00
10/4/2010	Reviewed RIM comments	PA	5.00
10/5/2010	Drafted RIM reply comments	PA	5.00
10/6/2010	Draft RIM reply comments	PA	0.50
10/7/2010	Draft RIM reply comments	PA	4.00
11/10/2010	Correspondence re: RIM	PA	0.30
12/8/2010	Correspondence re: PHC	PW	0.20
12/20/2010	Attended PHC	PW	4.00
12/21/2010	Correspondence w/ clients re: PHC	PW	2.00
	TOTAL 2010		145.50
1/4/2011	Call w/ Pingle	PW	0.70
1/4/2011	Talk w/ Rostov	PW	0.40
1/11/2011	Talk w/ Rostov	PW	0.40
1/12/2011	Client meeting	PW	4.30
1/13/2011	Call w/ Pingle	PW	0.10
1/13/2011	Talk w/ Rostov	PW	0.30
1/13/2011	Review scoping order	PW	0.40
1/14/2011	Review 33% RPS model comments	RIM	0.30
1/20/2011	Correspondence w/ clients	PW	0.20
2/1/2011	Meeting w/ Rostov; call w/ Levinson	PW	0.60
2/3/2011	Client meeting and prep	PW	6.00
2/7/2011	Meeting w/ Rostov	PW	0.50
2/9/2011	Meeting w/ Rostov	COOR	0.20
2/10/2011	Meeting w/ Pacific Environment	COOR	3.50
3/10/2011	Meeting w/ Rostov re: solar meetings	COOR	0.30
3/15/2011	Meeting w/ CalPine	COOR	1.00
4/5/2011	Correspondence re: nondisclosure agreements	BP	0.50
4/8/2011	Correspondence re: NDAs	BP	0.30
4/13/2011	Review bundled plans	BP	1.50
4/18/2011	Meeting w/ Rostov	PW	0.40
4/19/2011	Call re: Track II testimony	BP	1.20
4/21/2011	Call re: testimony	BP	0.80
4/27/2011	Call re: Track II testimony	BP	1.00
5/17/2011	Client meeting	PW	1.00
6/27/2011	Call re: Track I testimony	I&III	0.40
7/14/2011	Client call re: testimony	I&III	1.10
7/19/2011	Meeting w/ DRA	COOR	2.50
7/21/2011	Meeting w/ Rostov	Settlement	0.20
7/22/2011	Call w/ clients re: settlement	Settlement	1.00
7/25/2011	Correspondence re: settlement	Settlement	1.00
7/26/2011	Correspondence re: settlement	Settlement	1.50
7/27/2011	Calls w/ DRA and NRDC re: settlement	Settlement	0.90
7/28/2011	Review settlement edits; settlement call	Settlement	3.50
7/29/2011	Settlement meeting; call w/ clients; review materials	Settlement	7.00
8/1/2011	Call w/ Metropulos and Pingle	Settlement	0.70
8/1/2011	Call w/ Freehling	Settlement	0.40
8/2/2011	Settlement corres.	Settlement	2.50

PAUL CORT

8/3/2011	Settlement and prep for hrgs	Settlement	4.50
8/29/2011	Outline pp. brf	I&JIII	2.50
8/30/2011	Draft pp. brf.	I&JIII	2.90
8/30/2011	Call w/ Metropulos re: strategy	I&JIII	0.60
8/31/2011	draft pp. brf	I&JIII	2.50
9/2/2011	Draft pp. br.	I&JIII	2.50
9/6/2011	draft pp. brf.	I&JIII	5.00
9/7/2011	draft pp. brf.	I&JIII	4.40
9/8/2011	draft pp. br	I&JIII	3.40
9/9/2011	Draft pp. br	I&JIII	5.00
9/12/2011	Prepare pp. brf.	I&JIII	5.00
9/13/2011	Draft pp. br	I&JIII	3.50
9/14/2011	Draft pp. brf.	I&JIII	4.10
9/15/2011	Draft pp. brf.	I&JIII	5.40
9/16/2011	File pp. br.	I&JIII	2.50
9/19/2011	Review other pp. brfs.	I&JIII	0.50
9/20/2011	Review pp. brfs	I&JIII	1.90
9/28/2011	Draft reply	I&JIII	1.40
9/29/2011	Draft reply	I&JIII	3.00
9/30/2011	Draft reply	I&JIII	5.00
10/3/2011	Finalize reply	I&JIII	2.50
12/5/2011	Mtg w/ Rostov	BP	0.30
		TOTAL 2011	117.00
		PAUL CORT TOTAL	262.50

INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM OF SIERRA CLUB CALIFORNIA: R.10 05 006
WILLIAM ROSTOV

Date	Description (See Explanation of Abbreviations, Below)	Issue	Hours
6/2/2010	Prepare for meeting with Pacific Env. et al, phone call with Cox re:	COOR	0.30
6/3/2010	meeting with other environmental groups on LTPP, travel to meeting, review relevant document	COOR	6.00
6/8/2010	Phone call with Behles re: coordination, talking to our clients	COOR	0.50
6/9/2010	Email with Metropulos	PW	0.10
6/10/2010	Meeting with clients, pre meeting with Cort	PW	1.30
6/12/2010	Review comments from intervenors	PW	0.70
6/13/2010	Review comments from intervenors, email to Sierra Club contacts & to Cort	PW	1.10
6/14/2010	Pre hearing conference, post meeting with Cort	PW	4.00
6/17/2010	Phone call with Cort, Jackson, Freehling, Cox & Behles re: Sierra Club calculator	COOR	1.60
6/17/2010	Phone call with clients	PW	0.80
6/18/2010	RPS Planning Standards Workshop at PUC	PA	7.40
6/19/2010	Review ruling on rulebook, draft comment, review procurement standards ruling, research AB32 requirements	PA	2.50
6/20/2010	Draft Procurement Planning Standards comment, review scoping, revise rulebook comment, review ALJ order on Planning Standards	PA	3.50
6/21/2010	Draft and revise Procurement Planning Standards comment, revise rulebook comment, office conference with Baird re: filing, phone call with Freehling re: Planning Standards comment	PA	3.80
6/21/2010	Phone call with Freehling, review Freehling's edits, phone call with Freehling, review Procurement Planning, office conference with Baird re: service, email with clients, email with Metropulos	PA	1.90
6/23/2010	Phone call with Pingle, coordinate with Baird re: communication with clients, review Renewable Order and download it, review CPUC Renewable report to legislature	PA	0.80
6/24/2010	Review documents for workshop, email from clients, review client's position papers on EE, phone call with Barbara George, office conference with Cort re: comments	PA	1.90
6/24/2010	Phone call with Freehling, phone call with Stewart	PA	0.40
6/25/2010	PUC Energy Efficiency workshop, lunch meeting with Barbara George, review energy efficiency documents, download relevant documents, email with clients, office conference with Cort	PA	8.40
6/27/2010	Review Energy Efficiency documents and ARB scoping plan	PA	3.50
6/28/2010	Email with client	PW	0.10
6/28/2010	Emails from clients, phone call with Pingle, email to clients and Cort, office conference with Cort re: comments	PA	0.80
6/28/2010	Review revised reply comments	PA	0.20
6/29/2010	Draft Energy Efficiency comment, email with clients	PA	4.70
6/30/2010	Draft Energy Efficiency comments, email and phone call with Freehling, OCW-Cort	PA	5.20
7/1/2010	Draft Energy Efficiency comments, email and phone call with Freehling, OCW-Cort	PA	9.30

WILLIAM ROSTOV

7/2/2010	Review email from clients, revise Energy Efficiency comments, multiple phone calls with Robert Freehling re: comments, review 2006 decision for insert, office conference with Cort re: Energy Efficiency comments and RPS comments, review new orders from ALJ and some Energy	PA	3.90
7/6/2010	Review energy efficiency comments, review supplemental files from IOUs, review reply comments on PHC, email w/Freehling re: energy efficiency comments, review renewables report from Energy Division staff, review notes & slide presentation	PA	6.00
7/7/2010	Email Ettenson, NRDC, re: scheduling a meeting	COOR	0.10
7/7/2010	Email from clients, email w/Stewart, office conference with Cort	PA	0.40
7/8/2010	Phone call with Ettenson re: energy efficiency comments	COOR	0.40
7/8/2010	Draft reply comments on energy efficiency	PA	6.70
7/9/2010	Review client email re: comments on supplemental filings from IOUs	PA	0.20
7/9/2010	Draft energy efficiency reply comments, review filing from other parties, revise draft	PA	2.70
7/9/2010	Email from clients on energy efficiency comments, phone call with Freehling re: comments, revise comments	PA	3.50
7/12/2010	Email with Stewart re: comments, phone call with Freehling, review Freehling's changes, revise document, phone call with Freehling	PA	3.30
7/23/2010	Email from clients	PW	0.20
7/28/2010	Email from clients	PW	0.20
7/29/2010	Office conference with Cort re: next steps, email from clients	PW	0.20
9/2/2010	Office conference with Cort re: meeting w/clients	PW	0.20
9/7/2010	Meeting w/clients re: LTPP strategy	PW	4.00
9/7/2010	Office conference with Cort re: meeting w/clients	PW	0.80
9/27/2010	Phone call with Freehling; email to NRDC	COOR	0.20
9/27/2010	Email re: meeting w/NRDC	COOR	0.20
9/27/2010	Phone call with Metropulos re: meeting w/NRDC	COOR	0.10
9/29/2010	Confirm meeting w/NRDC; email clients; call Freehling; phone call with Cort	COOR	0.30
9/30/2010	office conference with Cort re: RIM comments	PA	0.20
10/5/2010	Email Cort re: RIM comments	PA	0.10
10/7/2010	Office conference with Cort re: RIM reply	PA	0.10
10/22/2010	Lunch with Behles & Lazerow	COOR	1.00
10/22/2010	Workshop on renewables integration; post workshop discussions	PA	5.50
10/25/2010	Email re: Vote Solar meeting	COOR	0.10
10/28/2010	Vote Solar call re: renewable modeling	COOR	1.70
11/11/2010	Phone call with Behles re: Vote Solar comments	COOR	0.20
11/12/2010	Phone call with Freehling re: RIM comments	PA	0.30
11/12/2010	Office conference with Cort re: comment strategy	PA	0.20
11/30/2010	Lunch w/Behles, Cox & Lazerow	COOR	0.80
11/30/2010	PUC Workshop on SO modeling	PA	5.70
12/3/2010	Review scoping memo	PW	0.40
12/6/2010	Review scoping order & appendix; review rules	PW	1.40
12/9/2010	Review Attachment 1 of scoping memo	PW	0.30
12/13/2010	Review scoping order; develop strategy	PW	1.20
12/15/2010	Phone call with Behles re: PHC	PW	0.30

INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM OF SIERRA CLUB CALIFORNIA: R.10 05 006
WILLIAM ROSTOV

12/15/2010	Phone call with Freehling re: PHC & LTTP strategy	PW	0.50
12/16/2010	Skim filings re: pre hearing conference	PW	0.30
12/19/2010	Prepare for pre hearing conference	PW	2.50
12/20/2010	Prepare for PHC	PW	1.00
12/20/2010	PHC	PW	1.80
12/20/2010	Post hearing discussions	PW	0.40
	TOTAL 2010		130.40
1/4/2011	Office conference with Cort re: LTTP strategy	PW	0.40
1/7/2011	CPUC Workshop on RPS calculator	PA	3.60
1/10/2011	Review email from Pingle	PW	0.10
1/11/2011	Office conference with Cort re: strategy	PW	0.40
1/11/2011	Phone call with Pingle	PW	0.20
1/11/2011	Draft Comment Renewable Integration Models; review 2006 Procurement Plans & presentations from utilities; review scoping order	RIM	4.50
1/12/2011	Revise comment on RIM models; email draft to clients	RIM	0.40
1/12/2011	PUC Workshop on utilities bundled plans; post workshop discussion w/other parties; post workshop discussion w/Cort & Cox	BP	3.00
1/13/2011	Office conference with Cort re: workshop & ALJ order	PW	0.30
1/13/2011	Review edits from Freehling	RIM	0.30
1/13/2011	Review email from Freehling & Dickerson; review ALJ order; scoping plan; email to clients re: comment letter	RIM	0.70
1/13/2011	Phone call with Freehling; email to him	RIM	0.30
1/13/2011	Phone call with Freehling re: comment letter	RIM	0.20
1/14/2011	Phone call with Pingle re: his questions	PW	0.10
1/14/2011	Revise comment letter	RIM	1.00
1/14/2011	Revise comment letter; phone call with Robert Freehling re: letter	RIM	0.50
1/14/2011	Phone call with Freehling re: comment letter	RIM	0.50
1/14/2011	Revise comment letter; phone call with Freehling; proofread letter	RIM	0.50
1/14/2011	Review comment letters from DRA and other parties; office conference with Cort re: comment letter	RIM	0.40
1/18/2011	Review email from Vote Solar	COOR	0.10
1/18/2011	Review email re: meeting w/Vote Solar from other groups	COOR	0.10
1/18/2011	Voicemail and phone call with Pingle re: scheduling meeting	PW	0.10
1/18/2011	Phone call with Metropulos re: LTTP	PW	0.20
1/19/2011	Phone call with Cox re: Vote Solar	COOR	0.10
1/19/2011	Email to Foley at Vote Solar re: meeting	COOR	0.10
1/19/2011	Email to clients re: Vote Solar	COOR	0.10
1/19/2011	Review parties' comments on integration models	RIM	0.70
1/19/2011	Review parties' comments on integration models	RIM	2.00
1/25/2011	Review ALJ orders related to Track II; legal research re: statutory authority; take notes for client meeting	PW	1.60
1/26/2011	Phone call with Behles re: IEP motion & LTTP schedule	COOR	0.20
1/26/2011	Review 12/3/10 scoping order & related material	PW	1.00
1/26/2011	Review Independent Energy Producers' motion	PW	0.30
1/26/2011	Review reply comments from Turn, Fit, Reid	RIM	0.40
1/26/2011	Review PG&E RIM reply comments	RIM	0.20
1/26/2011	Review reply comments of additional parties	RIM	0.30

INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM OF SIERRA CLUB CALIFORNIA: R.10 05 006
WILLIAM ROSTOV

1/28/2011	Email w/Behles	COOR	0.10
1/31/2011	Review CAISO reply comments on its model	RIM	0.30
2/1/2011	Email w/Levinson re: client meeting	PW	0.30
2/1/2011	Phone call with Freehling re: bundled plans	BP	0.20
2/2/2011	Email from Pingle; revise agenda	PW	0.10
2/2/2011	Phone call with Levinson re: case status & strategy	PW	0.70
2/2/2011	Office conference with Cort re: call w/Levinson	PW	0.20
2/2/2011	Prepare for meeting w/clients; review relevant documents; review JEP Motion & utilities' response	PW	1.50
2/3/2011	Prepare for meeting w/clients; office conference with Cort re: meeting	PW	1.30
2/3/2011	Meeting w/clients re: case strategy	PW	4.00
2/7/2011	Review Pacific Environmental filing re: JEP motion and related documents; office conference with Cort re: case & motion; draft response to motion; voicemail and email to Behles	PW	6.00
2/8/2011	Phone call with Behles re: motion	COOR	0.30
2/8/2011	Voicemail and email for Freehling	PW	0.10
2/8/2011	Revise and draft opposition to JEP motion	PW	3.00
2/8/2011	Review SCE motion re: scheduled & subsequent emails from SCE re: expedition of response	PW	0.30
2/8/2011	Revise response to JEP motion	PW	1.40
2/9/2011	Office conference with Cort re: response & meeting w/other groups	COOR	0.20
2/9/2011	Phone call with Pingle re: meeting w/other groups; email w/Cox	COOR	0.10
2/9/2011	Revise response to JEP motion & email to clients	PW	0.70
2/9/2011	Review PG&E response re: schedule	PW	0.20
2/9/2011	Phone call with Freehling re: response to JEP motion	PW	0.10
2/9/2011	Revise response to JEP motion	PW	0.70
2/9/2011	Revise and draft response to JEP motion	PW	0.80
2/9/2011	Revise response to JEP motion	PW	0.30
2/10/2011	Phone call with Levinson re: meeting last week and meeting w/Pacific Environment	COOR	0.30
2/10/2011	Meeting w/Pacific Environment, Clean Coalition, and CBE; post meeting with Cort	COOR	3.50
2/10/2011	Revise response to JEP motion	PW	0.80
2/10/2011	Review ALJ scoping memo	PW	0.20
2/10/2011	Review email from Freehling	PW	0.20
2/10/2011	Phone call with Freehling re: response to JEP motion	PW	0.40
2/10/2011	Revise response to JEP motion; check cites	PW	0.80
2/14/2011	Revise response; email to clients	PW	0.60
2/14/2011	Revise and draft response to SCE scheduling motion	PW	2.00
2/14/2011	Review SCE motion and PG&E response	PW	0.20
2/14/2011	Revise response to SCE motion	PW	1.80
2/15/2011	Phone call with Behlis re: response strategy & dates	COOR	0.30
2/15/2011	Phone call with Freehling re: response	PW	0.30
2/16/2011	Phone call with Pingle re: case issues	PW	0.10
2/16/2011	Draft PHC statement; review prder	PW	1.30
2/16/2011	Phone call with Freehling re: PHC statement & CAM	PW	0.30

INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM OF SIERRA CLUB CALIFORNIA: R.10 05 006
WILLIAM ROSTOV

2/16/2011	Review PHC statements from Dec.; review ALJ recent order; prepare for PHC	PW	1.10
2/17/2011	Draft and revise PHC statement; email to clients re: statement	PW	1.70
2/17/2011	Office conference with Cort re: PHC statement & minutes	PW	0.10
2/18/2011	Phone call with Stewart re: case	PW	0.20
2/18/2011	Email from Stewart; revise brief	PW	0.10
2/18/2011	Revise PHC statement & office conference with Baird	PW	0.20
2/18/2011	Prepare for PHC; organize documents; legal research re: code related to computer models	PW	1.50
2/27/2011	Review PHC statements; prepare for PHC; review IEP motion & responses; review LNBL report and comments on CA ISO model	PW	2.10
2/28/2011	Pre meeting with Pacific Environment & GGU law clinic re: PHC	COOR	0.20
2/28/2011	Post hearing conversations w/other parties	COOR	0.50
2/28/2011	Phone call with Behles re: PHC	COOR	0.30
2/28/2011	Prepare for PHC; review relevant documents	PW	1.50
2/28/2011	Prepare for PHC; review relevant documents	PW	0.50
2/28/2011	Attend PHC at PUC; (arrive early 1.3)	PW	2.80
3/2/2011	Email update to clients re: prehearing conference; review notes and relevant orders	PW	2.50
3/10/2011	Prepare for Vote Solar Meeting; review relevant material	COOR	1.00
3/10/2011	Meeting w/Vote Solar, Clean Coalition, GGU & solar developers	COOR	3.40
3/11/2011	Draft email to clients re: case status and schedule; review ALJ order & schedule	PW	2.00
3/14/2011	Draft discovery and review submittals from IOUs	BP	1.50
3/15/2011	Email w/Calpine representative; review their comment to ISO on renewables integration	COOR	0.30
3/15/2011	Meeting with Cort & Calpine re: renewables integration	COOR	1.00
3/28/2011	Phone call with Behles re: case status & strategy	COOR	0.30
3/28/2011	Office conference with Cort re: case status & bundled plans	BP	0.30
3/29/2011	Review ALJ Allen ruling	PW	0.20
3/29/2011	Office conference with Cort re: ALJ Allen ruling	PW	0.10
3/30/2011	SCE info session on bundled plans	BP	2.60
3/30/2011	Review SCE Bundled Plan Filing	BP	1.50
4/1/2011	Email to Cort re: SCE & confidential info	BP	0.20
4/5/2011	Review PG&E filing	BP	1.00
4/15/2011	Review of SDG&E testimony & plan	BP	1.00
4/15/2011	Review PG&E redline	BP	1.00
4/15/2011	Review track 1 orders and compare to SCE filing	BP	0.50
4/18/2011	Office conference with Cort re: LTP strategy	PW	0.40
4/18/2011	Phone call with Freehling re: testimony & strategy	BP	0.30
4/18/2011	Review PG&E bundled plans and presentation	BP	2.50
4/19/2011	Meeting w/Cort re: testimony; phone call with Cort, Pingle re: testimony	BP	1.00
4/19/2011	Post meeting debrief w/Cort	BP	0.20
4/20/2011	Review model protection order; email from SCE; compare SCE's proposed agreement to protective order; email to Cort	BP	0.70
4/20/2011	Review Pingle's SCE notes	BP	0.20
4/21/2011	Email from other parties re: testimony; email w/Lazerow	COOR	0.30

INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM OF SIERRA CLUB CALIFORNIA: R.10 05 006
WILLIAM ROSTOV

4/21/2011	Review Scoping Orders & SCE testimony	BP	1.50
4/21/2011	Phone call with Cort, Pingle & Powers re: strategy	BP	0.80
4/27/2011	Phone call with Behles	COOR	0.20
4/27/2011	Phone call with Cort & Powers re: SCE testimony	BP	1.00
4/27/2011	Phone call with Freehling re: bundled plans	BP	0.20
4/29/2011	Review Track II orders; SCE testimony; and bundled plan	BP	2.50
4/29/2011	Review email from IOU re: track; review SCE testimony & bundled plan	BP	2.00
5/2/2011	Email from Lazerow & Behlis re: solar PV	COOR	0.30
5/2/2011	Errata filing; email to clients	BP	0.20
5/3/2011	WC Behles re: LTPP testimony	COOR	0.40
5/3/2011	CW Lazerow re: SCE testimony	COOR	0.50
5/3/2011	CW Freehling re: PG&E bundled plans	BP	1.20
5/3/2011	R PG&E testimony	BP	0.50
5/5/2011	R submitted testimony	BP	4.00
5/10/2011	Lunch with Behlis and Lazerow; discuss LTPP	COOR	1.00
5/10/2011	Post workshop discussions	COOR	0.40
5/10/2011	Drive back to Bay Area with Behlis and Lazerow ^{LL} LTPP strategy	COOR	1.00
5/10/2011	ISO/Utility workshop on modeling runs	RIM	4.80
5/11/2011	CW Pingle re: strategy	PW	0.20
5/11/2011	CW Mainland re: LTPP strategy	PW	0.10
5/12/2011	Email Stewart re: strategy	PW	0.20
5/12/2011	R email from Williams re: common briefing outline	PW	0.20
5/13/2011	R email from Reid	PW	0.20
5/13/2011	P for conf. call with all parties	PW	0.20
5/13/2011	Conf. call w/all parties re: Track II	PW	0.80
5/13/2011	Email re: joint outline	PW	0.20
5/17/2011	CW Cort, Pingle, Freehling and Powers re: strategy	PW	1.00
5/20/2011	CW Behles re: LTPP strategy	COOR	0.30
5/20/2011	R AL emails	PW	0.20
5/23/2011	pre mtg. w/PE	COOR	0.30
5/23/2011	P for PUC hearing; R plans for confidentiality of capacity numbers; R motion to strike and response	PW	1.50
5/23/2011	Track II hearing;	PW	1.70
5/24/2011	arrive early at PUC for hearing; mtg. w/Behlis & Williams	COOR	0.50
5/24/2011	R email Middlekauf; forward to Cort	COOR	0.10
5/24/2011	CW Behlis re: response to Middlekauf email	COOR	0.10
5/24/2011	Email to Middlekauf	COOR	0.10
5/24/2011	Track II hearing on ISO modeling	RIM	2.50
5/24/2011	R motion and related pleadings for ISO/utilites motion	BP	0.40
5/24/2011	OCW Cort re: hearing	BP	0.20
5/24/2011	DR outline for brief; R testimony	BP	1.10
5/25/2011	email Middlekauf and Behles re: mtg	COOR	0.10
5/25/2011	RV outline for clients; email to Cort	BP	0.30
5/25/2011	Email w/SCE re: confidential material	BP	0.10
5/25/2011	Discovery requests for PG&E	BP	1.00
5/25/2011	Discovery requests for SCE and SDDG&E	BP	0.50
5/26/2011	Email w/SCE and SDG&E re: discovery service	BP	0.10

INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM OF SIERRA CLUB CALIFORNIA: R.10 05 006
WILLIAM ROSTOV

5/26/2011	CW Freehling re: PG&E discovery	BP	0.20
5/26/2011	Review Freehling changes to discovery; Revise discovery; CW Freehling; email to PG&E lawyer	BP	1.10
5/26/2011	Revise discovery request emails; send to SCE and SDG&E	BP	0.20
5/27/2011	Email with Middlekauff re: mtg. with PG&E	COOR	0.10
5/27/2011	VM from SDG&E re: discovery	BP	0.10
5/27/2011	emails re: discovery requests	BP	0.10
5/27/2011	Email from SDG&E re: discovery response	BP	0.10
6/3/2011	Review DRA motion re: timing	PW	0.20
6/6/2011	Email with Behlis re: DRA motion strategy	COOR	0.20
6/8/2011	RALJ order on schedule; DRA motion and related filings	PW	0.60
6/9/2011	DR track II brief; R relevant testimony	BP	1.50
6/9/2011	CW Robert Freehling re: Track II brief	BP	0.10
6/9/2011	R PG&E discovery answers; R testimony; DR track II brief	BP	1.50
6/10/2011	Briefly review PG&E discovery responses to Cort and Freehling	BP	0.30
6/13/2011	Draft Track II brief; R relevant email and testimony	BP	3.50
6/13/2011	CW Freehling re: Track II brief	BP	0.40
6/14/2011	DR Brief; RALJ orders	BP	4.50
6/16/2011	DR brief; R testimony from other parties	BP	12.00
6/16/2011	CW Pingle re: Track II brief	BP	0.10
6/17/2011	RV brief; DR last section; email clients; CW Pingle; R Pingle's suggested changes; cite check and RV; OCW Rakestraw re: proofreading; Proofread; OCW Rakestraw re: his proposed changes; R his changes	BP	6.40
6/17/2011	R Freehling's edits; CW Robert; RV brief; R final draft	BP	0.70
6/22/2011	R Track II briefs	BP	1.00
6/24/2011	R PG&E Track II brief; notes for reply	BP	0.70
6/24/2011	R PG&E Track II brief and other briefs; organize argument	BP	1.00
6/26/2011	R opening briefs from other parties	BP	0.70
6/27/2011	CW Behles re: Track II Briefing	COOR	0.20
6/27/2011	DR Reply Brief	BP	2.00
6/27/2011	DR Reply	BP	0.70
6/27/2011	CW Freehling and Cort re: Track I and Track III issues	I&III	0.40
6/28/2011	DR Reply Brief	BP	2.00
6/28/2011	DR Brief	BP	0.50
6/29/2011	Draft reply brief; multi CW Freehling re: SCE issues; incorporate R Freehling arguments into brief	BP	9.10
6/30/2011	CW Freehling re: his edits to brief	BP	0.20
6/30/2011	R and RV Reply Brief; incorporate edits from Freehling; Jackson and Rakestraw	BP	1.50
7/7/2011	Email with Cox re: meeting with DRA and other groups	COOR	0.10
7/7/2011	VM from Foley re: Track I, left voicemail for Foley	COOR	0.10
7/11/2011	post ISO/IOU workshop discussions with other parties	COOR	0.60
7/11/2011	ISO/IOU workshop on Track I Testimony	I&III	2.70
7/14/2011	Pre meeting with Cort re: call with client and expert	PW	0.20
7/14/2011	CW Cort; Pingle and Freehling	I&III	1.00
7/19/2011	Mtg. with DRA; Pacific Environment; TURN and CBE; post mtg discussions with participants	COOR	2.50

INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM OF SIERRA CLUB CALIFORNIA: R.10 105 1006
WILLIAM ROSTOV

7/21/2011	OCW-Cort re: strategy and coordination	Settlement	0.20
7/22/2011	CW-Freehling and Cort re: Track I settlement	Settlement	1.00
7/22/2011	CW-Cort re: settlement conf. and coordination	Settlement	0.10
7/22/2011	R-emails from DRA re potential settlement	Settlement	0.10
7/22/2011	CW-Cort re: DRA email and possible settlement email to clients	Settlement	0.20
7/22/2011	Email Metropulos and Cort re: settlement conf.	Settlement	0.10
7/28/2011	R-draft settlement agreement; email clients	Settlement	0.30
7/28/2011	R-emails re: settlement agreement language	Settlement	0.20
7/28/2011	CW-Behles re: settlement agreement issues	Settlement	0.40
7/28/2011	R-emails re: settlement	Settlement	0.20
7/28/2011	OCW-Cort re: status of settlement and strategy	Settlement	0.20
7/28/2011	CW-some parties re: settlement talks	Settlement	0.90
7/29/2011	P for settlement mtg.; R and edit offer	Settlement	0.80
7/29/2011	VM from Freehling	Settlement	0.10
7/29/2011	Mtg. w/clients re: offer	Settlement	1.30
7/29/2011	CW P.Cort re: edits to settlement offer	Settlement	0.30
7/29/2011	Pre settlement mtg. with Behlis and then Turn	Settlement	0.30
7/29/2011	Settlement meeting	Settlement	3.50
7/31/2011	R-email for PG&E re: settlement conf.	Settlement	0.30
8/1/2011	Email to clients re: draft agreement	Settlement	0.20
8/1/2011	OCW-Cort re: settlement and strategy	Settlement	0.20
8/1/2011	R-draft agreement and motion	Settlement	0.20
8/1/2011	CW-Cort, Pingle and Metropulos re: agreement	Settlement	0.70
8/1/2011	CW-Martinez-NRDC re: settlement agreement issues	Settlement	0.10
8/1/2011	R-email from DRA and its edis	Settlement	0.10
8/1/2011	R-email and edits from CEERT	Settlement	0.10
8/1/2011	R-email on agreement from TURN and Vote Solar	Settlement	0.20
8/2/2011	VM from Behles; Email from Cort; R ISO and Gen on proposals; R emails from other parties	Settlement	0.40
8/2/2011	R-emails and edits to settlement agreement from other parties	Settlement	0.30
8/2/2011	Settlement meeting by phone	Settlement	4.20
8/3/2011	R settlement agreement; related emails; email clients	Settlement	0.40
8/3/2011	OCW-Cort re: settlement agreement	Settlement	0.10
8/4/2011	Respond to email re: participation in today's ALJ mtg.; R case emails	PW	0.20
8/4/2011	R-email from ALJ re: all party call	Settlement	0.10
8/4/2011	CW-Parties and ALJ re: settlement	Settlement	0.80
8/4/2011	OCW-Cort re: result of call with ALJ and parties	Settlement	0.20
8/8/2011	CW-Parties re: hearings	PW	0.60
8/8/2011	OCW-Cort re: result of call with ALJ and parties	PW	0.20
8/8/2011	R filings from non IOUs re: Track I and Track II	I&III	2.00
8/8/2011	R-DRA, PE and IOU testimony	I&III	1.50
8/9/2011	R IOU testimony; fill out cross-examination matrix; OCW-Cort re: cross-examination; email matrix to PG&E	PW	1.60
8/9/2011	R-PG&E Matrix	PW	0.10
8/11/2011	LTP Hearing and mtg. w/parties re: schedule	PW	1.80
8/12/2011	Prepar cross for hearings; OCW-P.Cort re: GHG cross; R relevant commission documents and rules	I&III	5.00

INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM OF SIERRA CLUB CALIFORNIA: R.10 05 006
WILLIAM ROSTOV

8/12/2011	R-Cort's outline	I&JIII	0.20
8/12/2011	OCW-Cort re: cross	I&JIII	0.20
8/14/2011	Preparing SCE cross for hearings;	I&JIII	3.50
8/14/2011	Review document related to cross; Preparing SCE cross for hearings;	I&JIII	0.70
8/15/2011	lunch and discussion with env. group representatives re: hearing	COOR	1.00
8/15/2011	Confer with Cort prior to hearing	I&JIII	0.10
8/15/2011	LTP Hearing	I&JIII	2.00
8/15/2011	Prepare for SCE GHG and PRG, E cross; OCW-Cort re: cross	I&JIII	4.50
8/16/2011	LTP Hearings including SCE cross	I&JIII	5.20
8/17/2011	Post hearing discussion with Behles	COOR	0.20
8/17/2011	LTP Hearing include SCE and SDG&E PRG, E cross;	I&JIII	5.00
8/17/2011	OCW-Cort re: GHG cross; P-GHG cross for SDG&E and PG&E PRG cross	I&JIII	2.80
8/18/2011	Post hearing procedural question for ALJ Allen, Discussion with DRA and Behles, discussion with Behles	COOR	0.30
8/18/2011	R and Prepare cross	I&JIII	0.30
8/18/2011	R hearing transcripts of previous cross	I&JIII	0.70
8/18/2011	R SDG&E testimony	I&JIII	0.40
8/18/2011	Pre hearing conf. with Cort	I&JIII	0.10
8/18/2011	LTP Hearing (PG&E PRG cross and SDG&E GHG cross)	I&JIII	2.10
8/18/2011	OCW-Cort re: hearing	I&JIII	0.10
8/19/2011	OCW-Cort re: GHG argument	I&JIII	0.20
8/30/2011	OCW-Cort re: mtg. with Metropulos; TCW-Cort, Metropulos and Endicott; post call discussion with Cort	I&JIII	0.60
9/9/2011	R draft GHG section	I&JIII	0.50
9/9/2011	OCW-Cort re: GHG San Diego and PRG sections	I&JIII	0.20
9/9/2011	Re review GHG section; checking scoping memo; OCW-Cort re: section	I&JIII	0.60
9/12/2011	R-DR Brief	I&JIII	0.50
9/13/2011	RV Dr Brief; email to Metropulos re: draft	I&JIII	0.60
9/13/2011	OCW-Cort re: comments on draft and next steps	I&JIII	0.10
9/14/2011	CW Metropulos re: draft brief; OCW-Cort re: Jim's comments	I&JIII	0.20
9/15/2011	R Draft Track I and Track III opening brief	I&JIII	0.50
9/15/2011	OCW-Cort re: comments on brief	I&JIII	0.20
9/21/2011	CW Behles re: opening brief	COOR	0.30
9/22/2011	CW Behles re: reply brief issues	COOR	0.60
9/22/2011	OCW-Cort re: CEQA and reply brief issues	I&JIII	0.10
9/22/2011	OCW-Cort re: CEQA arg.; OCW-Cort and Peesapati re: CEQA arg.; OCW Peesapati re: arg.; R-ARB's FED	I&JIII	1.20
10/4/2011	R reply briefs; OCW-Cort re: briefs	I&JIII	1.50
11/22/2011	Email Pingle and clients re: proposed decision	PW	0.30
11/22/2011	R Proposed Track II decision; note down thoughts on decision	BP	1.20
11/23/2011	R Proposed Track II decision and related briefs; outline draft	BP	2.00
11/27/2011	Work on comment on Track II	BP	1.50
11/28/2011	CW Behles re: comments on proposed Track II decision	COOR	0.50
11/28/2011	DR Comment on Proposed Decision	BP	5.10
11/29/2011	DR Comment on Proposed Decision	BP	4.50
11/29/2011	Email clients re: review of comments	BP	0.20
11/30/2011	RV comment; email to clients	BP	1.00

INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM OF SIERRA CLUB CALIFORNIA: R.10 05 006
WILLIAM ROSTOV

11/30/2011	CW-Freehling re: comment	BP	0.20
11/30/2011	CW-Freehling re: his comments and edits	BP	0.20
11/30/2011	RV comment;	BP	1.00
11/30/2011	CW-Pingle re: comment	BP	0.20
11/30/2011	RV and finalize document	BP	0.80
12/2/2011	CW-Williams re: PE and Sierra Club replies	COOR	0.10
12/2/2011	R-Opening Brief Filings	BP	2.00
12/4/2011	Review IOU filings and outline comment	BP	1.00
12/5/2011	DR Reply Brief	BP	1.20
12/5/2011	R final document; including edits from Baird; RV	BP	0.30
12/5/2011	CW-Freehling re: Reply;	BP	0.50
12/5/2011	DR Reply Brief	BP	1.70
12/5/2011	DR Reply	BP	0.30
12/5/2011	R other parties filings	BP	0.30
12/5/2011	CW-Freehling re: Reply; email relevant filings	BP	0.20
12/5/2011	R Freehling's edits; RV Reply; two TCW-Freehling re: edits	BP	0.80
12/5/2011	OCW Cort re: Reply Brief	BP	0.30
12/15/2011	Email with Cox re: Track I decision and ex parte's; Review proposed final decision; email Cort the decision	COOR	0.40
12/16/2011	Email with Cox re: whether we should do ex parte	COOR	0.30
12/20/2011	CW-Cox re: strategy and whether to set up an ex parte meeting	COOR	0.40
	TOTAL 2011		295.10
2/21/2012	skim Track I and Track II order	I&III	0.30
2/21/2012	Read the proposed order closer	I&III	0.50
2/21/2012	OCW Cort re: decision	I&III	0.20
2/22/2012	CW Behlre: track I decision	COOR	0.30
3/7/2012	CW Behlre: compensation request (.1) and re: comments on PD (.2)	COOR	0.30
3/20/2012	Review reply comments; OCW Cort re: comments and all party meeting	I&III	1.00
3/21/2012	CW Behlre: all party meeting strategy	COOR	0.40
3/21/2012	Text to Shana Lazerow re: strategy meeting re: all party meeting	COOR	0.10
3/21/2012	Review reply comments;	I&III	1.00
3/22/2012	CW Lazerow re: all party meeting	COOR	0.20
3/22/2012	CW Lazerow re: all party meeting	COOR	0.40
3/25/2012	Prepare for all party meeting; R PD and parties' comments	I&III	1.00
3/26/2012	Pre meeting with Pacific Environment and CBE and arrive before	COOR	0.50
3/26/2012	Draft email to clients re: all party meeting	PW	0.30
3/26/2012	Prepare for all party meeting	I&III	0.20
3/26/2012	All party meeting	I&III	2.50
	TOTAL 2012		9.20
	WILLIAM ROSTOV TOTAL		434.70

EXPLANATION OF ABBREVIATIONS

DR	draft
OCW	office conference with
R	review
RV	revise
TCW	telephone conference with

INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM OF SIERRA CLUB CALIFORNIA: R.10 05 006
ROBERT FREEHLING

Date	Description	Issue	Hours
6/21/2010	Review filing comments for procurement standards, discuss with Rostov, edit & recommendations	PA	1.50
7/1/2010	Read CPUC efficiency powerpoint and data, read efficiency questions for LTPP, review part of CEC uncommitted EE Committee report	PA	2.50
7/2/2010	Read, edit, analysis, and make comments on Rostov filing for efficiency track	PA	2.00
7/6/2010	Spreadsheet analysis of cost of generation in RETI database, sort by generation type and in state/out of state, transmission v. LCOE only, write up results and send to Cort. Organize and explain replies to environmental ranking from Taylor; email to Cort on this	PA	3.00
7/8/2010	Read and make comments on filing for RPS that were prepared by Cort, review scenarios, analysis of transmission issue with "environmentally constrained" scenario, find references and citations, review and forward comments from Dickerson to Cort with my comments	PA	2.00
7/12/2010	Read PG&E matrix & Stewart's summary of key Sierra Club points on this, edit and supplemental analysis including CEC forecast & spreadsheet modeling for reply brief to PG&E	PA	1.50
7/16/2010	Read, edit, find background documentation and perform spreadsheet analysis on SCE's transmission needs, and add written comments on RPS reply brief, & phone conversation with Cort	PA	2.00
9/7/2010	Meeting 12 to 4 pm in Oakland, discuss approach to CPUC LTPP with Earthjustice lawyers & Sierra Club staff and volunteer members	PW	4.00
9/20/2010	Read CPUC staff data needs proposal, review CAISO 84 slide presentation, spreadsheet analysis of resources, review, edit, and write comments in filing for Sierra Club comments on renewable integration model	PA	6.00
10/7/2010	Read draft comments on integration from Cort, discuss on phone, edit and add extensive comments to reply brief	PA	4.00
11/14/2010	Studying and analysis of CREZ project database; sorted by technologies and in state v. out of state to determine relative cost and value, range and cost of transmission, effect of dg resources, availability and cost of base load resources v. peak, etc.	PA	2.50
12/4/2010	Preliminary review of scoping ruling and accompanying attachments including portfolios compared to draft portfolios, and utility demand forecasts; wrote up brief email review for Sierra Club/Earthjustice LTPP team	PW	4.50

INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM OF SIERRA CLUB CALIFORNIA: R.10 05 006
ROBERT FREEHLING

12/15/2010	Read though full scoping decision document in more detail in preparation for phone discussion with Rostov of Earthjustice; followed by phone meeting discussion about issues of concern in LTTP and planning how to proceed	PW	2.00
	TOTAL 2010		37.50
1/7/2011	Attended RPS Calculator workshop by telephone and webex (9:30 am to 12:30 pm)	PA	3.00
1/8/2011	Explored, worked with and tested scenarios on RPS calculator; researched background on cost assumptions on solar PV, found potential issues with calculator regarding DG PV	PA	2.00
1/12/2011	Research background on and update strategic issues & goals regarding LTTP, review planning assumptions on demand and demand side resources, prepare update document for Sierra Club group working on LTTP; discussion w/Pingle on Sierra Club LTTP team regarding strategic goals and topics for future filings	PW	2.50
1/13/2011	Read scoping memo for bundled plans, review CPUC documents relating to input on integration model, review BNL report on integration models, review and edit Sierra Club comments on integration models.	RIM	1.50
1/14/2011	Read and assist in final edit of integration model workshop filing w/Rostov of Earthjustice	RIM	1.00
2/3/2011	Meeting at Earthjustice with Sierra Club to discuss LTTP	PW	4.00
2/9/2011	Read and edit reply comments to independent energy producers (1 hr); review planning scenarios and scoping memo (0.5 hr)	PW	1.50
2/10/2011	Phone meeting with Earthjustice and other environmental parties; 1 pm to 4 pm	COOR	3.00
2/15/2011	Review and edit of Sierra Club filing regarding SCE; & discussion w/Earthjustice lawyer	PW	0.25
5/3/2011	Review & analysis of PG&E bundled plan	BP	2.00
5/26/2011	Prepare list of questions for data request to PG&E	BP	1.00
6/17/2011	Review and edit draft Track II opening brief of Sierra Club w/Earthjustice	BP	1.00
6/29/2011	Review of efficiency planning assumptions in SCE's bundled plan; write up of analysis	BP	2.00
6/30/2011	Review and edit Track II reply brief; discuss with Earthjustice lawyer on phone; search references	BP	1.50
7/22/2011	Call with Rostov and Cort re: Track II settlement	Settlement	1.00
7/29/2011	Phone meeting w/Earthjustice; read and evaluate and minor edits to Track II settlement agreement document	Settlement	0.75
8/1/2011	Review Calpine redline version of Track II settlement agreement document	Settlement	0.50
11/30/2011	Review & edit Phase II comments from Earthjustice lawyer (Rostov), and phone discussion	BP	1.00
12/5/2011	Review PG&E's open brief on decision for LTTP; read Earthjustice reply, edited & added argument rebutting PG&E regarding loading order	BP	1.00
	TOTAL 2011		30.50
	ROBERT FREEHLING TOTAL		68.00

INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM OF SIERRA CLUB CALIFORNIA: R.10 105 006
PAUL CORT CLAIM PREPARATION

Date	Description	Hours
6/6/2012	Prepare compensation request	4.00
6/7/2012	Prepare compensation request	5.50
6/8/2012	Prepare compensation request	5.00
6/10/2012	Prepare compensation request	1.80
6/12/2012	Prepare compensation request	3.00
	PAUL CORT CLAIM PREPARATION TOTAL	19.30

INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM OF SIERRA CLUB CALIFORNIA: R.10 05 006
WILLIAM ROSTOV CLAIM PREPARATION

Date	Description	Hours
6/8/2012	Review and delete hours; exercise billing judgment	1.80
6/8/2012	Review hours and compare timesheets; OCW Cort re: compensation request	1.30
6/12/2012	Review category breakdown; reexamine some hours; recategorize	0.40
6/14/2012	Work on compensation request; filling in sections that P. Cort had not worked on; recategorize and reviewing hours; OCW P. Cort re: status of request	3.00
6/15/2012	Draft sections of Compensation Form; OCW J. Baird re: getting the documentation together	5.00
	WILLIAM ROSTOV CLAIM PREPARATION TOTAL	11.50