

Tam Hunt				Ted Ko				Sahm White				Craig Lewis			
<i>CREST reform (R. 11-05-005)</i>				<i>CREST reform (R. 11-05-005)</i>				<i>CREST reform (R. 11-05-005)</i>				<i>CREST reform (R. 11-05-005)</i>			
Task	Issue	Date	Hours	Task	Issue	Date	Hours	Task	Issue	Date	Hours	Task	Issue	Date	Hours
Draft CREST motion	Address CREST contract issues	8/1/2011	2.5	Preparing Motion for CREST Reform	Address CREST contract issues	8/5/2011	1.5	Weekly policy calls with Clean Coalition team discussing CREST reform efforts	Address CREST contract issues	August, Sept., Oct., 2011	16	Review draft CREST motion	Address CREST contract issues	8/10/2011	2
Draft CREST motion	Address CREST contract issues	8/8/2011	2.25	Preparing Motion for CREST Reform	Address CREST contract issues	8/8/2011	2			2011 CREST total	16	Review draft CREST motion	Address CREST contract issues	8/15/2011	1.5
Discuss CREST motion with internal team	Address CREST contract issues	8/11/2011	1	Preparing Motion for CREST Reform	Address CREST contract issues	8/10/2011	0.5			Internal planning for potential CREST compromise	Address CREST contract issues	9/19/2011	1		
Draft CREST motion and discuss with internal team	Address CREST contract issues	8/12/2011	1.75	Preparing Motion for CREST Reform	Address CREST contract issues	8/12/2011	2.5			Draft proposed criteria for CREST compromise	Address CREST contract issues	9/30/2011	2		
Draft and submit CREST motion	Address CREST contract issues	8/16/2011	1.5	Preparing Motion for CREST Reform	Address CREST contract issues	8/15/2011	2	<i>RAM program (R. 08-08-009)</i>	Design of new RAM program	9/7/2010	1.5	CREST compromise discussions w Sunlight Partners	Address CREST contract issues	10/3/2011	1.5
Develop CREST Compromise with SCE	Address CREST contract issues	9/19/2011	1.5	Preparing Motion for CREST Reform	Address CREST contract issues	8/16/2011	1.25			planning meeting	9/9/2010	5.25	CREST compromise discussions w SCE et al	Address CREST contract issues	10/4/2011
Develop CREST Compromise with SCE	Address CREST contract issues	9/29/2011	2	Developing CREST Compromise with SCE	Address CREST contract issues	9/19/2011	1.5	Position research	9/20/2010	6.25	Review CREST compromise materials from SCE et al and provide response	Address CREST contract issues	10/7/2011	2	
Draft opening comments on CREST motion PD (R.11-05-005)	Address CREST contract issues	10/28/2011	2.5	Developing CREST Compromise with SCE	Address CREST contract issues	9/29/2011	2	Comment research	9/22/2010	5	2011 CREST total	12			
Ex parte with Commissioners on CREST PD	Address CREST contract issues	11/3/2011	1.75	Draft Comments on CREST PD	Address CREST contract issues	10/31/2011	0.75	comment research & rough draft	9/23/2010	9					
Draft reply comments on CREST motion PD (R.11-05-005)	Address CREST contract issues	11/6/2011	2.5	Ex parte with Commissioners on CREST PD	Address CREST contract issues	11/3/2011	1.75	comment rough draft	9/24/2010	8.75	<i>RAM program (R. 08-08-009)</i>	Review draft RAM comments	Design of new RAM program	9/27/2010	2.5
Prepare comp request		12/26/2011	3.5	Draft CREST PD reply comments	Address CREST contract issues	11/4/2011	1.25	comment draft	9/27/2010	5		Review draft RAM Reply comments	Design of new RAM program	10/3/2010	1.5
		2011 CREST total	22.75	Edit CREST PD reply comments	Address CREST contract issues	11/6/2011	0.5	comment final draft	9/28/2010	7	2010 RAM total	4			
						2011 CREST total	17.5	review and summary of party comments							

<i>RAM program (R. 08-08-009)</i>				<i>RAM program (R. 08-08-009)</i>						2010 RAM total		47.75		total comp request for Craig Lewis		16	
Draft RAM PD opening comments	Design of new RAM program (many elements involved in each set of comments)	9/21/2010	5.5	(Ko's 2009 hours are newly added for our revised comp request as of Aug. 7, 2012)				Draft comments on RAM advice letters	Design of new RAM program	3/14/2011	5.5						
Revised RAM PD opening comments	Design of new RAM program	9/23/2010	2.25	Comments Coordination mtg hosted by PG&E	Staff Proposal on FIT Pricing	9/25/2009	6.5	Draft comments on RAM advice letters	Design of new RAM program	3/16/2011	6						
Revised RAM PD opening comments	Design of new RAM program	9/24/2010	2	Review Staff Proposal	Staff Proposal on FIT Pricing	8/28/2009	2.25					2011 RAM total	11.5				
Revised RAM PD opening comments	Design of new RAM program	9/26/2010	1.5	Prepare comments on Staff Proposal	Staff Proposal on FIT Pricing	9/7/2009	3					2011 total for Sahn White	27.5				
Revised and filed RAM PD opening comments	Design of new RAM program	9/27/2010	1.5	Prepare comments on Staff Proposal "Pre-Work" for comments coordination meeting	Staff Proposal on FIT Pricing	9/14/2009	4.5					Total comp request for Sahn White	91.25				
Draft and file RAM PD reply comments	Design of new RAM program	10/5/2010	5.5	PUC presentation of Staff Proposal	Staff Proposal on FIT Pricing	9/24/2009	2.75										
		2010 RAM total	18.25	Update comments based on recent workshops	Staff Proposal on FIT Pricing	10/2/2009	2										
Draft comments on RAM advice letters	Design of new RAM program	3/1/2011	3.5	Draft full comments on Staff Proposal	Staff Proposal on FIT Pricing	10/7/2009	2.5										
Draft comments on RAM advice letters	Design of new RAM program	3/7/2011	3.75	Direct comments coordination with other parties (e.g. CalSEIA)	Staff Proposal on FIT Pricing	10/12/2009	4.25										
Draft comments on RAM advice letters	Design of new RAM program	3/10/2011	2.25	Revise full comments	Staff Proposal on FIT Pricing	10/15/2009	1.25										
Draft comments on RAM advice letters	Design of new RAM program	3/17/2011	3.25	Finalize and submit comments	Staff Proposal on FIT Pricing	10/17/2009	3.5										
		2011 RAM total	12.75			10/19/2009	1.5										
		2011 combined total	35.5									2009 RAM total	34				
Prepare comp request		12/29/2011	9.75	Collaboration with RAM parties on comments	Design of new RAM program	9/1/2010	1.5										
		1/17/2012	4.5	Collaboration with RAM parties on comments	Design of new RAM program	9/10/2010	0.75										
		Total comp hours	14.25	Collaboration with RAM parties on comments	Design of new RAM program	9/16/2010	1										
				RAM comments	Design of new RAM program	9/27/2010	3.5										
				RAM Reply comments	Design of new RAM program	10/1/2010	2										
				RAM Reply comments	Design of new RAM program	10/4/2010	3.25										
				RAM reply comments	Design of new RAM program	10/6/2010	0.5										
				RAM reply comments	Design of new RAM program	10/6/2010	0.5										

