
Randolph, Edward F.
10/24/2012 5:06:31 PM
Allen, Meredith (/0=PG&E/OU=Corporate/cn=Recipients/cn=MEAe)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:
Bee:
Subject: RE: 

Thank you.

On Oct 24, 2012, at 2:34 PM, "Allen, Meredith" <MEAe@pge.com> wrote:

> SPI let us know this morning that they agreed to $8. We are still waiting to hear back from Barclays and 
Transalta.
>
>
> PG&E is committed to protecting our customers' privacy.
> To learn more, please visit http://www.pge.coni/about/compaiiv/privacY/customer/
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