

ATTACHMENT C
Intervenor Compensation Claim of The Vote Solar Initiative
TIMES SHEETS FOR KELLY FOLEY AND ERIC GIMON

- ISSUE A. Whether additional capacity is required to meet local reliability needs in the Los Angeles Basin and Big Creek/Ventura area between 2014 and 2021, and, if so, how.
- ISSUE B. Whether flexible capacity attributes should be incorporated into a decision regarding additional capacity required to meet local reliability needs between 2014 and 2021 and, if so, how.
- ISSUE C. What assumptions concerning retirements of OTC plants should be made for the purpose of determining future local reliability needs
- ISSUE D. Whether the ISO's local capacity requirements and OTC studies should be adopted by the Commission as the basis for procurement of additional local capacity, and, if not, what should form the basis of a Commission decision.
- ISSUE E. How resources aside from conventional generation, such as uncommitted energy efficiency, demand response, energy storage and distributed generation resources should be considered in determining future local reliability needs.
- ISSUE F. General and procedural.

(to avoid duplication, denotes multiple staff time allocated pro rata, e.g. 1 hour with 2 staff = .5 hours each)

(denotes intervenor compensation related work charged at 1/3 of regular rate)

| STAFF | DATE | TASK | HOURS ISSUE A | HOURS ISSUE B | HOURS ISSUE C | HOURS ISSUE D | HOURS ISSUE E | HOURS ISSUE F | TOTAL HOURS |
|----------|----------|--|------------------|------------------|------------------|------------------|------------------|------------------|----------------|
| K. Foley | 03/28/12 | Review OIR | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.60 |
| K. Foley | 04/23/12 | Review of PHC transcript due to inability to attend PHC | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 1.80 |
| K. Foley | 05/03/12 | Attend LCR workshop | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.00 | 5.00 |
| E. Gimon | 05/03/12 | Attend LCR workshop | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.00 | 5.00 |
| K. Foley | 05/16/12 | Draft Notice of Intent to Claim Intervenor Compensation | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | | 1.00 |
| K. Foley | 06/04/12 | Meeting to develop strategy and content of Prepared Direct Testimony | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.60 |
| E. Gimon | 06/04/12 | Meeting to develop strategy and content of Prepared Direct Testimony | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.60 |
| E. Gimon | 06/15/12 | Draft Prepared Direct Testimony | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | | 1.00 |
| E. Gimon | 06/18/12 | Draft Prepared Direct Testimony | 0.10 | | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | | 0.40 |
| K. Foley | 06/25/12 | Draft Prepared Direct Testimony | 0.05 | 0.05 | 0.05 | 0.05 | 0.05 | | 0.25 |
| K. Foley | 07/09/12 | Attend PHC | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 1.80 |
| E. Gimon | 07/09/12 | Attend PHC | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 1.80 |
| K. Foley | 07/10/12 | Draft Reply Testimony | | | | 1.00 | 4.30 | | 5.30 |
| K. Foley | 07/11/12 | Meeting with T. Beach of CCC re: PRLM | | | | 0.25 | 0.75 | | 1.00 |
| E. Gimon | 07/11/12 | Meeting with T. Beach of CCC re: PRLM | | | | 0.25 | 0.75 | | 1.00 |
| E. Gimon | 07/13/12 | Draft Reply Testimony | | | | 0.40 | 1.00 | | 1.40 |
| E. Gimon | 07/18/12 | Draft Reply Testimony | | | | | 0.50 | | 0.50 |

| | | | | | | | | | | |
|----------|----------|--|------|------|------|------|------|------|------|------|
| K. Foley | 07/24/12 | Draft Reply Testimony | | | | | | 1.00 | | 1.00 |
| E. Gimon | 07/25/12 | Draft Reply Testimony | | | | | 0.25 | 0.25 | | 0.50 |
| K. Foley | 07/26/12 | Draft Reply Testimony | | | | | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 3.00 |
| K. Foley | 08/01/12 | Meeting with T. Beach of CCC re: SCE Motion to Strike PRLM | | | | | | 1.50 | | 1.50 |
| K. Foley | 08/03/12 | Draft response to SCE Motion to Strike PRLM | | | | | | 2.50 | | 2.50 |
| K. Foley | 08/07/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.25 | 5.25 |
| E. Gimon | 08/07/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | | 5.00 |
| K. Foley | 08/08/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.25 | 5.25 |
| E. Gimon | 08/08/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | | 5.00 |
| K. Foley | 08/09/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.25 | 5.25 |
| E. Gimon | 08/09/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | | 5.00 |
| K. Foley | 08/10/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.25 | 5.25 |
| E. Gimon | 08/10/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | | 5.00 |
| K. Foley | 08/13/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.25 | 5.25 |
| E. Gimon | 08/13/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | | 5.00 |
| K. Foley | 08/14/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.25 | 5.25 |
| E. Gimon | 08/14/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | | 5.00 |
| K. Foley | 08/15/12 | Attend Hearings | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.25 | 4.25 |
| E. Gimon | 08/15/12 | Attend Hearings | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.80 | | 4.00 |
| K. Foley | 08/16/12 | Attend Hearings | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.25 | 2.25 |
| E. Gimon | 08/16/12 | Attend Hearings | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | | 2.00 |
| K. Foley | 08/17/12 | Attend Hearings | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.25 | 1.25 |
| E. Gimon | 08/17/12 | Attend Hearings | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | | 1.00 |
| K. Foley | 08/29/12 | Attend ED Staff pre-meeting for Sept. 7, 2012 workshop | | | | | | 0.50 | | 0.50 |
| K. Foley | 09/04/12 | Meet with T. Beach of CCC re: slide deck preparation | | | | | | 1.00 | | 1.00 |
| K. Foley | 09/05/12 | Prepare slide deck for Sept. 7, 2012 workshop | | | | | | 3.50 | | 3.50 |
| K. Foley | 09/07/12 | Attend and present at Workshop on All Source RFOs | | | | | | 4.00 | | 4.00 |
| E. Gimon | 09/07/12 | Attend Workshop on All Source RFOs | | | | | | 4.00 | | 4.00 |
| K. Foley | 10/08/12 | Draft opening comments on All Source RFO workshop | 0.50 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 2.50 | | | 3.60 |
| K. Foley | 10/09/12 | Draft opening comments on All Source RFO workshop | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 1.00 | | | 1.40 |
| K. Foley | 11/06/12 | Draft Response to SCE Motion to Strike comments | | | | | 1.00 | 0.25 | | 1.25 |

| | | | | | | | | | |
|-------------------|----------|--|--------|--------|--------|--------|--------|-------|---------|
| K. Foley | 12/26/12 | Review PD | 1.00 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 2.00 | | 4.20 |
| K. Foley | 01/07/13 | Ex parte with Matthew Tisdale re: PD | | | | | 0.30 | | 0.30 |
| K. Foley | 01/10/13 | Ex parte with Damon Franz re: PD | | | | | 0.40 | | 0.40 |
| K. Foley | 01/10/13 | Draft notice for ex parte with Matthew Tisdale | | | | | | 0.25 | 0.25 |
| K. Foley | 01/10/13 | Phone call with Diana Lee of DRA re: PD | 0.25 | | | | 0.25 | | 0.50 |
| K. Foley | 01/11/13 | Draft notice for ex parte with Damon Franz | | | | | | 0.25 | 0.25 |
| K. Foley | 01/14/13 | Draft Opening Comments on the PD | 0.20 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.70 | | 1.20 |
| K. Foley | 01/21/13 | Draft Reply Comments on the PD | 0.30 | | | | 0.20 | | 0.50 |
| K. Foley | 02/12/13 | Review revised PD | 0.50 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 1.00 | | 2.10 |
| K. Foley | 03/11/13 | Draft Compensation Request | 1.20 | 1.20 | 1.20 | 1.20 | 2.50 | | 7.30 |
| TOTALS | | | 22.60 | 20.65 | 20.75 | 23.90 | 56.95 | 5.20 | 150.05 |
| PERCENTAGE | | | 15.06% | 13.76% | 13.83% | 15.93% | 37.95% | 3.47% | 100.00% |

ATTACHMENT C
Intervenor Compensation Claim of The Vote Solar Initiative
TIMES SHEETS FOR KELLY FOLEY

- ISSUE A. Whether additional capacity is required to meet local reliability needs in the Los Angeles Basin and Big Creek/Ventura area between 2014 and 2021, and, if so, how.
- ISSUE B. Whether flexible capacity attributes should be incorporated into a decision regarding additional capacity required to meet local reliability needs between 2014 and 2021 and, if so, how.
- ISSUE C. What assumptions concerning retirements of OTC plants should be made for the purpose of determining future local reliability needs
- ISSUE D. Whether the ISO's local capacity requirements and OTC studies should be adopted by the Commission as the basis for procurement of additional local capacity, and, if not, what should form the basis of a Commission decision.
- ISSUE E. How resources aside from conventional generation, such as uncommitted energy efficiency, demand response, energy storage and distributed generation resources should be considered in determining future local reliability needs.
- ISSUE F. General and procedural.

| | | | (to avoid duplication, denotes multiple staff time allocated pro rata, e.g. 1 hour with 2 staff = .5 hours each) | | | | | | TOTAL |
|----------|----------|--|--|---------|---------|---------|---------|---------|-------|
| | | | (denotes intervenor compensation related work charged at 1/3 of regular rate) | | | | | | |
| STAFF | DATE | TASK | ISSUE A | ISSUE B | ISSUE C | ISSUE D | ISSUE E | ISSUE F | HOURS |
| | | | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.60 |
| K. Foley | 03/28/12 | Review OIR | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 1.80 |
| K. Foley | 04/23/12 | Review of PHC transcript due to inability to attend PHC | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.00 | 5.00 |
| K. Foley | 05/03/12 | Attend LCR workshop | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | | 1.00 |
| K. Foley | 05/16/12 | Draft Notice of Intent to Claim Intervenor Compensation | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.60 |
| K. Foley | 06/04/12 | Meeting to develop strategy and content of Prepared Direct Testimony | 0.05 | 0.05 | 0.05 | 0.05 | 0.05 | | 0.25 |
| K. Foley | 06/25/12 | Draft Prepared Direct Testimony | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 1.80 |
| K. Foley | 07/09/12 | Attend PHC | | | | 1.00 | 4.30 | | 5.30 |
| K. Foley | 07/10/12 | Draft Reply Testimony | | | | 0.25 | 0.75 | | 1.00 |
| K. Foley | 07/11/12 | Meeting with T. Beach of CCC re: PRLM | | | | | 1.00 | | 1.00 |
| K. Foley | 07/24/12 | Draft Reply Testimony | | | | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 3.00 |
| K. Foley | 07/26/12 | Draft Reply Testimony | | | | | 1.50 | | 1.50 |
| K. Foley | 08/01/12 | Meeting with T. Beach of CCC re: SCE Motion to Strike PRLM | | | | | 2.50 | | 2.50 |
| K. Foley | 08/03/12 | Draft response to SCE Motion to Strike PRLM | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.25 | 5.25 |
| K. Foley | 08/07/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.25 | 5.25 |
| K. Foley | 08/08/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.25 | 5.25 |
| K. Foley | 08/09/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.25 | 5.25 |
| K. Foley | 08/10/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.25 | 5.25 |

| | | | | | | | | | |
|----------|----------|--|--------|--------|--------|--------|--------|-------|---------|
| K. Foley | 08/13/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.25 | 5.25 |
| K. Foley | 08/14/12 | Attend Hearings | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.25 | 4.25 |
| K. Foley | 08/15/12 | Attend Hearings | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.25 | 2.25 |
| K. Foley | 08/16/12 | Attend Hearings | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.25 | 1.25 |
| K. Foley | 08/17/12 | Attend Hearings | | | | | 0.50 | | 0.50 |
| K. Foley | 08/29/12 | Attend ED Staff pre-meeting for Sept. 7, 2012 workshop | | | | | 1.00 | | 1.00 |
| K. Foley | 09/04/12 | Meet with T. Beach of CCC re: slide deck preparation | | | | | 3.50 | | 3.50 |
| K. Foley | 09/05/12 | Prepare slide deck for Sept. 7, 2012 workshop | | | | | 4.00 | | 4.00 |
| K. Foley | 09/07/12 | Attend and present at Workshop on All Source RFOs | 0.50 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 2.50 | | 3.60 |
| K. Foley | 10/08/12 | Draft opening comments on All Source RFO workshop | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 1.00 | | 1.40 |
| K. Foley | 10/09/12 | Draft opening comments on All Source RFO workshop | | | | | 1.00 | 0.25 | 1.25 |
| K. Foley | 11/06/12 | Draft Response to SCE Motion to Strike comments | 1.00 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 2.00 | | 4.20 |
| K. Foley | 12/26/12 | Review PD | | | | | 0.30 | | 0.30 |
| K. Foley | 01/07/13 | Ex parte with Matthew Tisdale re: PD | | | | | 0.40 | | 0.40 |
| K. Foley | 01/10/13 | Ex parte with Damon Franz re: PD | | | | | | 0.25 | 0.25 |
| K. Foley | 01/10/13 | Draft notice for ex parte with Matthew Tisdale | 0.25 | | | | 0.25 | | 0.50 |
| K. Foley | 01/10/13 | Phone call with Diana Lee of DRA re: PD | | | | | | 0.25 | 0.25 |
| K. Foley | 01/11/13 | Draft notice for ex parte with Damon Franz | 0.20 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.70 | | 1.20 |
| K. Foley | 01/14/13 | Draft Opening Comments on the PD | 0.30 | | | | 0.20 | | 0.50 |
| K. Foley | 01/21/13 | Draft Reply Comments on the PD | 0.50 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 1.00 | | 2.10 |
| K. Foley | 02/12/13 | Review revised PD | 1.20 | 1.20 | 1.20 | 1.20 | 2.50 | | 7.30 |
| K. Foley | 03/11/13 | Draft Compensation Request | 13.50 | 11.65 | 11.65 | 13.90 | 41.35 | 4.80 | 96.85 |
| | | TOTALS | 13.94% | 12.03% | 12.03% | 14.35% | 42.69% | 4.96% | 100.00% |
| | | PERCENTAGE | | | | | | | |

ATTACHMENT C
Intervenor Compensation Claim of The Vote Solar Initiative
TIMES SHEETS FOR ERIC GIMON

- ISSUE A. Whether additional capacity is required to meet local reliability needs in the Los Angeles Basin and Big Creek/Ventura area between 2014 and 2021, and, if so, how.
- ISSUE B. Whether flexible capacity attributes should be incorporated into a decision regarding additional capacity required to meet local reliability needs between 2014 and 2021 and, if so, how.
- ISSUE C. What assumptions concerning retirements of OTC plants should be made for the purpose of determining future local reliability needs
- ISSUE D. Whether the ISO's local capacity requirements and OTC studies should be adopted by the Commission as the basis for procurement of additional local capacity, and, if not, what should form the basis of a Commission decision.
- ISSUE E. How resources aside from conventional generation, such as uncommitted energy efficiency, demand response, energy storage and distributed generation resources should be considered in determining future local reliability needs.
- ISSUE F. General and procedural.

| | | | (to avoid duplication, denotes multiple staff time allocated pro rata, e.g. 1 hour with 2 staff = .5 hours each) | | | | | | TOTAL |
|----------|----------|--|--|---------|---------|---------|---------|---------|-------|
| | | | (denotes intervenor compensation related work charged at 1/3 of regular rate) | | | | | | |
| STAFF | DATE | TASK | HOURS | HOURS | HOURS | HOURS | HOURS | HOURS | HOURS |
| | | | ISSUE A | ISSUE B | ISSUE C | ISSUE D | ISSUE E | ISSUE F | |
| | | | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 0.00 | 5.00 |
| E. Gimon | 05/03/12 | Attend LCR workshop | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.60 |
| E. Gimon | 06/04/12 | Meeting to develop strategy and content of Prepared Direct Testimony | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | | 1.00 |
| E. Gimon | 06/15/12 | Draft Prepared Direct Testimony | 0.10 | | 0.10 | 0.10 | 0.10 | | 0.40 |
| E. Gimon | 06/18/12 | Draft Prepared Direct Testimony | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 0.30 | 1.80 |
| E. Gimon | 07/09/12 | Attend PHC | | | | 0.25 | 0.75 | | 1.00 |
| E. Gimon | 07/11/12 | Meeting with T. Beach of CCC re: PRLM | | | | 0.40 | 1.00 | | 1.40 |
| E. Gimon | 07/13/12 | Draft Reply Testimony | | | | | 0.50 | | 0.50 |
| E. Gimon | 07/18/12 | Draft Reply Testimony | | | | 0.25 | 0.25 | | 0.50 |
| E. Gimon | 07/25/12 | Draft Reply Testimony | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | | 5.00 |
| E. Gimon | 08/07/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | | 5.00 |
| E. Gimon | 08/08/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | | 5.00 |
| E. Gimon | 08/09/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | | 5.00 |
| E. Gimon | 08/10/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | | 5.00 |
| E. Gimon | 08/13/12 | Attend Hearings | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | 1.00 | | 5.00 |
| E. Gimon | 08/14/12 | Attend Hearings | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.80 | 0.80 | | 4.00 |
| E. Gimon | 08/15/12 | Attend Hearings | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | 0.40 | | 2.00 |
| E. Gimon | 08/16/12 | Attend Hearings | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | 0.20 | | 1.00 |

| | | | | | | | | | |
|-------------------|----------|------------------------------------|--------|--------|--------|--------|--------|-------|---------|
| E. Gimon | 08/17/12 | Attend Hearings | | | | | 4.00 | | 4.00 |
| E. Gimon | 09/07/12 | Attend Workshop on All Source RFOs | 9.10 | 9.00 | 9.10 | 10.00 | 15.60 | 0.40 | 53.20 |
| TOTALS | | | 17.11% | 16.92% | 17.11% | 18.80% | 29.32% | 0.75% | 100.00% |
| PERCENTAGE | | | | | | | | | |