
From: Cooke, Michelle 
Sent: 10/18/2013 4:02:41 PM 
To: Doll, Laura (/0=PG&E/OU=CORPORATE/CN=RECIPIENTS/CN=LRDD) 
Cc: 
Bee: 
Subject: RE: Left you a VM 

Send to Fiscal, but let me know that it has been delivered. 

Thanks. 

Michelle 

From: Doll, Laura [mailto:LRDD@pge.com] 
Sent: Friday, October 18, 2013 3:30 PM 
To: Cooke, Michelle 
Subject: Left you a VM 

We have the citation payment of $ 140k and it's due by Monday. 

Will that come to you? What's the best way to make sure this gets in the right hands? 

Thanks - and I hope you're out of the building by now. 

Laura 

Laura Doll 
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