

**Attachment 3**

**Time Recording for Women's Energy Matters Advocates  
R1203014, Submitted March 4, 2014**

ISSUES: A= Issue 6, preferred resources (EE, DR, distrib. Resources, storage) to meet local reliability needs; B= Issue 11, rules governing local reliability procurement; C=Issue 1, is additional capacity required? In LA Basin and Big Creek/Ventura area?

					<u>TOTAL</u>
<b><u>Hours of Barbara George, Advocate, in 2012 by Issue (D.1302015):</u></b>					
<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>A</u>	<u>B</u>	<u>C</u>	
3/30/2012	Crunch Energy Efficiency (EE) info & discuss w. Donna Gilmore	8			8
4/6/2012	Draft and file Comments on OIR	2	0.75	0.25	3
4/12/2012	Review Huntington Beach news	3		1	4
4/13/2012	Review CAISO testimony re: generation	3	1		4
4/14/2012	Sierra Club briefing re: little need for resources; read Huntington Beach materials	7	1		8
4/18/2012	Attend LTPP Pre-Hearing Conf.	0.75	1		1.75
4/19/2012	Review docs re: proposed FERC standards, discuss with MH	0.5			0.5
4/27/2012	Ex Parte communication (e/mail to) Matt Tisdale and Comm. Florio, providing New England ISO manual, info re: ISO-NE 2009 forward capacity auction; FERC press release, and FERC proposed rules for demand resources (incl. EE) which were in part based on ISO-NE protocols (incl. time spent gathering materials)	0.75	0.25		1
5/2/2012	Draft and file ex parte notice including attachments; serve on all parties.	0.5	0.25		0.75
5/14/2012	Prepare for upcoming Straw Proposal Workshop; read and evaluate Staff Straw Proposal	1.5	0.5		2
5/15/2012	Prepare WEM analysis IOU-EE reports for Straw Proposal Workshop	2			2
5/17/2012	Tweak analysis for WEM workshop handout	0.75			0.75
5/17/2012	Attend Straw Proposal Workshop	3	1.25		4.25
5/24/2012	Review Straw Proposal issues	0.8	0.2		1
5/29/2012	Work on Straw Proposal comments; review workshop notes, Straw Proposal & scoping memo	2.5	1		3.5
5/31/2012	Draft and file Comments on Straw Proposal	6	2		8
6/13/2012	Read demand response materials; review role of demand response in procurement	2			2
6/15/2012	Review and revise MH draft data requests	1.25			1.25

6/21/2012	Discuss San Onofre situation and NRC investigation with SoCal activists - for LTPP testimony		2	2
6/22/2012	Crunch notes and find quotes for workshop, discuss with Donna G, Kendra & Ace	6	1	7
6/23/2012	Attend (and videotape) joint CEC/CPUC elec. Inf. Workshop in LA	7	1	8
6/23/2012	Discuss replacement resources with Sierra Energy & SoCal activists	2	1	3
6/24/2012	Review documents with Donna Gilmore; draft WEM testimony	3.5	0.5	4
7/1/2012	Read last section of SCE testimony; prepare notes	1		1
7/2/2012	Discuss with Donna Gilmore WEM response to SCE motion to strike; divvy up work listening to 6-22-12 CEC webex	0.75		0.75
7/3/2012	Work on WEM response to SCE data request	2		2
7/4/2012	Read Investor Own Utility EE applications	7		7
7/7/2012	Continue review of IOU EE applications	7		7
7/20/2012	Study CAISO docs, discuss LTPP with Sierra Club rep.; coordinate to avoid duplication	2	0.5	2.5
7/21/2012	Respond to SCE motion to strike	6		6
7/21/2012	Work on WEM Reply Testimony	2	0.5	2.5
7/24/2012	Prepare for hearings	3.5	0.5	4
7/26/2012	Prepare for hearings	3	0.5	3.5
7/28/2012	Prepare for hearings	3	0.5	3.5
7/29/2012	Read SCE reply	0.25		0.25
7/29/2012	Prepare cross-exam questions for hearings	1	0.25	1.25
8/1/2012	Draft and file WEM response to second SCE motion to strike	4		4
8/4/2012	Review SCE testimony; make notes, prepare questions for hearings	3	1	4
8/5/2012	Prepare for Evidentiary Hearings, read SCE reply, review witness qualifications, review 150 exhibits	7	1	8
8/6/2012	Read replies (start with ISO); prepare questions	4.5	0.5	5
8/7/2012	Attend hearing, research & draft questions in evening	9	1.5	10.5
8/8/2012	Attend hearing, review testimony & draft questions in evening	9	1.5	10.5
8/9/2012	Attend hearing, review testimony & draft questions in evening	9	1.5	10.5
8/10/2012	Attend hearing - cross Cushnie in afternoon	2	2	4
8/11/2012	Review testimony - Cabbell, Silsbee, Hunt. Research, draft questions	2	2	4
8/12/2012	Review testimony - Cabbell, Silsbee, Hunt. Research and draft questions	6	2	8

8/13/2012	Attend Evidentiary Hearing	3	1	4
8/15/2012	Attend Evidentiary Hearing	5	1	6
8/16/2012	Attend hearing - move WEM exhibits into record, ALJ discussion re: schedule	2.5	0.5	3
8/18/2012	Review EH transcripts	4	1	5
8/19/2012	Review EH transcripts	4	1	5
8/20/2012	Review EH transcripts	4	1	5
8/21/2012	Review EH transcripts	4	1	5
8/22/2012	Review EH transcripts	4	1	5
8/24/2012	Discuss issues with Ace.	1	0.5	1.5
8/28/2012	Review data re collapse of coal power; review data re low price of gas/ drilling dropoff; historical prices and possible future spikes; read transcripts (vol. 8 & 9)	2.5		2.5
9/1/2012	Read EH transcripts (vol. 6 & 7); make notes for brief	1.5	0.5	2
9/2/2012	Continue transcript review (vols. 5 & 7; make notes	6	1	7
9/3/2012	Read vol. 6 and 8, make notes	7	1	8
9/5/2012	Read transcripts	5	1	6
9/8/2012	Track 1 - Review brief outline and begin drafting	1		1
9/10/2012	Track 1 - Begin drafting Brief - Section 11 re: preferred resources	5	1.75	6.75
9/12/2012	Review CAISO studies, incremental EE, demand forecast	3.5		3.5
9/13/2012	Find substation addresses/maps (CEC) -- print and study		3.5	3.5
9/18/2012	Work on brief and start to review Cabbell, testimony and dem issues	0.5	1	1.5
9/19/2012	Read vol. 1 EH - Sparks	1.25		1.25
9/20/2012	Finish vol. 1 EH - draft section on ISO numbers, Myers & Behles	1	1	2
9/20/2012	Rx natural gas damages	1	0.5	1.5
9/21/2012	Work on brief; Cushnie's plant ISO stonewall	4.5	1	5.5
9/22/2012	Continued work on Opening Brief	8.5	2	10.5
9/23/2012	Continued work on Opening Brief	8	2	10
9/24/2012	Finish and file Opening Brief	8	1	9
9/29/2012	Read CEJA, make notes for reply brief	3.5	0.5	4
9/30/2012	Read DRA brief	1.5	0.5	2
10/9/2012	Complete and file storage workshop comments	6	1.5	7.5
10/10/2012	Discuss LTPP issues with Donna Gilmore, MBB and Jim			0.5
10/10/2012	Work on Track 1 Brief	6.5	1	7.5
10/12/2012	Continue writing, revising and then file Reply Brief Track 1	7	1	0.5
				8.5

10/13/2012	Read other party Reply Briefs Track 1	1.5	0.5		2
10/26/2012	Discuss San Onofre short and long term replacement resources with Donna Gilmore	1.25		0.5	1.75
10/27/2012	Discuss LTPP issues with Donna Gilmore 1			0.5	1.5
				<b>TOTAL:</b>	345.75

**Hours of Barbara George, Advocate, in 2013 by Issue (D1302015):**

1/12/2013	Track 1 - Read PD and make notes	7	1.5	0.25	8.75
1/13/2013	Track 1 - Read PD, review other filings in Track 1 and make notes; write intro	7	1.25	1	9.25
1/14/2013	Track 1 - Revise PD Comments and file	5	1.25	0.25	6.5
1/22/2013	Track 1 - Draft and file PD Reply Comments	5	1.25	0.25	6.5
				<b>TOTAL:</b>	31

**Hours of Barbara George, Advocate, in 2012 by Issue (D.1212010):**

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>A</u>	<u>B</u>	<u>C</u>	
4/10/2012	Review agenda for workshop	0.25			0.25
4/11/2012	Participate LTPP workshop-scenarios	5.50	1.00		6.50
8/24/2012	Discussion with Ace (time divided between two Decisions); prepare for Friday workshop. Telephone conference Jan Reid - discuss Track 2, work out how to avoid duplication and complement efforts	2.50	0.50		3.00
9/7/2012	Track 2 - attend storage workshop	5.00	1.00		6.00
9/7/2012	Track 2 - Review draft scenarios, draft response to ED Tech questions re: draft scenarios	2.00			2.00
9/8/2012	Track 2 - call Jan Reid - discuss cost issues	0.25			0.25
9/10/2012	Track 2 - Read incremental EE; compare with last years version; read demand forecast for SCE territory	2.25			2.25
10/3/2012	Read 9-20 and 9-25 rulings re Track 2 Standardized Planning Scenarios, and make notes for Comments	2.00			2.00
10/5/2012	Draft and file Scenarios comments	3.50	0.50		4.00
10/7/2012	Read other party filings	2.00			2.00
10/17/2012	Read other parties' Comments - Track 2 (Scenarios)	1.5	0.5		2
10/18/2012	Read other parties' Comments - Track 2 (Scenarios)	1	0.5		1.5
10/19/2012	Draft and file Reply Comment (Track 2 (Scenarios)	6.5	0.5		7
12/8/2012	Read Track 2 Proposed Decision	1	0.5		1.5
12/15/2012	Work on Reply to PD	4	1		5
12/17/2012	Continue writing, revising and then file Comments on Track 2 PD	6	2		8

**TOTAL: 53.25**

**Hours of Barbara George, Advocate, in 2012 on Intervenor Compensation**

5/18/2012	Prepare and file NOI	0.5	0.5
			<b>TOTAL: 0.5</b>

**Hours of Jean Merrigan, Advocate, in 2014 on Intervenor Compensation**

1/30/2014	Review LTPP filings, chronology, issues	3	3
2/1/2014	Work on Track 1 substantial contribution	7	7
2/3/2014	Work on Track 1 substantial contribution	7	7
2/4/2014	Work on Track 1 substantial contribution	5	5
2/11/2014	Work on duplication issue, research Track 2 filings	4	4
2/15/2014	Continue review of issues and draft comp request	5	5
2/16/2014	Draft comp request	6	6
3/1/2014	Draft comp request incl. all of the Excel spreadsheets, time records, etc.	6	6
	Efile Comp Request and serve on everyone	0.5	0.5
			<b>TOTAL: 43.5</b>