

**Consolidated Vote Solar Timesheets for 2012 LTPP Track 4 Intervenor
Compensation Request**

**Timesheets For: Attorneys Ronald Liebert (RL), Vote Solar Policy Director and Expert Witness Jim
Baak (J. Baak) and Paralegal Eric L. Janssen (ELJ)**

ISSUE LIST

Issue A. Whether the utilities should first try to satisfy any additional local capacity resources authorized by the Commission, beyond the 1,000 – 1,200 MWs of gas fired generation authorized in D.13 02 015, with preferred resources and storage before seeking additional gas fired generation resources

Issue B. Whether SCE should be allowed to procure a maximum 1,700 MW from gas fired generation

Issue C. Whether the utilities should be allowed to pursue contingent site preparation or energy park development proposals for the purpose of backstopping LTPP procurement authorizations

Issue D. Whether there is any value in SCE's request for permission to enter into gas fired generation contingency contracts as backup for resources authorized in Tracks 1 and 4

Issue E. Whether proposed transmission solutions can lower local capacity resource need

Issue F. Whether demand response, energy efficiency, solar PV and energy storage resources, and their ability other benefits, such as reactive power support, can reduce local capacity resource needs

Issue G. Whether SCE's proposed Living Pilot would provide valuable data on the ability of preferred resources to meet local capacity resource needs and whether SDG&E should pursue a Living Pilot program as well

Issue H. General and Procedural

Date	Billor	Description	Hours Issue A	Hours Issue B	Hours Issue C	Hours Issue D	Hours Issue E	Hours Issue F	Hours Issue G	Hours Issue H	Hours TOTAL
5/22/2013	J. Baak	Review Revised Scoping Memo								0.5	0.5
7/1/2013	J. Baak	Review of ALJ Ruling regarding Track 4 Motions of LSA and CALWEIA								0.5	0.5
8/1/2013	J. Baak	Prepare for meeting with Energy Division staff on Track 4 issues.	0.5							0.25	0.75
8/1/2013	J. Baak	Meeting with Energy Division staff (Paul Douglass and staff) to discuss Track 4 preferred resources issues.	1								1
8/5/2013	J. Baak	Strategy call with Clean Coalition.	0.75								0.75
8/7/2013	J. Baak	Review CAISO study & opening testimony.	0.7				0.3				1
8/8/2013	J. Baak	Stakeholder coordination call (NRDC, IREC, Earth Justice, CEERT, UCS, Clean Coalition, Sierra Club, TURN, EDF, CEJA, CBE, CEEIC)	0.5				0.3	0.2			1
8/14/2013	RL	Discussion with K. Foley regarding Ron Liebert assuming Vote Solar representation in 2012 LTPP track 4 proceeding and issues for Vote Solar participation in proceeding								0.8	0.8
8/14/2013	RL	Review CAISO study and Track 4 testimony.	0.6				0.3				0.9
8/14/2013	J. Baak	Review CAISO study & opening testimony.	0.5								0.5
8/15/2013	RL	Research CAISO issues for relevant Vote Solar participation in Track 4.	0.5				0.2	0.3			1
8/26/2013	J. Baak	Stakeholder coordination call (NRDC, IREC, Earth Justice, CEERT, UCS, Clean Coalition, Sierra Club, TURN, EDF, CEJA, CBE, CEEIC)								1	1
8/27/2013	J. Baak	Review SCE study & opening testimony.	0.8		0.2		0.2		0.3		1.5
8/28/2013	J. Baak	Review SDG&E study & opening testimony.	1								1
8/29/2013	RL	Review SCE testimony.	1	0.3							1.3
8/29/2013	J. Baak	Strategy call w/ Ron L. Track 4								0.5	0.5
8/29/2013	J. Baak	Stakeholder coordination call (NRDC, IREC, Earth Justice, CEERT, UCS, Clean Coalition, Sierra Club, TURN, EDF, CEJA, CBE, CEEIC)	0.5							0.75	1.25
8/29/2013	RL	Discuss issues and 9/4 PHC strategy and meeting with other intervenors with J. Baak.								0.5	0.5
8/30/2013	J. Baak	Review SDG&E study & opening testimony.	0.5								0.5
9/2/2013	J. Baak	Coordination calls with NRDC and Clean Coalition.	0.75							0.75	1.5
9/3/2013	RL	Review SDG&E and Redondo Beach testimony.	1	0.2	0.1	0.2	0.2	0.1	0.2		2
9/3/2013	RL	Prepare for 9/4/13 meeting with other intervenor parties and 9/4 PHC.								0.7	0.7
9/4/2013	RL	Meeting with DRA, CEERT, Sierra Club, Clean Coalition, Earthjustice, NRDC, CEJA regarding joint positions and strategy for LTPP Track 4 issues and scheduling.	0.5							0.2	0.7
9/4/2013	RL	Prehearing conference on Track 4 issues and further discussions with intervenors regarding response to ALJ questions and schedule discussed at PHC.								2.1	2.1
9/5/2013	RL	Review scoping memo, CAISO and ALJ scheduling proposals to determine Vote Solar response and issues for meeting with intervenors to discuss joint response on 9/6/13.								0.7	0.7
9/6/2013	RL	Conference call with NRDC, CEJA, Earth Justice, Sierra Club, CEERT, TURN, Clean Coalition regarding issues raised by ALJ at 9/5 PHC and potential joint response on 9/10 regarding scheduling and issues for testimony.	0.5				0.3	0.2	0.2		1.2

Date	Billor	Description	Hours Issue A	Hours Issue B	Hours Issue C	Hours Issue D	Hours Issue E	Hours Issue F	Hours Issue G	Hours Issue H	Hours TOTAL
9/9/2013	RL	Participate (webinar) Joint CPUC CEC Workshop on Southern California Electricity Infrastructure and Reliability Issues for LTPP track 4 data and issues	1	0.2			0.4	0.4		0.2	2.2
9/9/2013	RL	Review PHC transcript to prepare comments on scheduling								0.4	0.4
9/9/2013	RL	Review and comment on NRDC draft comments for possible joint filing								0.4	0.4
9/9/2013	RL	Telephone conversation with J. Baak regarding 9/10 comments and Vote Solar issues and joining NRDC comments	0.4							0.2	0.6
9/9/2013	J. Baak	Review SCE study & opening testimony.	0.6	0.2	0.2	0.2					1.2
9/9/2013	J. Baak	Review & edit joint stakeholder comments on Track 4 Proposed Schedule.								1	1
9/9/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing PHC transcript for issues for testimony								0.75	0.75
9/10/2013	RL	Review parties comments on schedule for phase 4.								1	1
9/10/2013	J. Baak	Track 4 strategy discussion with NRDC.								0.25	0.25
9/11/2013	RL	Telephone conversation with J. Baak regarding issues, strategy, discussions with other parties and possibility of joint comments, and whether storage issues are relevant.	0.6			0.3		0.3	0.1		1.3
9/11/2013	J. Baak	Review comments on revised schedule.								0.75	0.75
9/11/2013	J. Baak	Review PG&E Motion to Strike comments.								0.5	0.5
9/11/2013	J. Baak	Stakeholder coordination email exchange regarding joint issues and litigation coordination (NRDC, IREC, Earth Justice, CEERT, UCS, Clean Coalition, Sierra Club, TURN, EDF, CEJA, CBE, CEEIC)								0.75	0.75
9/11/2013	J. Baak	Call w/ Ron L. about issues for Vote Solar and discussions with parties about joint issues	0.5			0.25		0.25	0.25		1.25
9/12/2013	J. Baak	Stakeholder coordination call (NRDC, IREC, Earth Justice, CEERT, UCS, Clean Coalition, Sierra Club, TURN, EDF, CEJA, CBE, CEEIC)	1			0.25		0.25	0.25		1.75
9/13/2013	RL	Review reply comments on schedule.								1	1
9/13/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing Proposed Schedule Reply Comments.								0.5	0.5
9/13/2013	J. Baak	Develop outline of Vote Solar testimony	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25		1.75
9/16/2013	RL	Review ACR on Tracks 4 schedule								0.2	0.2
9/16/2013	RL	Telephone conversation with J. Baak regarding ACR findings, new schedule and issues for testimony.	0.5							0.3	0.8
9/16/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing CAISO/IOU testimony.	1				0.5				1.5
9/16/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing ALJ Ruling on the Revised Schedule.								0.75	0.75
9/16/2013	J. Baak	Call w/ Ron L.	0.5								0.5
9/18/2013	RL	Telephone conversation with J. Baak regarding issues to address, responses to ALJ questions and preparation of testimony.	0.4		0.2	0.2	0.1	0.1			1
9/18/2013	J. Baak	Telephone conversation w/ Ron L.	0.25		0.25	0.25	0.25				1
9/18/2013	J. Baak	Drafting testimony.	0.75	0.5	0.25	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5		3.5
9/18/2013	J. Baak	Coordinating testimony call w/ Clean Coalition.	1								1

Date	Billor	Description	Hours Issue A	Hours Issue B	Hours Issue C	Hours Issue D	Hours Issue E	Hours Issue F	Hours Issue G	Hours Issue H	Hours TOTAL
9/19/2013	J. Baak	Stakeholder coordination call (NRDC, IREC, Earth Justice, CEERT, UCS, Clean Coalition, Sierra Club, TURN, EDF, CEJA, CBE, CEEIC)	1.25								1.25
9/20/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing SCE opening testimony.	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5		3.5
9/23/2013	RL	Review initial draft J. Baak testimony for Vote Solar	0.8								0.8
9/23/2013	J. Baak	Drafting testimony.	0.5	0.25	0.25	0.5	0.5	0.25	0.5		2.75
9/24/2013	RL	Review comments on storage PD for determination of how to respond to ALJ questions 2 and 7 for testimony due 9/30 and research Commission decisions and Vote Solar positions to respond to remaining ALJ questions.	0.5	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.5	0.5	2.5
9/24/2013	J. Baak	Drafting testimony.	0.5	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.5		2.25
9/25/2013	J. Baak	Drafting testimony.	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	2
9/26/2013	RL	Review and propose revisions to J. Baak draft opening testimony.	0.5	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.4	0.4		2.5
9/26/2013	J. Baak	Stakeholder coordination call (NRDC, IREC, Earth Justice, CEERT, UCS, Clean Coalition, Sierra Club, TURN, EDF, CEJA, CBE, CEEIC)								1	1
9/26/2013	J. Baak	Coordination with Large Scale Solar Assn. and Solar Energy Industries Assn. on Track 4 transmission issues	0.5				1			0.25	1.75
9/28/2013	J. Baak	Revising draft testimony.	0.5	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25		2
9/29/2013	J. Baak	Revising draft testimony.	0.75	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.5		2.5
9/30/2013	RL	Review reply comments on Storage OIR PD for applicability to LTPP phase 4 proceeding, per ALJ Gamson questions, and for comments in LTPP testimony.	1						0.3		1.3
9/30/2013	J. Baak	Finish final draft testimony for RL review and submission	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25		1.75
9/30/2013	RL	Final review and citation check of J. Baak testimony.	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2		1.4
9/30/2013	ELJ	Finalize J. Baak testimony and serve to service list.								1	1
9/30/2013	RL	Begin review of other parties' opening testimony/comments.	0.5	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3		2.3
10/1/2013	RL	Review of other parties' opening testimony/comments	0.5	0.2	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.5		2.4
10/1/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing testimony from other parties.	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.25	0.25		3
10/2/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing testimony from other parties.	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25		1.75
10/3/2013	RL	Review and summarize all LTPP testimony and comments.	0.4	0.4	0.4	0.4	0.4	0.4	0.4		2.8
10/3/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing testimony from other parties.	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25		1.75
10/4/2013	RL	Continue review and summary of LTPP testimony and comments.	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3		2.1
10/6/2013	RL	Continue review and summary of LTPP testimony and comments.	1	0.7	0.7	0.7	0.7	0.7	0.7		5.2
10/7/2013	RL	Finish review and summary of LTPP testimony and comments.	0.4	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.4	0.3	0.4		2.4
10/7/2013	J. Baak	Preparing rebuttal testimony.	0.75	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25		2.25
10/8/2013	RL	Review SCE motions to strike testimony and implications for Vote Solar rebuttal testimony.								0.4	0.4
10/8/2013	RL	Telephone discussions with J. Baak regarding reply testimony and comments on ALJ questions, need for and focus of rebuttal testimony; schedule and hearings issues.	0.2	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.2	1
10/8/2013	J. Baak	Call w/ Ron L. about reply testimony and ALJ questions	0.2	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.2	1

Date	Billor	Description	Hours Issue A	Hours Issue B	Hours Issue C	Hours Issue D	Hours Issue E	Hours Issue F	Hours Issue G	Hours Issue H	Hours TOTAL
10/9/2013	RL	Prepare list of issues for possible reply testimony and outline of possible responses.	0.2	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.2	1
10/9/2013	J. Baak	Preparing rebuttal testimony.	0.75								0.75
10/14/2013	RL	Telephone conversation with J. Baak regarding responses to ALJ questions and rebuttal testimony.	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1		0.7
10/14/2013	RL	Begin review of parties' responses to ALJ questions and rebuttal testimony.	0.5	0.3	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.3	0.3		2
10/15/2013	RL	Finish review of all rebuttal testimony and reply comments and begin draft list of issues for possible cross examination at hearings.	0.4	0.3	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.3	0.3		1.9
10/15/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing Rebuttal Testimony.	0.5	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.5		2.25
10/16/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing Rebuttal Testimony.	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25		1.75
10/17/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing Rebuttal Testimony.	0.25	0.25		0.25	0.25		0.5		1.5
10/18/2013	RL	Conference call with ORA, TURN, NRDC, CEERT, EDF, EnerNoc, CEJA regarding LTPP ph4 PHC issues and hearings and coordination for hearings.								0.9	0.9
10/18/2013	RL	Telephone calls with J. Baak regarding PHC issues, date certain, and possible issues for cross of J. Baak	0.2	0.2	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1		0.9
10/18/2013	RL	Continue review of all opening, reply and rebuttal testimony for issues for Vote Solar cross examination of witnesses	0.5	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2		1.7
10/21/2013	RL	Telephone calls with J. Baak regarding issues and witnesses to cross examine.	0.2	0.2		0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2		1.2
10/21/2013	RL	Finish review of all opening, reply and rebuttal testimony for issues and questions for cross examination in preparation for 10/22 PHC and submission of cross exam time estimates.	0.9	0.4		0.4	0.4	0.4	0.4		2.9
10/22/2013	RL	Attend LTPP track 4 PHC.								2	2
10/22/2013	RL	Discuss cross exam issues and coordination of cross examination with other parties at PHC								0.6	0.6
	RL	Telephone calls with J. Baak after PHC regarding PHC issues, drafting revisions to Comparison Exhibit and whether testimony can be modified to remove answers to ALJ questions.								0.6	0.6
10/22/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing SCE Comparison Table and preparing summary.	0.5							0.75	1.25
10/22/2013	J. Baak	Call in and listen to Prehearing Conference.								2	2
10/23/2013	ELJ	Prepare and serve Notice on service list that Vote Solar would not be updating testimony.								0.3	0.3
10/23/2013	RL	Review and revise Vote Solar summary of issues for Comparison Exhibit and send to SCE.	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2		1.4
10/23/2013	RL	Correspondence with SCE regarding amended testimony and with ALJ Gamson and parties regarding issue of serving amended testimony to remove and separately file responses to ALJ comments.								0.7	0.7
10/24/2013	RL	Meeting with J. Baak to discuss cross exam issues and questions for SCE witnesses.	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2		1.4
10/24/2013	J. Baak	Meet w/ Ron L.	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2		1.4
10/25/2013	RL	Review cross exam exhibits and prepare for hearings starting on Oct. 28.	0.4	0.4	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2		1.8
10/25/2013	J. Baak	Preparing for hearings.	0.5	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25		2
10/28/2013	RL	Prepare cross examination questions for SCE witnesses Cushnie and Silsbee.	0.5	0.5				0.3	0.5		1.8

Date	Billor	Description	Hours Issue A	Hours Issue B	Hours Issue C	Hours Issue D	Hours Issue E	Hours Issue F	Hours Issue G	Hours Issue H	Hours TOTAL
10/28/2013	J. Baak	Attending hearing.								2	2
10/30/2013	RL	Review cross exam exhibits and transcripts of LTPP proceedings of 10/28, 10/29 and 10/30 for relevant issues and final preparation for cross examination of SCE witnesses on 10/31.	1.3	0.6	0.2	0.2	0.3	0.5	1		4.1
10/30/2013	J. Baak	Attending hearing.								5.75	5.75
10/31/2013	RL	Attend LTPP hearing for admission of testimony and cross examination of SCE witness Cushnie.	1.7	0.8	0.3	0.3	0.4	0.6	1.2		5.3
11/1/2013	RL	Review 10/31 transcript and cross exam exhibits.								1	1
11/4/2013	RL	Correspondence with J. Baak regarding LTPP briefing schedule and issues.								0.3	0.3
11/4/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing hearing transcripts								0.75	0.75
11/5/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing hearing transcripts.	0.75				0.25	0.5	0.5		2
11/7/2013	RL	Detailed review of hearing transcripts for evidence for LTPP opening briefs.	1.5	0.8	0.3	0.3	0.4	0.6	1		4.9
11/7/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing hearing transcripts.	0.5	0.25						0.5	1.25
11/8/2013	RL	Continued review of hearing transcripts for evidence for LTPP opening briefs.	1.3	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.2	0.8		4.3
11/11/2013	RL	Continued review of hearing transcripts for evidence for LTPP opening briefs.	1.7	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.4	0.3	0.7		4.6
11/12/2013	RL	Continue review of hearing transcripts and testimony for issues and evidence for LTPP opening brief.	2.2	0.8	0.3	0.4	0.4	0.2	0.8		5.1
11/13/2013	RL	Begin draft opening brief	0.8	0.7	0.5	0.7	0.7	0.7	0.7		4.8
11/14/2013	RL	Finish review of transcripts, testimony and comments on ALJ questions for opening brief.	0.8	0.3	0.7	0.7	0.7	0.7	0.7		4.6
11/15/2013	RL	Continue research and draft opening LTPP track 4 brief.	0.6	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5		3.6
11/18/2013	RL	Finish research and continue drafting LTPP opening brief.	1.6	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5		4.6
11/19/2013	RL	Continue drafting LTPP opening brief.	2	0.6	0.6	0.6	0.6	0.6	0.6		5.6
11/19/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing 1st draft of Opening Brief from Ron L.								0.75	0.75
11/20/2013	RL	Begin revising opening brief per discussions with J. Baak.	1.3	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2		2.5
11/21/2013	RL	Continue revising draft opening brief including further research regarding SCE all source procurement proposal.	2	2.5		0.4	0.5	0.5	0.5		6.4
11/22/2013	RL	Finish revised Vote Solar LTPP track 4 opening brief and forward to J. Baak.	1	1.6		0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3		3.8
11/22/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing and commenting on draft Opening Brief.								1.25	1.25
11/23/2013	RL	Finish additional research and revise opening brief pursuant to discussions with J. Baak.	0.6	0.6		0.1	0.2	0.2	0.2		1.9
11/25/2013	J. Baak	Review and comment on final Opening Brief.								0.75	0.75
11/25/2013	RL	Finish opening brief incorporating J. Baak's revisions	1	1		0.3	0.2	0.1	0.3		2.9
11/25/2013	ELJ	Finalize, file and serve opening brief.								2.2	2.2
11/26/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing other parties' Opening Briefs.	0.5	0.25					0.25	0.5	1.5
11/27/2013	RL	Begin review of and summarize relevant issues in LTPP tr. 4 opening briefs.	0.6	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5		3.6
12/2/2013	RL	Continue review of and summarize relevant issues in LTPP tr. 4 opening briefs.	0.8	0.5		0.5	0.5	0.5	0.7		3.5
12/3/2013	RL	Begin outline of and first draft of LTPP tr. 4 reply brief.	0.7	0.8		0.2	0.2	0.5	0.8		3.2
12/3/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing other parties' Opening Briefs.	0.5				0.25			0.25	1

Date	Billor	Description	Hours Issue A	Hours Issue B	Hours Issue C	Hours Issue D	Hours Issue E	Hours Issue F	Hours Issue G	Hours Issue H	Hours TOTAL
12/4/2013	RL	Continue first draft of LTPP tr. 4 reply brief.	0.8	1		0.2	0.2	0.6	0.8		3.6
12/6/2013	RL	Continue draft reply brief.	1	2					0.1		3.1
12/8/2013	RL	Continue draft reply brief.	1	1							2
12/9/2013	RL	Continue draft reply brief.	2	2				0.8	0.8		5.6
12/10/2013	RL	Continue draft reply brief.	2	2.2				0.8	0.8		5.8
12/11/2013	RL	Finish draft reply brief and forward to J. Baak.	2	2				0.7	0.8		5.5
12/13/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing Reply Brief.								0.75	0.75
12/13/2013	RL	Additional research and transcript review and revise reply brief per discussions with J. Baak	1	1				0.5	0.6		3.1
12/15/2013	J. Baak	Review and comment on Reply Brief draft.	0.25	0.25				0.25	0.25		1
12/16/2013	RL	Review revisions from J. Baak, revise and finalize reply brief for filing.	1.1	1.2				0.4	0.7		3.4
12/16/2013	ELJ	Finalize reply brief, file and serve.								1.2	1.2
12/16/2013	RL	Begin review other parties' reply briefs.	0.4	0.2		0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	1.4	2.8
12/16/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing SCE Reply Brief.								0.75	0.75
12/17/2013	RL	Review other parties' reply briefs	0.6	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3		2.4
12/17/2013	J. Baak	Reviewing other parties' Reply Briefs.								2.25	2.25
1/21/2014	J. Baak	Preparing for Ex Parte meeting.	2								2
1/22/2014	J. Baak	Internal meeting and preparation for Ex Parte meeting regarding LTPP track 4 issues	1								1
1/23/2014	RL	Review Ex parte issues requirements and filing issues with J. Baak.	0.4								0.4
1/23/2014	J. Baak	Ex Parte Meeting with Commissioner Florio's advisors (Sepideh Khosrowjah, Marcelo Poirier and Rachel Peterson)	1.25								1.25
1/27/2014	J. Baak	Preparing Ex Parte Meeting Notice.	0.75								0.75
1/28/2014	ELJ	Prepare, file and serve Notice of Ex Parte Communication.	0.8								0.8
1/28/2014	RL	Telephone conversation with J Baak re LTPP status and ex parte filing.	0.4								0.4
1/28/2014	J. Baak	Filing Ex Parte Notice.	0.5								0.5
2/11/2014	RL	Telephone conversation with J. Baak regarding issuance of proposed decision and issues for possible comments.								0.4	0.4
2/11/2014	J. Baak	Reviewing Proposed Decision.								1.5	1.5
2/12/2014	RL	Review ALJ Gamson proposed decision	0.7	0.5	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3		2.7
2/12/2014	J. Baak	Reviewing Proposed Decision.								1.25	1.25
2/13/2014	RL	Finish PD review and begin outline of issues and research needed for comments on the PD.	0.8	0.8		0.2	0.2	0.6	0.8		3.4
2/20/2014	RL	Research track 1 decision, track 4 briefs and CAISO positions to determine basis for track 4 Proposed Decision.	1.3	1			1	1			4.3
2/21/2014	RL	Continue research track 1 decision, track 4 briefs and CAISO positions to determine basis for track 4 Proposed Decision and drafting opening comments on the Proposed Decision.	1.2	1			0.8	0.4			3.4
2/24/2014	RL	Draft opening comments on the Proposed Decision.	1	2.2				0.5	0.5		4.2

<u>Date</u>	<u>Billor</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours Issue A</u>	<u>Hours Issue B</u>	<u>Hours Issue C</u>	<u>Hours Issue D</u>	<u>Hours Issue E</u>	<u>Hours Issue F</u>	<u>Hours Issue G</u>	<u>Hours Issue H</u>	<u>Hours TOTAL</u>
2/26/2014	RL	Continue draft opening comments on the Proposed Decision.	1.5	2.8				0.7	0.7		5.7
2/27/2014	RL	Finish draft opening comments on the Proposed Decision and forward to J. Baak.	2.2	2.8			0.4	0.6	0.9		6.9
2/28/2014	J. Baak	Reviewing and commenting on draft PD comments.	1						0.2	0.5	1.7
2/28/2014	RL	Revise draft opening comments on the Proposed Decision per discussions with J. Baak and draft revisions to and new findings of fact, conclusions of law and ordering paragraphs.	2	2.6			0.3	0.7	0.7		6.3
3/2/2014	RL	Finish all research and evidentiary review for opening comments and forward revised comments to J. Baak.	0.5	0.6			0.5	0.5	0.5		2.6
3/3/2014	J. Baak	Review and comment on final draft PD comments.								0.75	0.75
3/3/2014	RL	Finalize opening comments on ALJ Gamson Proposed Decision.	0.6	0.7			0.6	0.6	0.6		3.1
3/3/2014	ELJ	Finalize, file and serve comments.								1.1	1.1
3/4/2014	RL	Review parties' opening comments on ALJ Gamson Proposed Decision in preparation for Vote Solar Reply comments.	3.3							3.3	6.6
3/4/2014	J. Baak	Reviewing other parties' Opening Comments.	1.5							1.5	3
3/5/2014	RL	Continue review of opening comments on ALJ Gamson PD and research evidentiary record citations in comments.	2.7								2.7
3/5/2014	RL	Begin draft of reply comments.	2								2

Date	Biller	Description	Hours Issue A	Hours Issue B	Hours Issue C	Hours Issue D	Hours Issue E	Hours Issue F	Hours Issue G	Hours Issue H	Hours TOTAL
3/5/2014	J. Baak	Reviewing other parties' Opening Comments.	1.25								1.25
3/6/2014	RL	Continue draft reply comments.	0.8	1.1			0.1	0.6	0.7		3.3
3/7/2014	RL	Finish draft reply comments and forward to J. Baak.	0.7	0.7			0.1	0.5	0.4		2.4
3/7/2014	J. Baak	Reviewing draft Reply Comments.								1.5	1.5
3/10/2014	RL	Final revisions to reply comments in response to J. Baak review	1.3	0.9				0.5	0.8		3.5
3/10/2014	ELJ	Finalize, file and serve reply comments on proposed decision.								1.3	1.3
3/13/2014	RL	Review Final Decision.								1.4	1.4
3/13/2014	J. Baak	Review Final Decision.								2	2
3/17/2014	RL	Begin document collection and review of all Vote Solar filed documents for preparation of intervenor compensation claim.								0.9	0.9
3/21/2014	RL	Review updated intervenor compensation forms and requirements and begin draft of intervenor compensation claim.								2.1	2.1
3/24/2014	RL	Continue draft intervenor compensation claim.								3.3	3.3
3/25/2014	RL	Continue draft of intervenor compensation claim.								2.8	2.8
3/26/2014	RL	Continue draft of intervenor compensation claim.								2.3	2.3
4/2/2014	RL	Continue draft of intervenor compensation claim.								1.8	1.8
4/8/2014	RL	Continue draft of intervenor compensation request and timesheet formatting issues.								1.6	1.6
4/18/2014	RL	Continue work on intervenor compensation request.								0.8	0.8
4/21/2014	RL	Continue work on intervenor compensation request.								2.2	2.2
4/22/2014	RL	Continue work on intervenor compensation request.								1.4	1.4
4/30/2014	RL	Continue drafting intervenor compensation request.								0.8	0.8
5/6/2014	J. Baak	Preparing Timesheets and First Time Representative expert rate request for Intervenor Compensation submission.								4.25	4.25
5/8/2014	RL	Consolidate all timesheets and organize by issue and finalize intervenor compensation request and attachments								3.4	3.4
5/11/2014	J. Baak	Final Review of Intervenor Compensation claim								1.5	1.5
Total			112.2	57.95	16.55	21.3	28.4	33.45	39.7	98.05	407.6
Percentage of Total			27.53%	14.22%	4.06%	5.23%	6.97%	8.21%	9.74%	24.06%	100.00%

Date	Billor	Description	Hours Issue A	Hours Issue B	Hours Issue C	Hours Issue D	Hours Issue E	Hours Issue F	Hours Issue G	Hours Issue H	Hours TOTAL
Costs/Expenses											
Date		Type	Amount								
11/30/2013		Photocopies Transcripts	\$231.20								
12/31/2013		Photocopies	\$24.80								
1/31/2014		Photocopies	\$31.40								
2/28/2014		Postage	\$8.72								
2/28/2014		Photocopies	\$89.40								
3/3/2014		Photocopies	\$72.40								
3/31/2014		Postage	\$11.90								
4/30/2014		Photocopies	\$68.40								
Total			\$538.22								