

**ATTACHMENT 2**  
**Michael Shames Timesheets**  
**R. 12-06-013 – Phase 2**

**Attorney Hours of**  
**Michael Shames**

**Issue Codes**  
**GP** General Preparation, Discovery  
Proposed rate design - non-  
**Tiers** CARE  
**Rev** Incorporate offsets into rev req.

**CASE DESCRIPTION - Rate Design OIR**

Date	Description	Hours	GP	Tiers	Rev.
12/1/2013	Review SDG&E supplemental filing	2.40	2.40		
12/2/2013	Review other IOUs filings	1.00	1.00		
12/6/2013	Attend PHC by phone	0.70	0.70		
	Emails with other parties re: coordination of effort	0.60	0.60		
	Draft and serve first set of data requests upon SDG&E	3.60	3.60		
12/20/2013	Draft protest	2.30	2.30		
	Review SDG&E response to DR1	1.30	1.30		
12/23/2013	Revise protest and oversee filing	2.50	2.50		
12/24/2013	Review protests by other parties	3.50	3.50		
	Review ALJ email	0.20	0.20		
1/6/2014	Review Commissioner Scoping Memo and ED Report	3.30	3.30		
1/7/2014	Draft and file motion for evidentiary hearings	2.80	2.80		
	Prepare for PHC. Review ED report	1.50	1.50		
1/8/2014	Attend PHC by phone	2.50	2.50		
	T/Conf w/ TURN re: PHC procedure	0.30	0.30		
1/20/2014	Review ALJ's ruling re: hearings	0.20	0.20		
1/29/2014	Review SDG&E revised testimony of Fang	3.20	3.20		
2/5/2014	Review SDG&E response to data requests	1.70	1.70		
2/13/2014	Draft testimony	4.00		4.00	
2/14/2014	Draft testimony	5.50		5.50	
2/15/2014	Draft testimony and prepare for 2/28 service	3.30			3.3
3/6/2014	Review other parties' testimony	2.40	2.40		
	Review PG&E and SCE settlements	0.50	0.50		
3/13/2014	Review SDG&E and UCAN rebuttal testimony	2.20	2.20		
3/14/2014	Emails and calls with other parties re: Joint Recommendation	0.50	0.50		
	Prepare cross examination of Fang/Yunker	1.30	1.30		
	Review SDG&E data request	0.30	0.30		
3/17/2014	Review ALJ's ruling re: time estimates	0.20	0.20		
	Prepare cross for Croyle and Yunker re: rate shock	4.40	4.40		
3/18/2014	Complete and send responses to SDG&E DR 1	1.20	1.20		

	Correspondence w/ORA and TURN re: settlement	0.60	0.60		
	Complete cross for SDG&E	1.50	1.50		
3/19/2014	Correspondence w/ORA and TURN re: settlement	0.40	0.40		
3/20/2014	T/Cs and emails w/ SDG&E re: settlement process.	0.50	0.50		
	Review term sheet	0.20	0.20		
3/24/2014	Review settlement PowerPoint	0.30	0.30		
	Attend settlement conference telephonically	0.60	0.60		
	Emails w/ ALJ re: submission of exhibit	0.20	0.20		
	Arrange for service of exhibits to ALJ	0.30	0.30		
3/28/2014	Review and revise Joint Motion.	1.30	1.30		
	Review other parties' proposed changes and comment	0.40	0.40		
4/1/2014	Review SDG&E's evidentiary exhibits	0.30	0.30		
4/3/2014	Review and comment upon proposed opening brief	1.00	1.00		
4/4/2014	Review redline version of brief	0.50	0.50		
<b>TOTAL HOURS</b>		<b>67.50</b>	<b>54.70</b>	<b>9.5</b>	<b>3.3</b>