

Center for Accessible Technology
R.12-06-013: Phase 2 Time
2013 Time for Melissa W. Kasnitz

Date	Project	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Amount
10/25/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Review Ruling re: Phase 2 interim rate applications; coordinate w/ consumers re: responses to same	1.5	\$440	\$ 660.00
10/28/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Email exchange & call w/ E. Gallardo re: response to ruling on Phase 2, meeting w/ Com. Florio's office, setting meetings w/ other commissioners' offices	0.4	\$440	\$ 176.00
10/29/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Call w/ E. Gallardo re: response to Phase 2 ruling; follow up email exchange w/ consumers & w/ Commission offices	0.5	\$440	\$ 220.00
10/30/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Email exchange w/ J. Fitch (Com. Peterman's office) scheduling call on Phase 2 Ruling	0.1	\$440	\$ 44.00
10/31/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Email exchange w/ E. Gallardo re: setting ex parte meetings and status of proceeding as ratesetting, not quasi-legislative	0.2	\$440	\$ 88.00
11/1/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Email exchange w/ advisors, E. Gallardo (GL) re: ex parte meetings on Phase 2 ruling	0.1	\$440	\$ 44.00
11/1/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Call w/ J. Fitch (Com. Peterman's office) re: concerns with scope and schedule for Phase 2; separate call to E. Gallardo re: same	0.3	\$440	\$ 132.00
11/1/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Call w/ E. Gallardo re: ex parte scheduling & strategy on Phase 2	0.2	\$440	\$ 88.00
11/4/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Prepare for ex parte meeting w/ Comm. Florio's office re: scope & schedule for Phase 2	0.3	\$440	\$ 132.00
11/4/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Ex parte meeting w/ office of Comm. Florio re: scope & schedule of Phase 2	0.7	\$440	\$ 308.00
11/4/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Email exchange w/ consumers re: coordinated response to Phase 2 ruling	0.2	\$440	\$ 88.00
11/4/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Review SDG&E request to delay RDW application due to Phase 2 ruling; email exchange w/ E. Gallardo re: same	0.2	\$440	\$ 88.00
11/5/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Email exchange w/ consumers re: interplay between Phase 2 as proposed in ruling and additional rate design applications from IOUs	0.2	\$440	\$ 88.00
11/5/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Attend ex parte meeting w/ Scott Murtishaw (Pres. Peevey's office) at GL offices (w/ E. Gallardo, who left early)	1.3	\$440	\$ 572.00

Center for Accessible Technology
R.12-06-013: Phase 2 Time
2013 Time for Melissa W. Kasnitz

11/5/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Call w/ H. Goodson (TURN) re: coordination in response to Phase 2 Ruling	0.5	\$440	\$	220.00
11/5/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Call w/ E. Gallardo re: request from S. Murtishaw to change from call to in-person meeting	0.1	\$440	\$	44.00
11/6/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Review & edit draft motion to strike portions of Phase 2 ruling (drafted by E. Gallardo)	0.8	\$440	\$	352.00
11/6/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Draft Ex parte notice (Florio's office); email to E. Gallardo re: same	0.4	\$440	\$	176.00
11/6/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Call w/ E. Gallardo re: ex parte notices	0.1	\$440	\$	44.00
11/6/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Draft ex parte notice (Fitch)	0.3	\$440	\$	132.00
11/7/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Review & edit revised draft motion to strike sections of Phase 2 Ruling: call w/ E. Gallardo re: same	0.6	\$440	\$	264.00
11/7/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Draft ex parte notices (Florio's office, Murtishaw)	0.4	\$440	\$	176.00
11/7/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Review & edit draft response to Phase 2 ruling from E. Gallardo; email exchange re: same & CARE discount information	0.8	\$440	\$	352.00
11/7/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Call w/ E. Gallardo re: comments on Phase 2 schedule	0.1	\$440	\$	44.00
11/8/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Call w/ E. Gallardo re: addressing potential changes in CARE design in comments on Phase 2 Ruling	0.2	\$440	\$	88.00
11/8/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Final revisions to Motion to Strike; email exchange w/ E. Gallardo re: same	0.5	\$440	\$	220.00
11/8/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Final revision to Phase 2 comments; email exchange w/ E. Gallardo re: same	0.5	\$440	\$	220.00
11/8/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Follow up re: status of PG&E's average CARE discount compared to AB 327 requirements	0.1	\$440	\$	44.00
11/8/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Review party comments on Phase 2 Ruling	0.6	\$440	\$	264.00

Center for Accessible Technology
R.12-06-013: Phase 2 Time
2013 Time for Melissa W. Kasnitz

11/11/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Email exchange w/ GL re: potential motion to shorten time on motion to strike	0.1	\$440	\$	44.00
11/12/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Review SCE comments& CFC comments on Phase 2 Ruling (served late)	0.2	\$440	\$	88.00
11/20/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Join conference call re: procedural issues for IOU Phase 2 filings	0.2	\$440	\$	88.00
11/22/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Initial brief review of IOU Phase 2 filings	0.5	\$440	\$	220.00
11/25/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Review IOU responses to motion to strike	0.2	\$440	\$	88.00
12/3/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Conf. w. E. Gallardo re: applications & preparation for PHC	0.4	\$440	\$	176.00
12/4/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Close review of supplemental filings in advance of PHC; review SCE new proposals called "addendum" just filed the day before the PHC	1.0	\$440	\$	440.00
12/4/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Email exchange w/ E. Gallardo re: scheduling proposals	0.1	\$440	\$	44.00
12/5/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Prep for PHC; prepare list of evidentiary issues; review proposed CforAT/GL schedule; multiple calls w/ E. Gallardo re: same	3.3	\$440	\$	1,452.00
12/5/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Attend Phase 2 PHC; multiple conversations with parties following PHC including information exchange w/ utilities & coordination w/ consumers	1.2	\$440	\$	528.00
12/9/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Research affordability concerns for low-income California residents	0.6	\$440	\$	264.00
12/9/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Research potential experts re: impact of changes on affordability	0.2	\$440	\$	88.00
12/11/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Review Phase 2 Schedule; email exchange w/ E. Gallardo re: same	0.2	\$440	\$	88.00
12/16/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Close review of PG&E supplemental filing	0.8	\$440	\$	352.00

Center for Accessible Technology
R.12-06-013: Phase 2 Time
2013 Time for Melissa W. Kasnitz

12/18/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Close review of SCE supplemental filing; notes re: same	0.6	\$440	\$	264.00
12/18/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Call w/ E. Gallardo re: preparation of protest	0.3	\$440	\$	132.00
12/20/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	WebEx call w/ SCE re: rate design/calculator	0.6	\$440	\$	264.00
12/20/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Review & edit draft Phase 2 Protest (initial draft by E. Gallardo)	1.5	\$440	\$	660.00
12/23/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Review revised draft protest from E. Gallardo; further revisions to same; calls & emails re: same & finalizing	2.0	\$440	\$	880.00
12/23/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Review party protest	0.6	\$440	\$	264.00
12/30/2013	Residential Rate Design	Phase 2	Review email from ALJ to IOUs re: excluding climate dividend from Phase 2 filings; review PG&E response re: same	0.2	\$440	\$	88.00
Totals:				27.0			\$11,880.00